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AGENDA MEMO 
BUSINESS OF THE CITY COUNCIL  

 CITY OF FULSHEAR, TEXAS 
 

AGENDA OF: April 17, 2018 ITEMS:  A - H 

DATE SUBMITTED: April 13, 2018 DEPARTMENT: Planning and 

Development 
 Sharon Valiante, 

 Public Works Director, 
 John Brown, Interim  David Leyendecker, 

PREPARED BY: Building Official, PRESENTER: City Engineer 
 Brant Gary, 
 Executive Director of 
 Planning and Development 

 

SUBJECT: 

 

Plat Summaries for Planning and Zoning Commission 

 
ATTACHMENTS: 

 

City Engineer’s Engineering Reviews: Preliminary Plats for: Fulbrook 

on Fulshear Creek Section 5, Fulbrook on Fulshear Creek Lift Station 

No. 9, Fulshear Trace – Street Dedication Second Extension, Jade 

Springs Lane – Street Dedication, Creek Cove at Cross Creek Ranch 

Section 15, Creek Cove at Cross Creek Ranch Section 16, , and Final 

Plats for Fulbrook Section 2 “B” and Cross Creek Ranch Water Plant 

No. 3 
 

 
 

 

 

 

   

    

    

    

   

   

   

  

 

 

 

 
 

 

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY

At the April 13, 2018 Planning & Zoning meeting, the Planning Commission had for its consideration the 
plats for:

1. Preliminary Plat for Fulbrook on Fulshear Creek Section 5,

2. Preliminary Plat for Fulbrook on Fulshear Creek Lift Station No. 9,

3. Preliminary Plat for Fulshear Trace – Street Dedication Second Extension,

4. Preliminary Plat for Jade Springs Lane – Street Dedication,

5. Preliminary Plat for Creek Cove at Cross Creek Ranch Section 15,

6. Preliminary Plat for Creek Cove at Cross Creek Ranch Section 16,

7. Final Plat for Fulbrook Section 2 “B”

8. Final Plat for Cross Creek Ranch Water Plant No 3

The  plats,  as  submitted for  consideration, generally  met  the  requirements  set  forth  in  the  City’s 
Subdivision Ordinance No. 04-913 and/or 013-1091, which is in alignment with Chapter 21, Texas Local 
Government Code. Plat comments noted in the City Engineer’s report are provided in support of the rules 
and regulations governing plats and subdivisions of land within the City’s territorial limits and the extra 
territorial jurisdiction to promote safe, orderly, and healthful development of the City.

The Final Plats submitted for consideration did not have any major comments/concerns and were submitted 
for consideration of approval by the Planning Commission on April 13, 2018. 
 

 

 

 



 

 

 

 

The submitting applicants were provided with a copy of the City Engineer reviews.  All items in the 

Preliminary Plat reviews, have either been addressed prior to the April 13 meeting or will be addressed prior 

to final plat submittal. 

 

The Planning and Zoning Commission, as indicated in their report, is providing a positive 

recommendation for approval of all preliminary and final plats submitted for consideration at the 

April 13, 2018 Planning Commission meeting. 

 

  
RECOMMENDATION 

 

Staff recommends City Council approve the following plats: 

1. Preliminary Plats, with the associated conditions as represented in the City Engineer’s report/review 

of plats and the Planning and Zoning Commission report, submitted herein for consideration for: 

Fulbrook on Fulshear Creek Section 5, Fulbrook on Fulshear Creek Lift Station No. 9, 

Fulshear Trace – Street Dedication Second Extension, Jade Springs Lane – Street 

Dedication, Creek Cove at Cross Creek Ranch Section 15, Creek Cove at Cross Creek 

Ranch Section 16,  

2. Final Plats, with the associated conditions as represented in the City Engineer’s report/review of 

plats and the Planning and Zoning Commission report, submitted herein for consideration for 

Fulbrook Section 2 “B” and Cross Creek Ranch Water Plant No. 3; 
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City of Fulshear 

Quarterly Investment Report

Quarter Ending March 31, 2018

Account Type

CASH ACCOUNTS

Wells Fargo General Operating

CASH TOTALS

INVESTMENTS - CD'S

BOA CD - 06051VA48

CAP ONE CD - 14042RFQ9

ZBNA CD -98878BLW6

BEAL CD -07370T5M1

CD'S TOTALS

INVESTMENTS - BONDS

CITY OF AUSTIN - CUSIP 052396UY2

STATE OF TEXAS - CUSIP 8827223B5

BOND'S TOTALS

TX CLASS INVESTMENT POOL

TXClass General Fund

TXClass - Peg Restricted

TX CLASS TOTALS

PORTFOLIO TOTALS

Weighted Average Maturity (days)

51.75

Mar-18

Yield

Beginning

3/1/18

Interest

Earned

Purchases/

Additions

Sales/

Reductions

Ending

3/31/18

Increases

(Decreases)

Quarterly 

Interest Market Value

0.05% $4,660,038.76 $165.15 $1,652,791.17 -$1,917,599.75 $4,395,230.18 -$264,808.58 $385.68 $4,395,230.18

$4,660,038.76 $165.15 $1,652,791.17 -$1,917,599.75 $4,395,230.18 -$264,808.58 $385.68 $4,395,230.18

1.15% $250,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $250,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $250,000.00

1.65% $250,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $250,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $250,000.00

1.25% $250,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $250,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $250,000.00

1.10% $250,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $250,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $250,000.00

$1,000,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,000,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,000,000.00

1.40% $503,704.25 $10,559.25 $0.00 $0.00 $503,704.25 $0.00 $10,559.25 $513,935.00

1.40% $504,810.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $504,810.00 $0.00 $4,765.00 $497,460.00

$1,008,514.25 $10,559.25 $0.00 $0.00 $1,008,514.25 $0.00 $15,324.25 $1,011,395.00

1.13% $8,343,866.49 $12,423.25 $31,070.89 $0.00 $8,387,360.63 $31,070.89 $36,517.47 $8,387,360.63

1.13% $537.47 $0.83 $0.00 $0.00 $538.30 $0.00 $2.10 $538.30

$8,344,403.96 $12,424.08 $31,070.89 $0.00 $8,387,898.93 $31,070.89 $36,519.57 $8,387,898.93

1.41% $15,012,956.97 $23,148.48 $1,683,862.06 -$1,917,599.75 $14,791,643.36 -$233,737.69 $52,229.50 $14,794,524.11

The investment portfolio detailed in this report includes all investment transactions made during the above referenced period. 

The investment portfolio and all related transactions comply with the investment policy of the City of Fulshear, Texas and the 

Public Funds Investment Act of the State of Texas.

Investment Officer:  _______________________________________ Date:  _____________________

                     Wes Vela, Chief Financial Officer

CASH, $2,433,373 , 18%

Texas CLASS Investment Pool, 
$8,931,174 , 67%

CD, $1,000,000 , 7%
Investments-Bonds, $1,008,514 , 8%

Distribution of Investment Funds By Type
18-1 Quarterly Report

CASH Texas CLASS Investment Pool CD Investments-Bonds

F:\BANK & INVESTMENTS\Quartely Investment Reports\FY2018 Quarterly Investment Reports\FY18 Qtrly Inv Report 18-1.xlsx 4/11/2018
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AGENDA MEMO 
BUSINESS OF THE CITY COUNCIL  

 CITY OF FULSHEAR, TEXAS 
 

AGENDA OF: April 17, 2018 Item: L  

DATE SUBMITTED: April 13, 2018 DEPARTMENT: Parks/Capital 
Improvement 

 Sharon Valiante, 
 Public Works Director, 
 Wes Vela  Brant Gary - ACM 
PREPARED BY: Finance Director PRESENTER: Exec Dir. P&D 

 Brant Gary - ACM 
 Executive Director of 
 Planning and Development 
 
SUBJECT: 

 
Consideration of authorizing purchase of a HVAC Replacement 
for the Irene Stern Community Center  

 
ATTACHMENTS: 

 
1. City of Fulshear Scope of Work (Item 2) 
2. Bid Tabulation 
3. East Coast Mechanical Bid 

  Expenditure Required: 
  Amount Budgeted:                                
  Funding Account: 
  Additional Appropriation      
  Required: 
  Funding Account: 

      $28,100 
      $35,000 of the Capital Improvement budget of $135,000 
      200-5-000-5600-03 
       
       
 

 

 
EXECUTIVE SUMMARY 

 
The 200-Reg Park Fund, as adopted by City Council in September of 2017 for the FY 18 plan includes the 
Capital Improvements for park land and park development.  The Irene Stern Community Center is a facility 
located in the Irene Stern Park on Katy Fulshear Road. The facility has been experiencing sever issues with 
the HVAC system.  Staff prepared a scope of work to receive quotes for replacing the HVAC units, a 10-
ton unit and a 12-ton unit.  Three quotes were received; CFI Mechanical for a total project cost of $40,160, 
East Coast Mechanical for a total project cost of $28,100, and Cibolo Creek Designs for a total project cost 
of $34,658.   
After review of the quotes presented, staff determined the lowest responsible bid to be from East Coast 
Mechanical for the replacement of the HVAC units, a 10-ton unit and a 12-ton unit.   
 
 

RECOMMENDATION 
 
Staff recommends City Council authorize the purchase of materials and services from East Coast Mechanical to 
replace the HVAC units at the Irene Stern Community Center in the amount of $28,100. 













AGENDA MEMO 
BUSINESS OF THE CITY COUNCIL 

 CITY OF FULSHEAR, TEXAS 

AGENDA OF: April 17, 2018 

DATE SUBMITTED: April 13, 2018 

Items:  M

DEPARTMENT: Utilities 

Sharon Valiante, 
Public Works Director, 

Sharon Valiante 
PREPARED BY: PRESENTER: Public Works Director 

Brant Gary - ACM
Executive Director of 
Planning and Development 

SUBJECT: Consideration of Approval of the Interlocal Project Agreement for the 
Stabilization of the Road into the Cross Creek Ranch WWTP 

ATTACHMENTS: 1. Interlocal Project Agreement
2. Condition Photo

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY 

 In September 2009, the City of Fulshear and Fort Bend County (County) entered into an Interlocal Project 
Agreement (ILPA)for goods and services  The ILPA allows for specific projects to be performed provided 
there is an Interlocal Project agreement in place.  The project agreement outlines the specific project, and 
the responsibility of the City and the County.  The City purchases and/or reimburses for the materials used 
and the County provides the equipment and labor to perform the task/project. 

In October of 2017, staff realized the road to the Cross Creek Ranch WWTP site was deteriorating rapidly 
in several locations.  The condition of the roadway was making it very difficult for tandem truck/trailers 
to safely maneuver the severe curve near the entrance to the WWTP site.  Staff reached out to County 
staff and coordinated the stabilization project. While the County staff were in the process of preparing the 
ILPA, County Road and Bridge staff brought out a maintainer and installed a crushed concrete base 
material to stabilize the road bed.  Because the project was of a very short duration, the project was 
completed before staff had the opportunity to submit it for City Council consideration 

Therefore, is staff’s recommendation that City Council formally approve the ILPA, as requested by Fort 
Bend County. 

RECOMMENDATION 

Staff recommends City Council approve the Interlocal Project Agreement with Fort Bend 
County and authorize the Mayor to execute the document. 















AGENDA MEMO 
BUSINESS OF THE CITY COUNCIL 

 CITY OF FULSHEAR, TEXAS 

AGENDA OF: April 17, 2018 

DATE SUBMITTED: April 13, 2018 

Items:  N

DEPARTMENT: Public Works/CIP 

Sharon Valiante, 
Public Works Director, 
Wes Vela Sharon Valiante 

PREPARED BY: Finance Director PRESENTER: Public Works Director 
Brant Gary - ACM
Executive Director of 
Planning and Development 

SUBJECT: Consideration of authorizing purchase of Sidewalk 
Rehabilitation Services 

ATTACHMENTS: 1. City of Sugar Land Interlocal Agreement
2. Capital Project Detail Sheet – Pavement Maintenance

Program
3. City of Sugar Land On-Call Sidewalk Rehabilitation

  Expenditure Required: 
  Amount Budgeted:   
  Funding Account: 
  Additional  Appropriation     
  Required: 
  Funding Account: 

      $30,000 
      $30,000 

300-5-000-5830-01
      
      N/A 
      N/A     

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY 

In FY 2017, a Pavement Condition Assessment was performed on all City pavements, including 
sidewalks, to determine the pavement maintenance needs throughout the City.  From the results of the 
assessment, staff determined that there was a minimal amount of sidewalk segments that were in poor 
condition that would qualify for heavy maintenance and/or rehabilitation.  However, since the condition 
assessment, staff received several inquiries regarding sidewalk deterioration and settlement.  The location 
of these sidewalk requests is at 22730 Rainey Ct., 5206 Kenton Place Ln, 5210 Kenton Place Ln, 5214 
Kenton Place Ln, and 27919 Silver Stream Court. Staff anticipates additional requests as the sidewalk 
infrastructure ages.   

The City, thru an Interlocal Agreement with City of Sugar Land, approved by City Council in October of 
2016, with automatic one-year renewals, is able to purchase goods and services that have been completely 
bid.  The city of Sugar Land competitively bid a 2015-2019 On-Call Sidewalk Rehabilitation Services 
project and awarded the bid to Cedros Paving. 



 
The FY 18 CIP Budget, as adopted by City Council in September of 2017, provides for a Pavement 
Maintenance Program budget of $250,000 which includes Sidewalk Repair/Rehabilitation estimated 
at $30,000. 
 
 
 
  
 
 

RECOMMENDATION 
 
Staff recommends City Council authorize the purchase of On-Call Sidewalk Rehabilitation services from Cedros 
Paving in the amount of $30,000. 

















CITY OF SUGAR LAND

2015 - 2019 ON-CALL SIDEWALK REHABILITATION PROJECT
BID FORM

Cf_ tAC"r UAN"frhlES. Contract quantities ire estimated and are for the purpose of
establishing it contract budget and evaluating bid proposals. It is the City' s intent to utilize all
budgeted contact farads, however, the quantity of unit work items will vary dependent on the
Coy's needs. Contract pricing may be adjusted one time at the start of renewal year leased on the
current Houston Consunnn Pace Index ( CPI) 

4.a. BID PRICING FORM

SIDEWALK & TRAILS REHABILITATION AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS ST 1603

I. BASE BID: All hid items must he constructed to city standards. 

Item Description of Item with Unit Bid Price Unit Approx, Unit Total

No. in Written Words Quantity Price Amount

1. Mobilization LS l

2. Removing Concrete sidewalk SF 50,000 D

3. Removing existing sod to required depth SF 1000 C)U DUO

4. 4" concrete sidewalk of various widths

and lengths, Including headers, dowels, 
expansion joints, and placement of 2" 
sand base SF 51, 000 S $ 2 0

5. 5" concrete sidewalk of various widths

and lengths, Including headers, dowels, 
expansion joints, and placement of 2" 
sand base SF to $ 

6. 6" concrete sidewalk of various widths

and lengths, Including headers, dowels, 
expansion joints, and placement of 2" UO
sand base SF 10 $ 5 .S $ 



7. Block Sodding

8. Backfill using topsoil

9. Adjust ManholeNalve

11. Traffic Control

12. ADA Ramp

13. Allowance

This item is for miscellaneous repairs to

private improvements affected by the
project and not specified to be repaired

by the contractor. This line item will be

administered by the city and work

performed by city selected vendor. 

I. TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID: 

ITEMS 1 THRU 13) 

LS 1 $ 5. 000 5 000

5 ( cS i3 2y S U

TOTAL NUMBER OF DAYS TO COMPLETE PROJECT= 300 CALENDAR DAYS

SY I S 4 So

EA 1 $ SD(2 S o

LS 1 $ . 00C) 3. oco

LS 1 $ 7jy 7'- 0

LS 1 $ 5. 000 5 000

5 ( cS i3 2y S U

TOTAL NUMBER OF DAYS TO COMPLETE PROJECT= 300 CALENDAR DAYS
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CONFLICT OF INTEREST QUESTIONNAIRE FORM CIQ
Pot vendor of other person doing business with local governmental entity

IDla au<angnnmss rnrscu cban0aa Lana m ma law cy xe. um. Wm Leg.. naamr asesmn. 
cFECE USE C NEY

The, jesueenatrxle Cel ng fed In ae<eeonexe3h Chapw 176, Lacalf3coernn-xnt
hyac,o •„t vha h.a oF,ue nxlEre.lt:CaVllpaS defined by5ection 176 Ca 41a)',vl''aa local
yo>unntenml dtitytiltl, ta let`. b"ealc requirxn Intl afHer Section 176 P] (a) 

Ey 1NIDUs qLatad, se nvmt be' lled wUltha regwDrs6rLtic;rafirdlAe' ceal5c, e'mmantol
entity Ldt, eter lhonttYlL C, iiml too day afterthe daZe Ihepwwn.^.ecomes aafo a o1 roc's
toW, egvm the Iter ectto Ca Ced. 3eeSW do 176 (LIE, Loca: Gmxrri Lent Cade. 

A pecan camirirvto an offense it Ne person kiii, L,_ y f -'atey Section 176906. Local
cdder" eot Code. An oRenueunderiti s odd d,. e a Claus C d" SExnaanor. 

lame nrpersan whq Fos a business eelationship wl, M1 Iecal gorernmenUl ensi,y

a  

ch. fM this UosA . b are Ling an upeafe to a prenous! y hledqueabonnave. 

ne iav . eVa es u, a. vw r= n : aced awpetee vue5, mn, Yn<, ellh tna ufpvnYr. a, e rn- a aPGoa: y n
11- 1 as : be'[ b : ulnen CSY aXa : Fz aaa Tz o a.. y f ec cuesbnntre bamrnes n.. eple: e r.. 

Name of local governmenloRlcer wl, h wEom fifer M1ss employmem oa business relationship. 

k- 101

a- 1 ab M.. m ] - l" oa s. tpcs A. a. C 3 t}] n be mmpe:ed fcs ez= h oKrer w [ n abon, in. f le, M1as an
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CITY QF SUGAR LAND

CONTRACTOR INFORMATION

Name: 2QY SQtIII( O 1, G0

Address: ` j(j S. ; t CYAIC P -CA

ymstwi, TY - nogg
Principal Contact:': Iesb' li'rs

Tax lDNumber: clu'- IP33l ly

Project Number. ST 1603

Project Name: Sidewalk & Trail Rehabilitation at Various Locations

Certification Regarding Debarment, Suspension, Ineligibility and Voluntary Exclusion

Indicate in the appropriate box which statement applies to the covered potential contractor: 

7 The potential contractor certifies, by submission of this certification, that neither it nor its principals is presently
debarred, suspended, proposed for debarment, declared ineligible, or voluntarily excluded from participation in this
contact by any federal department or agency or by the State of Texas. 

The potential contractor is unable to certify to one or more of the terms in this certification. In this instance, the potential
contractor must attach an explanation for each of the above terms to which he is unable to make certification. Attach the

explanation(s) to this certification

The undersigned certifies that the potential contractor will not knowingly enter into any subcontract with a person who is excluded, 
debarred, suspended, declared ineligible or voluntarily excluded from participation in this covered transaction, unless authorized by
the city of Sugar Land, Texas. The undersigned further certifies that the potential contractor will include this section regarding
exclusion, debarment, suspension, ineligibility and voluntary exclusion without modification in any subcontracts or solicitations for
subcontracts. 

The undersigned swears that he/ she is authorized to legally bind the prospective contractor to the above- described certification and
is Nl ly aware that this certification is made under penalty of perjury under the laws of the State of Texas. 

50PA R u2S alph
Sigtta e/ Authou¢ tfymg Official Typed Name an Title

COOS phVjii serui( 4s LVC oil ols
Prospective Contra t Organization DateSigned

State Contractor License No. ( if any) 
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SCHEDULE AND CHECKLIST

BID CHECKLIST

This list is provided to assist the Bidder. The omission of a required item from this list does not release
the Bidder from the obligation to provide all required information in the Proposal Package. Incomplete

Proposal Packages may be rejected. 

C1I CK OFF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING AS THE REQUIRED ACTION IS COMPLETED: 

7`//FINANCIAL STATEMENTS HAVE BEEN INCLUDED. 

SIMILAR PROJECTS & CURRENT PROJECT SECTION COMPLETED. 

ADDENDA HAVE BEEN ACKNOWLEDGED AND SIGNED. 

1BID/ PROPOSAL PRICES COMPLETED. 

V IQ ( CONFLICT OF INTEREST) FORM COMPLETED. 
CERTIFICATION REGARDING DEBARMENT SIGNED

V/ THE RESPONSE HAS BEEN SIGNED AND DATED. 

11PRICING FORM WITH ALL EXTENSIONS COMPLETED. 

BID BOND ENCLOSED

INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS AGREED TO. 

CONTRACT TERMS AND CONDITIONS ACCEPTANCE AND ACKNOWLEDGEMENT
THE CORRECT NUMBER OF COPIES ENCLOSED. 

THETHE MAILING ENVELOPE/ PACKAGE HAS BEEN ADDRESSED TO: 

i

SCHEDULE of KEY EVENTS

ACTIVITY DATES & TIME

2700 TOWN CENTER BLVD. NORTH

ertised in local a er September 23, 2015 and September 30, 2015J2Notice Posted to ublic urchase.com Se tember 23, 2015

s[ ions DeadlineOctober 1, 2015 at 3: 00 PM

stions Answered and Addendum osted October 2, 2015 at 3: 00 PM

Due October S, 2015 at 11: 00 AM

BID CHECKLIST

This list is provided to assist the Bidder. The omission of a required item from this list does not release
the Bidder from the obligation to provide all required information in the Proposal Package. Incomplete

Proposal Packages may be rejected. 

C1I CK OFF EACH OF THE FOLLOWING AS THE REQUIRED ACTION IS COMPLETED: 

7`// FINANCIAL STATEMENTS HAVE BEEN INCLUDED. 

SIMILAR PROJECTS & CURRENT PROJECT SECTION COMPLETED. 

ADDENDA HAVE BEEN ACKNOWLEDGED AND SIGNED. 

1BID/ PROPOSAL PRICES COMPLETED. 

V IQ ( CONFLICT OF INTEREST) FORM COMPLETED. 
CERTIFICATION REGARDING DEBARMENT SIGNED

V/ THE RESPONSE HAS BEEN SIGNED AND DATED. 

11PRICING FORM WITH ALL EXTENSIONS COMPLETED. 

BID BOND ENCLOSED

INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS AGREED TO. 

CONTRACT TERMS AND CONDITIONS ACCEPTANCE AND ACKNOWLEDGEMENT
THE CORRECT NUMBER OF COPIES ENCLOSED. 

THETHE MAILING ENVELOPE/ PACKAGE HAS BEEN ADDRESSED TO: 

i THE CITY OF SUGAR LAND
CITY SECRETARY OFFICE, 1" FLOOR, ROOM 122

2700 TOWN CENTER BLVD. NORTH

r SU/GAR LAND, TEXAS 77479

J THE MAILING ENVELOPETACKAGE HAS BEEN SEALED AND MARKED WITH: 
9 

COMPANY NAME, ADDRESS, PROSECT/ BID NUMBER, TITLE, AND DUE DATE. 

i

7 

1

16
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ACUBU
CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE OATE9(

0920IMMIo0/
vYYYI

0

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED ASA MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND ALTERER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE GOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURERIS), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER, 

IMPORTANT: If the certiflC en holds, Is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the pOUSDI O must he endorsed, If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to
the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on this certificate does not confer rights to the
coniflcate holder in lieu of such enUomemengs). 

PRoouoER
T ARCSIy Hurlano

AIDE mmm... ly l USDe nceHONENAME. iAIC, Na 281- 741- 8760 FAX 8324] 0- 9256jO, Eel. No
11805 Wllcresl Or SIe 230 EMAIL araCSEy@, H1COmInUD11 ...... 000IIADDRESS'. 

INSURERISI AFFORDING COVERAGE NAICI
IGUSIun

TX 77031- 1906 INSURER A: GMAC HOMESTATE COUNTY MUTUAL
MsuRE° 

INSURER e: ESSEX INSURANCE COMPANY
CEI) ROS PAVING SE RVICFS. 110. INSURED FVANSTON INSURANCE COMPANY
SAN FOS REVES TEXASINSURER D. MUTUAL

11210 S POST OAK RD ESSFX INSURANCEINSURER E= COMPANY
HOUSTON TX 17035

INSURER F'. 

COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: REVISION NUMBER

1 HIS IS TO CERTIFY THAI THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PFRI00
INDICARFE) NOTUMPHSIANDING ANY REQUIREMENT. TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONITVACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH REBPECT TO WHICH THISTHIS
CERTIFICATE MAY RF ISSUED OR MAY FERrAIN. THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE
E %( y, USIONS AND CONDITION OF SUCH POLICIES. EMITS SFIOWN MAY IIAVF SEEN

ftEDIIRMS
CED BY PAID OLAIMS. 

LIF TYPE
NSR

OF INSURANCE ADULVDIMCOPOL CY NVMBER

IMMLIoV
VVY POLICY 11VY%e LIMBS

CO MM FURCL GENERAL BAN RV
Oi( N: CVRRENf.E 5 106646069

oLVA15- MAlll X pfGln D NAFEFE RENTED
EILIMPIN Ea oaunenml 5

a L V FxP ( I' ll one 5 5. 000. 00
B Y Y SERI 09/ 08/ 2015 09/ 0812016 Nc+ Y) Iu1LSN] VIIWURV S 1000,000. 00

64 N 11OH11 OYIF LIMIT 411LIL s Pt R
CENT NA. AGURLGAL S 2. 060, 000. DO

Ell iecl Tac PHOOVITs. GOMPIOP AGE S 2,000. 060. 00

AulomoaaEUaelury1IaD LL LIMB S 1, 060. 000, 6011

1IN
All 1., 11 JOLLY INJURY - w pe and 5

A / 1 T/ ti _ Irn
Y y 2002801012 031072016 03/ 072016 iJ ii a UR P rxc- o no 5V 06

Liwrveo
x) x) JI VIOF

NDN 6. 1n
Fly 11UNA1E

AU¢ II 5
vinV

ONSEDI LA LIAR
EvRENCE 4. 666600.00

5

C Exessa UAB IE" BlMaGE Y V PENDING 69/ 69/ 2615 01 wcSELAH E

OFI III IINTIONI
S

WORKERS COMPENSATION PER ORI - 
AND EMPLOYERS ' LIAUIL17Y

YIN
SIATUIE ER

0 ANY .. e I- iLlEllIll 0I TY, urry I1 1 NIA Y 0001235931 0211112015 01 E 1 AT' 1 AImD4 NI S 1, 000, 600. 06

sLA11 - 11 T Ylt IIIcL S 1. 060. 006. 06
Iyy m
U6iti ON O4'IPPSI -oDCV MT 51, 000, 600. 00

L: INLAND MARINE

BESCRIPTION OF OFERA71ONS I LLOCATIONS I VENICLEs 1 ACOKo 1. 1, AaNIona .— H. aCl PeYlo, no 1, Ka Po eNui it mspan mY IA mPWU

1993 MACK VIN I M 1 AA14YAPW027390 2006 TRAO495DE202861085515
2003 MACK VIN i M1 AA1 BY83WI 51767 2008 TOY 51 FOV58128XO66209
2008 FORD VI N I FTM32R 1 HER 11189 2011 GODS t GOT 6302XR 8033637
2008 JEEP VIN IJ4GA391081031778 2911 DODO lD7R ICT1RS587D13

CERTIFICATE HOLDER ALSO LISTED AS AN ADDITIONAL INSURLD AND WAIVER OF SUBROGATION

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS. 

CITY OF SUGARLAND

PO BOX 110
THORGEo N¢ PRESENTAHVE

SUGARL AND, TX 77478
I EO RODRIGUEZ

KJ 1988- 2014 ACCORD CORPORATION, All rights reserved. 



ERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE TISSUE DATE 7/ 30/ 2015

HIS CERIIFICATE IS ISSUED ASA MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
ERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
FLOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURE_R( S), AUTHORIZED
EPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. 

4PORTANT'. IF THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER IS AN ADDITIONAL INSURED, THE POLICYTES) MUST BE ENDORSED. IF SUBROGATION IS

AIVED. SUBJECT - 0 THE TERMS AND CONDI IIONS OF THE POLICY, CERTAIN POLICIES MAY REQUIRE AN ENDORSEMEN' A

TATEMENT ON THIS CERTIFICATE DOES NOT CONFER RIGHTS TO THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER IN LIEU OF SUCH ENDORSEMENT( S). 

RODUCER INSURER( S) AFFORDING COVERAGE

Alrom__.._ 11806 munity Insurance Group, LLCne0s wilcrost Dr INSURER A: N/ A

Ste 230 _...._... Hoasron, TX 77031 ( INSURER B'. N/ A

VSURED INSURER C_ N/ A
Centers Paving Service, LLC __. _ .... 

Houston TX t a35
o n Past Oak Road, ste A

HouINSURER D Essex Insurance CompanyH

INSURER E. N/ A

OVERAGES .. 

HIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE

OLICY PERIOD INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT. TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACTOR OTHER DOCUMENT

1' IH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS CERT IFICAT E MAYBE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
I' SCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS. EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE

PER REDUCED BY PAID CIAIMS. 

SR-' IVI>E Of ( 

NUMBER EFFFC71VE DATE EXPIRATION DATE( 

POLICY POLICY I POLICY
OMITS

AS

INSURANCE

General Aggregate

A General I old, lay

B Personal LiaUlllly

C Bxcess Liability

I  

D Inland Manne 41M26998 6/ 2612915

ii
E Property

Description of Operations / Specialty Items
Inland Marine - Scheduled Equipmour

Persom rI & Adv. Injury

Each Occurrence

Damage Prem Rented To You

Med Expense ( Any one person) 
Combined Single Limit

Medical Payments To Others

Each Occurrence

Scheduled Equipment I $ 99, 

5/ 26/ 2016 - - - - 

I

Bidding

Contents

I Loss 0l Use

Certificate Holder Should any of the above described policies be cancelled before the expiration date) 

For Ioodurr don Purposes Only
thereof, notice will be delivered in accordance with the policy provisions.- _ 

Authorized Signature



AGENDA MEMO 
BUSINESS OF THE CITY COUNCIL 

 CITY OF FULSHEAR, TEXAS 

AGENDA OF: April 17, 2018 Items: 

DATE SUBMITTED: April 13, 2018 DEPARTMENT: Public Works/Vehicle 
Replacement 

Sharon Valiante, 
Public Works Director, 
Wes Vela Sharon Valiante 

PREPARED BY: Finance Director PRESENTER: Public Works Director 
Brant Gary - ACM
Executive Director of 
Planning and Development 

SUBJECT: Consideration of authorizing purchase of a Ford F250 4WD for 
Public Works  

ATTACHMENTS: 1. ILA Fort Bend County
2. Vehicle Replacement Schedule
3. FBC Bid 17-021 Purhase of Vehicles
4. Helfman Ford Quote

  Expenditure Required: 
  Amount Budgeted:   
  Funding Account: 
  Additional  Appropriation     
  Required: 
  Funding Account: 

      $28,524 
      $25,000 (Vehicle Replacement Schedule) 

150-5-510-5600-02
      
      $3,524 

150-5-510-5600-02

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY 

The Vehicle/Equipment Replacement Fund provides for the accounting of fees allocate from various 
departments for the usage of vehicles and particular equipment.  The City vehicles/equipment are 
scheduled over their useful life an updated for price changes over time.  As units are schedule for 
replacement, they are purchased and the cycle continues.   

As recommended by the Vehicle Replacement Schedule, the Public Works Department has a F250 4WD 
vehicle that is scheduled for replacement in FY 18.  The budgeted amount for this vehicle was estimated 
at $25,000.  Staff utilized a Fort Bend County competitvely bid contract to seek pricing for this vehicle. 
Helfman Ford, a Houston area vendor, has the lowest responsible price, $28524, for the vehicle needed 
to replace the current vehicle on the schedule. This competitive bid can be used through the current 
Interlocal Agreement with Fort Bend County for the purchase of goods and services. 

The Vehicle/Equipment Replacement Fund as adopted by City Council in September 2017 for the FY 18 
budget has sufficient funds to allow for the purchase of the recommended vehicle. 

O



 
 
 

RECOMMENDATION 
 
Staff recommends City Council authorize the purchase of the F250 4WD vehicle from Helfman Ford for $28,524. 













City of Fulshear
Vehicle/Equipment Replacement Fund Schedule

FY 2018 Budget
City of Fulshear, Texas
Vehicle & Equipment Replacement Schedule

2018

Vin/Ser Number Dept. Type Property Description Date in Service
Fiscal Yr In 

Service Cost
Replacement Cost 

incl. equipment Useful Life
Replace-

ment Year  FY2018  FY2019  FY2020  FY2021  FY2022  Future Replace-ment Annual Fee
54153 BS Vehicle 2013 Ford F-150 (Builder Services) 4/23/14 2014 19,888.00      25,000.00                 8 4 25,000         3,125.00              
51549 BS Vehicle 2015 FORD F150 SUPER (BUILDER SERVICES) 9/25/15 2015 20,676.00      25,000.00                 8 5 25,000         3,125.00              
51531 BS Vehicle 2015 FORD F150 SUPER (BUILDER SERVICES) 9/25/15 2015 21,076.00      25,000.00                 8 5 25,000         3,125.00              
99070 BS Vehicle 2015 FORD F150 CREW (BUILDER SERVICES) 9/25/15 2015 23,293.00      28,000.00                 8 5 28,000         3,500.00              

205345 City Manager Vehicle 2013 Ford Fusion 1/07/13 2013 15,830.00      18,000.00                 8 3 18,000          2,250.00              
520782 PD Equipment 2016 POLARIS WITH TRAILER 9/30/15 2015 17,391.00      18,000.00                 10 7 18,000                         1,800.00              
240209 PD Vehicle 2012 Dodge Charger 10/13/12 2013 24,265.00      36,000.00                 4 -1 36,000       9,000.00              
213624 PD Vehicle 2013 Chevy Tahoe 10/01/13 2013 26,776.00      36,000.00                 4 -1 36,000         9,000.00              
643362 PD Vehicle 2013 DODGE CHARGER 9/30/13 2013 24,890.00      36,000.00                 4 -1 36,000       9,000.00              

97175 CE Vehicle 2014 FORD F150 PICKUP (BUILDER SERVICES) 11/25/14 2015 26,986.00      25,000.00                 8 5 25,000                         3,125.00              
531924 PD Vehicle 2015 CHEVY TAHOE 10/03/14 2015 30,096.00      36,000.00                 4 1 36,000         9,000.00              
535049 PD Vehicle 2015 CHEVY TAHOE 10/03/14 2015 30,096.00      36,000.00                 4 1 36,000         9,000.00              
672868 PD Vehicle 2015 CHEVY TAHOE 7/22/15 2015 32,036.00      36,000.00                 4 1 36,000         9,000.00              
543733 PD Vehicle 2015 CHEVY TAHOE 7/28/15 2015 32,686.00      36,000.00                 4 1 36,000         9,000.00              

73728 PD Vehicle 2016 FORD SUV 9/14/15 2015 27,917.00      36,000.00                 4 1 36,000         9,000.00              
55506 PD Vehicle 2017 FORD Explorer 12/19/16 2017 29,113.00      36,000.00                 4 3 36,000         9,000.00              
55507 PD Vehicle 2017 FORD Explorer 12/19/16 2017 29,113.00      36,000.00                 4 3 36,000         9,000.00              
55505 PD Vehicle 2017 FORD Explorer 12/19/16 2017 29,113.00      36,000.00                 4 3 36,000         9,000.00              
8TA06 PW Equipment RHINO BOOM SCHREDDER                         4/09/08 2008 16,980.00      20,000.00                 10 0 20,000         2,000.00              
00414 PW Equipment JOHN DEERE 5055E TRACTOR 6/08/09 2009 21,207.91      25,000.00                 8 -1 25,000         3,125.00              
60245 PW Equipment JOHN DEERE 5095M TRACTOR 5/27/10 2010 44,175.00      50,000.00                 10 2 50,000          5,000.00              
13041 PW Equipment GENERATOR - CITY HALL 8/25/12 2012 34,598.00      40,000.00                 15 9 40,000                         2,666.67              

K0300187 PW Equipment 2014 Scag Cheetah Zero Turn Mower 8/01/14 2014 9,999.00        12,000.00                 8 4 12,000         1,500.00              
51289 PW Equipment NEW HOLLAND TRACTOR 9/28/15 2015 53,446.00      60,000.00                 10 7 60,000                         6,000.00              
00250 PW Equipment 2015 ZERO TURN SCAG MOWER 9/30/15 2015 9,920.00        12,000.00                 8 5 12,000                         1,500.00              
12623 PW Equipment 2015 RHINO DITCH MOWER 9/30/15 2015 13,002.00      14,000.00                 8 5 14,000                         1,750.00              
57534 PW Vehicle TRUCK   -Ford F250                                     12/31/07 2008 21,250.00      25,000.00                 8 -2 25,000       3,125.00              
5E546 PW Vehicle TRACTORS UNDER CAPITAL LEASE                 11/28/07 2008 83,090.00      85,000.00                 10 0 85,000         8,500.00              
83859 PW Vehicle 2008 FORD F150 (83859)                       7/14/08 2008 17,110.00      25,000.00                 8 -2 25,000       3,125.00              
97175 PW Vehicle 2013 Ford F-150 (Builder Services) 1/07/13 2013 15,638.00      25,000.00                 8 3 25,000         3,125.00              
06597 PW Vehicle 2014 Ford F-150 (Maintenance) 5/05/14 2014 19,486.00      25,000.00                 8 4 25,000         3,125.00              
42572 PW Vehicle 2015 FORD F250 DUAL CAB 9/28/15 2015 28,585.00      28,000.00                 8 5 28,000                         3,500.00              

Grand Total of Governmental Assets 849,727.91    1,006,000.00            122,000    346,000      68,000          158,000      115,000      197,000                       167,091.67          
Beginning Bal 134,000    179,092      183               99,275         108,367      160,458                       

Annual Fees 167,092    167,092      167,092       167,092      167,092      167,092                       
Ending Balance 179,092    183              99,275          108,367      160,458      130,550                       

PW 48,042       50,000         
Retired BS 12,875       

PD Vehicle 2008 CHEVY TAHOE POLICE                      8/28/08 2008 29,700.63 PD 100,800    72,000         
214069 PD Vehicle 2013 Chevy Tahoe 11/01/12 2013 25,036.00 CE 3,125         
353677 PD Vehicle 2013 Chevy Tahoe 10/01/13 2013 26,776.00 CM 2,250         

Total 167,092    122,000      -                



Description Caldwell 

Country 

Chevrolet    

Caldwell

Caldwell 

Country Ford    

Caldwell

Classic 

Chevrolet 

Sugar Land

Grapevine 

DCJ                         

Grapevine

Helfman 

Dodge                      

Houston

Helfman Ford             

Stafford

Form 1295 Yes Yes Yes N/A Yes Yes

Vehicle 1: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe with spotlight, without console and dual batteries $30,990.00 No Bid $32,999.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 2: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe with spotlight, console and dual batteries $31,445.00 No Bid $33,219.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 3: Truck, 1/2 ton, Ext Cab,  SWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power (windows, 

locks), TTP

$21,998.00 $25,050.00 $23,959.00 Disqualiied:  

Does not meet 

minimum 

specifications

No Bid $21,929.00 

Vehicle 4: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, Crew Cab, SWB, with Hard Cover, Cloth Bucket, 

No Console,  Power (windows, locks, mirrors), TTP

$26,588.00 $32,216.00 $27,449.00 Disqualiied:  

Does not meet 

minimum 

specifications

No Bid $25,220.00 

Vehicle 5: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Bucket,  Power 

(windows, locks, mirrors),  TTP

$24,985.00 $26,569.00 $30,665.00 Disqualiied:  

Does not meet 

minimum 

specifications

No Bid $24,120.00 

Vehicle 6: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Bucket, No Console, 

Power (windows, locks, mirrors),  TTP

$24,975.00 $31,316.00 $26,355.00 Disqualiied:  

Does not meet 

minimum 

specifications

No Bid $24,120.00 

Vehicle 7: Truck, 1/2 ton, Reg Cab,  LWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power (windows, 

locks), TTP

$21,810.00 $24,239.00 $22,836.00 Disqualiied:  

Does not meet 

minimum 

specifications

No Bid $21,039.00 

Tabulation

Purchase of Vehicles

Bid 18-022

Awarded 10/24/2017:  Low Bidder Per Vehicle



Description Caldwell 

Country 

Chevrolet    

Caldwell

Caldwell 

Country Ford    

Caldwell

Classic 

Chevrolet 

Sugar Land

Grapevine 

DCJ                         

Grapevine

Helfman 

Dodge                      

Houston

Helfman Ford             

Stafford

Vehicle 8: Truck, 3/4 ton, Ext Cab, SWB, Cloth Split Bench, Power (windows, 

locks, mirrors), TTP

No Bid $26,196.00 $26,540.00 $26,505.00 No Bid $24,367.00 

Vehicle 9: Truck, 3/4 ton, Reg Cab, LWB, 4-Wheel Drive, Vinyl Split Bench, 

Power (windows, locks), Locking Rear Differential, Front Tow Hooks, Limited Slip, 

TTP, 8.42" min Ground Clearance

$27,310.00 $26,847.00 $27,816.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 10: Truck, 3/4 ton, Reg Cab, LWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power (windows, 

locks), Trailer Towing Mirrors, Locking Rear Differential, Front Tow Hooks, 

Limited Slip, Integrated Trailer Brake System, TTP, 8.8" min Ground Clearance

$25,490.00 Disqualiied:  

Does not meet 

minimum 

specifications

$26,727.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 11: Truck, 3/4 ton, Reg Cab, LWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power (windows, 

locks), Locking Rear Differential, Front Tow Hooks, Limited Slip, TTP, 8.8" min 

Ground Clearance

$24,990.00 Disqualiied:  

Does not meet 

minimum 

specifications

$26,177.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 12: Truck, 3/4 ton, Ext Cab, LWB, Vinyl Bench, Power (windows, locks), 

Locking Rear Differential, Front Tow Hooks, Limited Slip, TTP, 8.42" min Ground 

Clearance

$24,976.00 $26,619.00 $26,717.00 No Bid No Bid $24,788.00 

Vehicle 13: Truck, 3/4 ton, Ext Cab, LWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power (windows, 

locks), Locking Rear Differential, Front Tow Hooks, TTP, 8.78" min Ground 

Clearance

$25,275.00 $26,619.00 $26,717.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 14: Truck, 3/4 ton, Ext Cab, LWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power (windows, 

locks), Trailer Towing Mirrors, Locking Rear Differential, Front Tow Hooks, 

Limited Slip, Integrated Trailer Brake System,  TTP, 9.6" min Ground Clearance

$26,335.00 $26,849.00 $27,267.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 15: Truck, 3/4 ton, Ext Cab, LWB, 4-Wheel Drive, Cloth Bucket, No 

Console, Power (windows, locks), Towing Mirrors, Integrated Brake System, TTP

No Bid $29,064.00 $29,356.00 Disqualiied:  

Does not meet 

minimum 

specifications

No Bid $28,590.00 

Vehicle 16: Ambulance Cab and Chassis, Reg Cab, Power (windows, locks) No Bid No Bid No Bid $34,958.00 $34,199.00 No Bid



Description Caldwell 

Country 

Chevrolet    

Caldwell

Caldwell 

Country Ford    

Caldwell

Classic 

Chevrolet 

Sugar Land

Grapevine 

DCJ                         

Grapevine

Helfman 

Dodge                      

Houston

Helfman Ford             

Stafford

Vehicle 17: Special Service Truck, 1/2 Ton, Crew Cab, 4WD,  Cloth, Power 

(windows, locks, mirrors), TTP

$27,984.00 $29,458.00 $28,989.00 Disqualiied:  

Does not meet 

minimum 

specifications

No Bid $27,925.00

Vehicle 18: Van, Cargo, 3/4 Ton, Extended Length, Panel Type, Rear AC, Vinyl, 

Power (windows, locks), TTP

$26,425.00 No Bid $26,528.00                          

within 3% from 

a local vendor

pursuant to 

§271.905

No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 19: Van, Cargo, 1 Ton, Extended Length, Panel Type, Rear AC, Vinyl, 

Power (windows, locks), TTP

$28,125.00 No Bid $28,239.00             

within 3% from 

a local vendor

pursuant to 

§271.905

No Bid No Bid No Bid
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