ORDINANCE NO. 02-879
AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF FULSHEAR, PROVIDING FOR THE
HOLDING OF A GENERAL ELECTION ON MAY 4, 2002, FOR THE
PURPOSE OF ELECTING A MAYOR AND TWO (2) ALDERMEN; AND

PROVIDING DETAILS RELATING TO THE HOLDING OF SUCH
ELECTION.

#* * * * %

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF FULSHEAR,
TEXAS:

Section 1. In accordance with the general laws and Constitution of the State
of Texas, a General Municipal Election is hereby called and ordered for the first
Saturday in May 2002, the same being the g8 day of said month, at which election all
qualified voters of the City may vote for the purpose of electing a Mayor and two (2)
Aldermen.

Section 2. No person's name shall be placed upon the official ballot as a
candidate for Alderman and/or Mayor unless such person shall have filed his or her
sworn application, as provided by Section 141.031 of the TEXAS ELECTION CODE,
with the City Secretary of the City at the City Offices, located at 30603 F.M. 1093,
Fulshear, Texas77441, not later than five o'clock (5:00) p.m. on the forty-fifth (45“1) day
before the date of such election. The City Secretary shall note of the face of each such

application the date and time of its filing.

Section 3. The present boundaries of the City constituting one election
precinct, the polls shall be open for voting from seven o'clock (7:00) a.m. until seven
o'clock (7:00) p.m. at the following polling place, and the following are hereby appointed

officers to conduct the election at said polling place:



POLLING PLACE
City Hall
City of Fulshear
30603 F.M. 1093

Fulshear, Texas 77441

ELECTION OFFICERS
Sandra DeVore Presiding Judge

Mike Kirschmann  Alternate Presiding Judge

The City Secretary is hereby authorized and directed to provide a copy of this
Ordinance to each judge as written notice of the appointment, as required by Section

32.009 of the TEXAS ELECTION CODE.

The Presiding Judge shall appoint no more than one (1) clerk to assist in the

holding of said election. Said election officers shall also serve as the early voting ballot

board for such election; and the Presiding Judge of the election precinct shall also serve

as the presiding officer of such board. The hourly rate of pay shall be $6.00 and each

election officer shall not exceed fourteen (14) hours.

Section 4. Mrs. Kathryn Mayfield, City Secretary, is hereby appointed clerk

for early voting; the appointment of a deputy clerk or clerks for such voting by the City

Secretary shall be in accordance with Sections 83.031 et seq. Of the TEXAS ELECTION

CODE.

The City Hall



City of Fulshear
30603 F.M. 1093

Fulshear, Texas 77441

is hereby designated as the place for early voting for said election. Said clerks shall keep
said office open for at least eight (8) hours, that is, from nine o'clock (9:00) a.m. until five
o'clock (5:00) p.m., on each day for early voting which is not a Saturday, a Sunday, or an
official state holiday, beginning on the seventeenth (17th) day and continuing through the
fourth (4™) day preceding the date of said election. Said clerks shall not permit anyone to
vote early by personal appearance on any day which is not a regular working day for the
clerk's office, and under no circumstances shall they permit anyone to vote by personal
appearance at any time when such office is not open to the public. The above-described
place for early voting is also the clerk's mailing address to which ballot applications and
ballots voted by mail may be sent. The early voting clerk, in accordance with the
provisions of the TEXAS ELECTIONS CODE, shall maintain a roster listing each person
who votes by personal appearance and each person to whom a ballot to be voted by mail
is sent. The roster shall be maintained in a form approved by the Secretary of State.
Section 5. Paper ballots shall be used for early voting and for voting on
Election Day, in accordance with the TEXAS ELECTION CODE. All expenditures
necessary for the conduct of the election, purchase of materials, and the employment of
all election officials are hereby authorized in accordance with the TEXAS ELECTION

CODE.



Section 6. The City Secretary is hereby authorized and directed to furnish all
necessary election supplies to conduct such election.

Section 7. The order in which the names of the candidates are to be printed on
the ballot shall be determined by a drawing by the City Secretary, as provided by Section
52.094 of the TEXAS ELECTION CODE. The City Secretary shall post a notice in her
office, at least seventy-two (72) hours prior to the date on which the drawing is to be
held, of the time and place of the drawing, and shall also give personal notice to any
candidate who makes written request for such notice and furnishes to the City Secretary a
self-addressed, stamped envelope. Each candidate involved in the drawing, or a
representative designated by such candidate, shall have a right to be present and observe
the drawing.

Section 8. The candidate receiving the highest number of votes for Mayor
shall be declared elected. The two (2) candidates receiving the highest number of votes
for Alderman shall be declared elected.

Section 9. Notice of this election shall be given in accordance with the
provisions of the TEXAS ELECTION CODE and returns of such notice shall be made as
provided for in said Code. The City Secretary, in compliance with Section 23.023c of the
Texas Local Government Code, shall post notice of said election for at least twenty (20)
days preceding the date of the election in at least three (3) public places within the
municipal limits. The Mayor shall issue all necessary orders and writs for such election,
and returns of such election shall be made to the City Secretary immediately after the

closing of the polls.



Section 10.  Said election shall be held in accordance with the TEXAS

ELECTION CODE and the Federal Voting Rights Act of 1965, as amended.

PASSED, APPROVED, AND ADOPTED the KO day ofy, é éz /74 C/ /s
2002.

J. Michael Dinges
Mayor

ATTEST:

Gatd %/M

Kathy Mdyfield

City Secretary John Smart — Mayor Pro-tem - X
Charles Herron — Council Member - X Yes
J. B. Collins, Jr.—Council Member- X Yes
Robert Fox — Council Member - X VYes
Bill Archer - Council Member - X Yes




ORDINANCE NO. 02-880

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF FULSHEAR, TEXAS,
ESTABLISHING PROCEDURES FOR THE REGULATION AND
ABATEMENT OF PUBLIC NUISANCES CAUSED BY SUBSTANDARD
BUILDINGS OR STRUCTURES WITHIN THE CITY; DEFINING
SUBSTANDARD BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES; PROVIDING FOR
NOTICE AND A PUBLIC HEARING CONCERNING THE CONDITION
OF SUCH BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES; PROVIDING A PENALTY
OF AN AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED $2,000 FOR EACH VIOLATION OF
ANY PROVISION HEREOF; REPEALING ALL ORDINANCES OR
PARTS OF ORDINANCES INCONSISTENT OR IN CONFLICT
HEREWITH; AND PROVIDING FOR SEVERABILITY.

* * * * * *

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF FULSHEAR, TEXAS:
Section 1. The City of Fulshear, Texas (the “City”), hereby adopts the following

regulations governing the abatement of dangerous buildings and structures within the City.

A. Authority and Purpose. The provisions of this Ordinance are adopted pursuant to

Chapters 54 and 214 of the TEXAS LOCAL GOVERNMENT CODE. The purpose of this Ordinance is
as follows:

1 To establish the minimum standards for the continued use and occupancy
of all types of buildings and structures within the City of Fulshear, Texas (the “City”),
regardless of the dates of construction, in order to safeguard the public health, safety, and
welfare and to protect property.

2 To provide the authority to order and direct the method of securing
property that is unoccupied by its owners, lessees, or other invitees, and which is
unsecured from unauthorized entry to the extent that such buildings or structures could be
entered or used by vagrants or other uninvited persons or could be entered or used by

children.

FULSHEAR/SUBSTANDARD BLDS.2/21/02



3 To provide the authority to address, and direct the method of addressing,
buildings and structures which, although boarded up, fenced, or otherwise secured in any
manner, exhibit conditions that may constitute a danger to the public, even though
secured from entry, or the means used to secure the building or structure are inadequate
to prevent unauthorized entry or use of the building by vagrants or other uninvited
persons or could be entered or used by children. The City may require the building or
structure, which endangers the public health and safety of the occupants of said building
and structure and the general public, to be vacated, secured, repaired, removed, and/or
demolished by the owner and/or the occupants thereof to be relocated.

B. Definitions. The following terms, when used in this Ordinance, shall have the
meanings ascribed to them herein, except where the context clearly indicates a different
meaning:

Building shall mean any structure designed or built for the support, enclosure,
shelter, or protection of persons, animals, chattels, or property of any kind.

Structure shall mean anything constructed or erected that requires location on the
ground or is attached to something having a location on the ground, including, but not
limited to, signs, fences, walls, poles, and buildings, whether of a temporary or
permanent nature.

&8 Dangerous buildings or structures defined. Any building or structure, regardless

of the date of its construction, having any of the following defects, shall be deemed to be
substandard and/or unfit for human habitation and, as a result, a danger to the public health,
safety and welfare and thus, declared to be a dangerous building or structure:
L. Any building or structure that has become deteriorated or damaged through
exposure to the elements, including without limitation flood, wind, hail, or rain, or

damage through fire, or damage by any other cause, to the extent that either the roof,

FULSHEAR/SUBSTANDARD BLDS.2/21/02 2



windows or doors, or portions of the house, building or structure that protect from the
weather will no longer reasonably protect form the weather.

2. Any building or structure that is so structurally deteriorated or damaged
that it is in danger of collapse or that cannot be expected to withstand reasonably
anticipated weather conditions, such as storms or hurricanes;

3. Conditions within any building or structure that violate any provision of
the City’s building, electrical, plumbing, fire, or other such codes or ordinances, when
such nonconformity constitutes a danger to the public health, safety, and welfare;

4. Any unsafe or defective electrical wiring, devices or equipment, or unsafe
or defective gas piping or appliances that are apt to cause or promote fires;

5. Dilapidated, decayed, unsafe, unsanitary, or substandard conditions or any
condition that fails to provide amenities essential to decent living so that the premises are
unfit for human habitation, or are likely to cause sickness or disease, so as to cause injury
to the public health, safety, and welfare;

6. Buildings and structures, regardless of their structural condition, that have
been, during times that they were not actually occupied by their owners, lessees or other
legal invitees, left unsecured from unauthorized entry to the extent that they may be
entered by vagrants or other uninvited persons as a place of harborage or could be entered
by children.

7 Buildings and structures, which are secured, though by inadequate means
to prevent unauthorized entry or use in the manner described in paragraph 6. above.

8. Any building or structure so constructed or maintained as to constitute a

menace to the public health or safety, including:

FULSHEAR/SUBSTANDARD BLDS.2/21/02 3



() All conditions conducive to the harboring of rats, snakes, mice,
other disease-carrying animals, or insects reasonably capable of spreading
disease;

(b) Conditions hazardous to the safety of persons or property, such as
inadequate bracing, structural support, construction, or the presence of
deteriorated materials;

(c) Conditions constituting an attractive nuisance and creating a
hazard to the health or safety of minors.

D. Declaration of nuisance. Any building or structure which has any of the

conditions or defects described in Paragraph C. hereof, where such condition or conditions pose
a threat or potential threat to the health, safety, or general welfare of its occupants or the public,
may be declared to be a public nuisance and shall be abated by repair, rehabilitation, demolition,
or as otherwise determined by the City Council.

E. Inspections and reports. It shall be the duty of the City’s building official, or

designee, to inspect all buildings and structures reported to be, or believed to be, in violation of
any of the terms of this Code. Prior to scheduling a public hearing regarding the condition of a
building or structure, the City’s building official, or designee, shall present a written report of
such inspection to the City Council. Said report shall list each building or structure, by street
address and legal description, the names of all owners of record, the specific conditions or
defects that render the building or structure dangerous pursuant to the standards set out in
Paragraph C. above, and a summary of any previous enforcement actions and attempts to bring

the building or structure into compliance.

FULSHEAR/SUBSTANDARD BLDS.2/21/02 4



F. Notice of public hearing.

1. Upon consideration and acceptance of the report provided for in Paragraph
E. hereof, City Council may schedule and specify a date for a public hearing to hear
testimony and receive evidence as to the condition(s) of the building or structure. Based
upon this action, the City’s building official, or designee, shall give notice of a public
hearing before City Council:
(a) By personal service or by certified mail, return receipt requested,
to:

(1) The owners of the affected property; and

(2)  Each mortgagee or lienholder having an interest in the
affected property.

(3) To all other persons, by posting a copy of such notice on
the front door of each building or structure situated on the affected
property or as close to the front door as practicable.

(4)  The building official, or designee, shall make a diligent
effort to discover the identity of any owner(s), lienholder(s), or mortgagee
of a building or structure by searching the following records for such
information:

(1) Fort Bend County real property records;

(ii)  Fort Bend County appraisal district records;
(iii)  Texas Secretary of State records;

(iv)  Fort Bend County assumed name records;

(v) City tax records; and

FULSHEAR/SUBSTANDARD BLDS.2/21/02 5



(vi)  City utility records.

(b) The notice shall inform all persons that a public hearing will be
held before the City Council in which the building official, or designee, will seek
an order requiring the building to be vacated, secured, repaired, removed and/or
demolished upon a finding that the building or structure is substandard and/or
dangerous. The notice shall include or state the following:

(D A copy of the inspection report as provided for in
Paragraph E. above, which shall list the specific conditions or defects that
render the building or structure a dangerous building within the standards
set out in Paragraph C. above;

2) That a public hearing will be held before the City Council
and that following such hearing, the City Council will consider and, if
deemed appropriate, adopt an order providing that the building or structure
be vacated, secured, repaired, removed, and/or demolished as provided
above;

3) The date, time, and place of the public hearing;

4) That at such public hearing the owner(s), lienholder(s), or
mortgagee will be required to submit proof of the scope of all work that is
required to bring such building or structure into compliance with this
Ordinance, the length of time it will take to perform such work, as well as
the start and ending date for the performance of such work.

G. Burden of proof. At the public hearing or a meeting before the City Council to

determine whether a building or structure has any of the conditions specified in Paragraph C.

FULSHEAR/SUBSTANDARD BLDS.2/21/02 6



above, which may result in a finding of a public nuisance and an abatement order, the
owner(s), lienholder(s), or mortgagee shall have the burden of proof to demonstrate the scope
of any work that may be required to abate the nuisance, the time it will take to perform such
work, as well as the start and ending date for the performance of such work. The owner(s),
lienholder(s), or mortgagee are encouraged to submit written and/or photographic evidence as

proof of the scope of any contemplated and necessary work.

H. Public hearing before City Council: consideration of order at meeting following
public hearing.
L. The City Council may, after proper notice and following a public hearing,

declare a building or structure to be in violation of this Code where the condition of the
building or structure has any of the conditions set out in Paragraph C. above.
2. The City Council may specify, in a written order signed by the mayor:

(a) A reasonable time period for the building or structure to be
vacated, secured, repaired, removed, and/or demolished by the owner(s),
lienholder(s), or mortgagee and, reasonable dates upon which such work must be
initiated and completed; and

(b) A reasonable time for the owner(s), lienholder(s), or mortgagee to
relocate the occupants of such building or structure.

3. The order shall be deemed issued and effective on the date the City
Council hears and decides the case.
4. After the public hearing and meeting of the City Council, the City’s

building official, or designee, shall promptly mail, by certified mail, return receipt

FULSHEAR/SUBSTANDARD BLDS.2/21/02 7



requested, a copy of the order to the owner(s), and to any known lienholder(s), or
mortgagee, of the affected building or structure.

3 If the City Council makes a finding under subparagraph 1. of this
paragraph, it shall order the owner(s), lienholder(s), or mortgagees of the building or
structure to, within thirty (30) days:

(a) Secure the building or structure from unauthorized entry; and/or

(b) Repair, remove, and/or demolish the building or structure, unless
the owner(s), lienholder(s), or mortgagee establishes at the public hearing that the
work cannot reasonably be performed within the thirty (30) days.

6. If the City Council allows the owner(s), lienholder(s), or mortgagee more
than thirty (30) days to repair, remove, and/or demolish the building or structure, the City
Council shall establish specific time schedules for the commencement and completion of
the work and shall require the owner(s), lienholder(s), or mortgagee to secure the
property in a reasonable manner from unauthorized entry while the work is being
performed.

7. The City Council shall not allow the owner(s), lienholder(s), or mortgagee
more than ninety (90) days to repair, remove, and/or demolish the building or structure or
fully perform all work required to fully comply with the order of the City Council, unless
the owner(s), lienholder(s), or mortgagee:

(a) Submits a detailed plan in writing which includes a time schedule

for the commencement and completion of such work; and

FULSHEAR/SUBSTANDARD BLDS.2/21/02 8



(b) Establishes at the public hearing that the work cannot reasonably
be completed within ninety (90) days because of the scope and complexity of the
work.

8. If the City Council allows the owner(s), lienholder(s), or mortgagee more
than ninety (90) days to complete any part of the work required to repair, remove, and/or
demolish the building or structure, the City Council shall require the owner(s),
lienholder(s), or mortgagee to submit regular progress reports to the City, in writing, to
demonstrate that the owner(s), lienholder(s), or mortgagee has complied with the time
schedules established for commencement and completion of the work. The order may
require that the owner(s), lienholder(s), or mortgagee appear on specific dates before the
City Council or the City’s building official, or designee, to demonstrate compliance with
such time schedules.

L. Notice of Order. Within ten (10) days after the date the order is issued, the City’s

building official, or designee, shall:
1 file a copy of the order in the office of the City Secretary;
2. publish, in a newspaper of general circulation within the City, a notice
containing:

(a) the street address and legal description of the property;
(b)  the date of the public hearing;
(c) a brief statement indicating the results of the order; and
3) instructions stating where a complete copy of the order may

be obtained; and

FULSHEAR/SUBSTANDARD BLDS.2/21/02 9



3. File a copy of the published notice in the Fort Bend County real property
records.

J. Imposition of Civil penalty for failure to comply with Order; assessment of lien.

1. After the time has lapsed to comply with an order of the City Council
issued pursuant to Paragraph H. above, the City Council, by order, may assess a civil
penalty against the property owner(s) for violations of the order requiring repair,
vacation, demolition, and/or removal of a building or structure. The civil penalty may
not exceed One Thousand and No/100 Dollars ($1000.00) per day for each violation or, if
the owner shows that the property is the owner’s lawful homestead, in an amount not to
exceed Ten and No/100 Dollars ($10.00) per day for each violation, if the City proves:

(a) The property owner was properly notified of the order, as adopted
by the City Council, and the owner’s need to comply with the requirements of
such order; and

(b) After notification, the property owner commiftted an act in
violation of the order or failed to take an action necessary for compliance with the
order.

2. An assessment of a civil penalty made by the City Council under
subparagraph 1. above is final and binding and constitutes prima facie evidence of the
penalty in any court of competent jurisdiction in a civil suit brought by the City for final
judgment in accordance with the assessed penalty.

3. To enforce a civil penalty assessed under this Section, the City Secretary

shall file, with the District Clerk of Fort Bend County, a certified copy of the order issued

FULSHEAR/SUBSTANDARD BLDS.2/21/02 10



under subparagraph (a) above stating the amount and duration of the civil penalty. No
other proof shall be required for a district court to enter a final judgment on the penalty.

4, Any civil penalty or expense assessed by the City under this Section shall
accrue interest at the rate of ten percent (10%) per year from the date of such assessment
until paid in full.

3. The City may take the appropriate action to create a lien against the
subject property, within the limits of state homestead protections, to secure payment of
the civil penalty.

6. In any judicial proceeding regarding enforcement of the City’s rights
under this Code, the City may be entitled to recover reasonable attorney’s fees.

K. City action following failure to abate: notice on building.

1. If the owner of the building or structure made the subject of an order
adopted by City Council to vacate, secure, repair, remove, and/or demolish said building
or structure does not comply with such order within the allotted time, the City may
vacate, secure, remove, or demolish the building or structure, or relocate the occupants of
said building or structure, at the City’s expense.

2 If the City Council authorizes the building to be vacated and secured as
provided in subparagraph a. above, the City’s building official shall post a notice on or
near the front door of such building or structure. The notice to vacate must be in
substantially the following form:

DO NOT OCCUPY
This building or structure is in violation of Ordinance No. _ of the City of
Fulshear. No one may occupy this building until such time as such violations are

corrected and approved by the City’s building official. It is a misdemeanor offense
to occupy this building or structure or to remove or deface this notice.

FULSHEAR/SUBSTANDARD BLDS.2/21/02 11



1. Assessment of lien for City expenses.

a. If the City incurs expenses under Paragraph K above, it may assess
said expenses on, and the City shall have a lien against the property upon which
the building or structure is located, unless such property is a homestead protected
by the Texas Constitution.

b. The lien is extinguished if the property owner(s) or any other
person having an interest in the legal title to the property reimburses the City for
its expenses.

e. The lien arises and attaches to said property at the time the notice
of the lien is recorded and indexed in the Fort Bend County real property records.

d. The notice of the lien shall contain the name and address of the
owner, if that information can be determined with a reasonable effort; a legal
description of the real property upon which the building or structure is or was
located; the amount of expenses incurred by the City; and the balance due.

13. Criminal Penalty. Any person who refuses or fails to repair, demolish,

and/or remove a building or structure when ordered to take such action(s) under the terms
of this Code, or who refuses or fails to leave a building that has been ordered vacated
under the terms of this Code, or who enters an area around a building that has been
declared to be dangerous and notice of which declarations shall have been posted, or who
interferes with or hinders the repair, vacation, demolition, and/or removal of any building
or structure under the terms of this Code, or who otherwise violates any order of the City

Council as provided for in this Code, shall be deemed guilty of an misdemeanor and,

FULSHEAR/SUBSTANDARD BLDS.2/21/02 12



upon conviction thereof, shall be subject to punishment as provided by this Code or
applicable law.

14. Other remedies: Chapters 54 and 214, Texas Local Government Code.

Nothing in this Section shall preclude the City’s pursuit of any and all other remedies
allowed under civil and criminal law, or in equity, to address conditions which are treated
in this Section, under the theory of public nuisance and the abatement of dangerous
buildings or structures. Neither shall the City be required, nor prohibited, to issue
criminal citations before, after, or during any proceeding prescribed in this Section.
Specifically, in addition to the provisions in this Section and remedies afforded
under the TEXAS LOCAL GOVERNMENT CODE, Chapter 214, Municipal Regulation of

Structures, the City further asserts full authority to exercise its right to remedy under all

provisions of the TEXAS LOCAL GOVERNMENT CODE, including, but not limited to,

Chapter 54, Subchapter B, Municipal Health and Safety Ordinances, in prosecution of

civil suits for enforcement, injunctive relief, and civil penalties to remedy conditions of

public concern described in this Section.

Section 2. Penalty. Any person, corporation, or entity who or which violates any
provision of this Ordinance shall be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor and, upon conviction, shall
be fined in an amount not to exceed $2,000. Each day in which any violation shall occur, or each
occurrence of any violation, shall constitute a separate offense.

Section 3. Repealer. All ordinances or parts or ordinances inconsistent or in conflict
herewith are, to the extent of such inconsistency or conflict, hereby repealed.

Section 4. Severability. In the event any clause phrase, provision, sentence, or part of

this Ordinance or the application of the same to any person or circumstances shall for any reason

FULSHEAR/SUBSTANDARD BLDS.2/21/02 13



be adjudged invalid or held unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, it shall not affect,
impair, or invalidate this Ordinance as a whole or any part or provision hereof other than the part
declared to be invalid or unconstitutional; and the City Council of the City of Fulshear, Texas,
declares that it would have passed each and every part of the same notwithstanding the omission of

any such part thus declared to be invalid or unconstitutional, whether there be one or more parts.

PASSED, APPROVED, AND ADOPTED this 2¢” day of \%ﬁmﬁ, , 2002.

J. Michael Dinges, Mangr

ATTEST:

Kathy Mayfield, City S

FULSHEAR/SUBSTANDARD BLDS.2/21/02 14



ORDINANCE 02-881

ORDER OF CANCELLATION
EJEMPLO DE ORDEN DE CANCELACION

The City of Fulshear hereby cancels the election scheduled to be held on May 4, 2002 in
accordance with Section 2.033(a) of the Texas Election Code. The following candidates

have been certified as unopposed and are hereby elected as follows:

El City of Fulshear por la presente calcela la eleccion que, de lo contrario, se hubiera
celebrado el 04 de mayo de conformidad, con la Section 2.053(a) del Codigo de
Alecciones de Texas. Los siguientes candidatos han sido certificados como candidatos

unicos y por la presente quedan elegidos como se halla indicado a continuacion:

Candidate (Candidato) Office Sought (Cargo al que presenta candidatura)
J. Michael Dinges Mayor (Alcalde)

John Smart Alderman (Concejales)

W. Owen Bement Alderman (Concejales)

A copy of this order will be posted on Election Day at the polling place that would have
been used in the election.
El Dia de las Elecciones se exhibira una copia de esta orden en todas las mesas

electorales que se hubieran utilizado en la eleccion.

O Mekist Aill Lsis 17, 2002,

9 Mlchael Dinges, Mayor Date of Adoption

@A%W

Kathy M{ field, C1ty40retary

John Smart - Aye
Bill Archer - Aye
Charles Herron - Age
Robert Fox - Aye

J.B. Collins, Jr. - Aye



ORDINANCE NO. 02-882

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF FULSHEAR, TEXAS,
PROHIBITING THE SALE OF VEHICLES AND OTHER GOODS ON
PUBLIC RIGHT-OF-WAYS; PROVIDING A PENALTY IN AN AMOUNT
NOT TO EXCEED $500.00; PROVIDING FOR SEVERABILITY; AND
CONTAINING OTHER PROVISIONS RELATED TO THE SUBJECT.

* * * * * *

WHEREAS, pursuant to state law, the City of Fulshear, Texas (the "City"), as a general-
law city, has exclusive authority over its highways, streets, and alleys; and

WHEREAS, the display and sale of vehicles and other items has become more
commonplace along City streets and adjacent ﬁght-of-ways; and

WHEREAS, such activities create hazardous traffic conditions within the City, by
diverting the attention of motorists; and

WHEREAS, such conditions jeopardize the safety of other motorists, children,
pedestrians; now, therefore,
BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF FULSHEAR, TEXAS:

Section 1. Recitations. The facts and matters contained in the preamble of this

Ordinance are hereby found to be true and correct.

Section 2. Selling Merchandise Prohibited in the Right-of-way. No person shall sell or

offerer for sale by auction or otherwise, any vehicle, goods, wares, merchandise, produce, other
farm products or anly other article on any portion of a public improved right-of-way adjacent to a
paved sidewalk or roadway within the City.

Section 3. Penalty. Any person who shall violate any provision of this Ordinance

shall be guilty of a misdemeanor and, upon conviction, shall be fined in an amount not to exceed

$500.00. Each day of violation shall constitute a separate offense.

FULSHEAR/ 02-882 VENDOR ORDINANCE.4/8/02



Section 4. Severability. In the event any clause, phrase, provision, sentence, or part of

this Ordinance or the application of the same to any person or circumstances shall for any reason
be adjudged invalid or held unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, it shall not affect,
impair, or invalidate this Ordinance as a whole or any part or provision hereof other than the part
declared to be invalid or unconstitutional; and the City Council of the City of Fulshear, Texas,
declares that it would have passed each and every part of the same notwithstanding the omission of

any such part thus declared to be invalid or unconstitutional, whether there be one or more parts.

]
PASSED, APPROVED, AND ADOPTED this /7 day of W , 2002.

W@

i B M1chae1 Dinges, Mayor

ATTEST: ' |
db)«‘/{:&/ 7%@(/ lé,é// John Smart - Aye
Kathy Maj/ﬁeld Cltyé&retary _ Charles Herron - Aye

J.B. Collins, Jr. - Aye
Bill Archer - Aye
Robert Fox - Aye

FULSHEAR/ 02-882 _VENDOR ORDINANCE.4/8/02 2



ORDINANCE NO. 02-883

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF FULSHEAR, TEXAS, FINDING AND
DETERMINING THAT PUBLIC CONVENIENCE AND NECESSITY NO
LONGER REQUIRE THE CONTINUED EXISTENCE OF A 0.0459-ACRE
TRACT OF LAND BEING AN ALLEYWAY BISECTING FIRST STREET
BETWEEN MAIN STREET AND HARRIS STREET WITHIN THE CITY OF
FULSHEAR, FORT BEND COUNTY, TEXAS; VACATING, ABANDONING,
AND CLOSING SAID ALLEYWAY BISECTING FIRST STREET BETWEEN
MAIN STREET AND HARRIS STREET; AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO
EXECUTE AND THE CITY CLERK TO ATTEST, RESPECTIVELY, A
QUITCLAIM DEED CONVEYING SAID ABANDONED ALLEYWAY
EASEMENT TO ZIONS FIRST NATIONAL BANK; AND CONTAINING
OTHER PROVISIONS RELATING TO THE SUBJECT.

* % * % *
WHEREAS, Zions First National Bank, the abutting property owner of the subject
property, has petitioned the City of Fulshear, Texas, to vacate, abandon, and close the
hereinafter described alleyway; and
WHEREAS, the City Council has determined that such alleyway should be vacated,
abandoned, and closed for the reason that the same is no longer needed by the City; now,
therefore;

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF FULSHEAR, TEXAS:

Section 1. The facts and recitations set forth in the preamble of this Ordinance are
hereby found to be true and correct.

Section 2. The City Council of the City of Fulshear, Texas, hereby finds and
determines that public convenience and necessity no longer require the continued existence of that
portion of the alleyway described in Section 3 hereof.

Section 3. The alleyway, approximately twenty feet (20°) in width and one-hundred

feet (100’) in length bisecting First Street between Main Street and Harris Street within the City

MANVEL/ALLEY CLOSE.ORD/04/19/02



of Fulshear, Fort Bend County, Texas, as designated by the diagonal lines shown on Exhibit "A"
attached hereto and made a part hereof, is hereby vacated, abandoned, and closed.

Section 4. The Mayor and City Secretary are hereby authorized to execute and attest,
respectively, a quitclaim deed, a copy of which is attached hereto and made a part hereof,
conveying the hereinabove described abandoned roadway to Zions First National Bank for a
consideration of $2,915.00.

PASSED, APPROVED, AND ADOPTED on this /7 day of Ap4he/ 2002
7/

O Mkt gy

Michael Dinges
Mayor
John Smart - Abstain
X Robert Fox -  Aye
ATTEST: J.B. Collinms, Jr. Aye
Charles Herron - Aye
Bill ARcher -  Aye
(athy Tresyoutl]
Kathy Ma(yﬁeld

City Secretary

MANVEL/ALLEY CLOSE.ORD/04/19/02 -2-



B4-098-82 16:03

MAN STREET oraam

OLSON & DOLSON » 2813462556

AT E"Y

~¥

& o §;I
Y o

"‘“ v

}
b :-+
;i; Y ¥
b rasuore — [y ﬁjﬁbi
MARRIS -STREET  swmoms

Swn

ND.B43 PBR72E7

EXHIBIT A_




ORDINANCE NO. 02-884

AN ORDINANCE PROHIBITING THE INSTALLATION OF MOBILE
HOMES WITHIN THE CITY OF FULSHEAR; REQUIRING A PERMIT
FOR THE CONSTRUCTION OF, ADDITION TO, OR EXTENSION OF
MANUFACTURED HOME PARKS OR MANUFACTURED HOME
SUBDIVISIONS; REQUIRING A LICENSE TO OPERATE A
MANUFACTURED HOME PARK AND SETTING FORTH THE SITE
REQUIREMENTS, MANUFACTURED HOME SUBDIVISION AND
MANUFACTURED HOME PARK STANDARDS AND OTHER
PREREQUISITES TO THE ISSUANCE OF A PERMIT OR LICENSE;
PROVIDING DEFINITIONS; PRESCRIBING REGULATIONS FOR
MANAGEMENT OF MANUFACTURED HOME PARKS, AND
PROVIDING FOR NONCONFORMING MANUFACTURED HOME
SUBDIVISIONS AND MANUFACTURED HOME PARKS AND
PROVIDING FEES; PROVIDING A PENALTY IN THE AMOUNT OF
$2,000 FOR VIOLATION OF ANY PROVISION OF THIS ORDINANCE;
REPEALING ALL ORDINANCES OR PARTS OF ORDINANCES
INCONSISTENT OR IN CONFLICT HEREWITH; AND CONTAINING A
SEVERABILITY CLAUSE.

* * * * *

WHEREAS, it has come to the attention of the City Council of the City of Fulshear,
Texas (the “City”), that unregulated Manufactured Homes, Manufactured Home Parks and
‘Manufactured Home Subdivisions can be dangerous and constitute a hazard to life and
property; and

WHEREAS, it is in the best interest of the City that the health, safety and general
welfare of the City be promoted by preventing the overcrowding of land through planned and
orderly growth of the City, and an undue concentration of the population be avoided; and

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Fulshear finds it to be in the best interests
of the public safety, health and general welfare to regulate Manufactured Homes,

Manufactured Home Parks and Manufactured Home Subdivisions within the City; therefore,
City of Fulshear

Manufactured Home Ordinance
Page 1



BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF FULSHEAR, FORT
BEND COUNTY, TEXAS:

Section 1. Title. This Ordinance is hereby referenced as the Fulshear

Manufactured Housing Ordinance.

Section 2. Definitions. For the purposes of this Ordinance, certain terms, words

and phrases shall have the meanings hereinafter ascribed thereto.

Building Official: Designated inspection authority of the City, or its authorized

representative.

Certificate of Occupancy: Certificate issued by the City Council for the use of a

building, structure, or land, when it is determined by it that the building structure or land
complies with the provisions of all applicable City Codes, ordinances, and regulations.

City: The City of Fulshear, Fort Bend County, Texas, and its extraterritorial
jurisdiction.

City Council: The City Council of the City of Fulshear, Texas.

Common Access Route/Internal Street: Street providing the principal means of access

to individual Manufactured Home lots or auxiliary buildings.

Drive way: Minor entrance off the common access route within the park, into an off-
street parking area serving one or more Manufactured Homes.

License: Written license issued by the City Council, permitting a person to operate and
maintain a Manufactured Home Park under the provisions of this Ordinance.

Lot: In addition to the meaning ascribed to it under the City’s Subdivision Ordinance,

it shall mean a plot of ground or space within a Manufactured Home Park or Manufactured

City of Fulshear
Manufactured Home Ordinance
Page 2



Home Subdivision designated for accommodation of one Manufactured Home, together with
such open space as required by this Ordinance. This term also includes the term “site.”

Manufactured Home: A structure constructed on or after June 15, 1976, according to

the rules of the United States Department of Housing and Urban Development, transportable in
one or more sections, which, in the traveling mode, is eight feet (8’) or more in width or forty
feet (40°) or more in length, or when erected on site, is 320 or more square feet, and which is
built on a permanent chassis and designed to be used as a dwelling with or without a permanent
foundation when connected to the required utilities, and includes the plumbing, heating, air
conditioning and electrical systems. Anything less than the length or width specified in this
paragraph shall not be allowed for placement in a Manufactured Home Park or a Manufactured
Home Subdivision.

Mobile Home: A structure that was constructed before June 15, 1976, transportable in
one or more sections, which, in the traveling mode, is eight feet (8’) or more in width or forty
feet (40°) or more in length, or when erected on site, is 320 or more square feet, and which is
built on a permanent chassis designed to be used as a dwelling with or without a permanent
foundation when connected to the required utilities, and includes the plumbing, heating, air
conditioning and electrical systems. Mobile Homes shall not be allowed in Manufactured
Home Parks or Manufactured Home Subdivisions. For purposes of this ordinance, a Mobile
Home shall include a Towable Recreation Vehicle as defined below.

Manufactured Home Park: A parcel of land under single entity ownership which has

been platted and approved by the City and where lots are planned to be leased for the

placement of Manufactured Homes, accessory uses and service facilities, meeting all

City of Fulshear
Manufactured Home Ordinance
Page 3



requirements of this Ordinance, the City’s Subdivision Ordinance, and any applicable deed

restrictions and state laws.

Manufactured Home Subdivision: A parcel of land which has been platted and

approved by the City and where lots are planned to be sold for the placement of Manufactured
Homes, accessory uses and service facilities, meeting all requirements of this Ordinance, the
City’s Subdivision Ordinance, and any applicable deed restrictions and state laws.

Parking, Off-Street: A paved surface, a minimum of ten feet (10°) in width by twenty

feet (20°) in length, located within the boundary of a Manufactured Home lot, or in common
parking and storage areas, having unobstructed access to an internal street.

Permit: Written certification issued by the City Council or Building Official permitting
the construction, alteration or extension of a Manufactured Home Park or Manufactured Home
Subdivision under the provisions of this Ordinance and regulations issued hereunder.

Person: Any natural individual, firm, trust, partnership, association or corporation,
Limited Liability Company, limited liability partnership or other entity created by or
recognized by Texas law or the laws of any other state.

Site Plan: Graphic presentation, drawn to scale, in a horizontal plane, delineating the
outlines of the land included in the plan and all proposed use locations, accurately
dimensioned, the dimensions also indicating the relation of each use to that adjoining and to the
boundary of the property. Scale shall be at least 1” to 100’ for sites under thirty acres, and at
least 1” to 200’ for sites greater than thirty acres.

Towable Recreational Vehicle: a nonmotorized vehicle that:

City of Fulshear
Manufactured Home Ordinance
Page 4



A. was originally designed and manufactured primarily to provide temporary human
habitation in conjunction with recreational, camping, or seasonal use;

B. qualifies to be titled and registered with the Texas Department of Motor Vehicles as
a travel trailer through a county tax assessor-collector; and

C. is permanently built on a single chassis.

Section 3. Location of Manufactured Homes

A. It shall be unlawful for any person to locate, maintain, or occupy a
Manufactured Home in any place within the City other than in an approved Manufactured
Home Park or Manufactured Home Subdivision, or in accordance with Section 9, Use of
Manufactured Homes for Nonresidential Purposes.

B. It shall be unlawful for any person to install, locate, relocate, or change
occupancy in a Mobile Home in any place within the City limits of the City.

C. Mobile Homes and Manufactured Homes lawfully existing and occupied within
the City limits prior to the date of this Ordinance, shall be allowed to continue and be
maintained, but shall brought into compliance with Section 6, subsections B, E3, F1, F2, J1,
J3,J5, L1, L2, M1, M2, N, and P by no later than the 20™ day of October, 2002. No
expansion or enlargement of mobile homes shall be allowed. Provided, however, that Mobile
Homes or Manufactured Homes heretofore installed in compliance with City Ordinances, being
properly permitted there under, utilized continuously as a residence, and being connected to all
utilities, may be replaced with newer model Manufactured Homes, subject to the permitting
and licensing requirements contained herein. In the event of such a replacement, addiﬁona]
documentation as to the use and connection to utilities must be provided to the City, and the
City of Fulshear

Manufactured Home Ordinance
Page 5



old unit must be removed and the new unit must be installed within two weeks of one another,
weather permitting.

Section 4. Permits,

A. Permit Required. It shall be unlawful for aﬁy person to install, construct, alter,
extend or expand any Manufactured Home, Manufactured Home Park, or Manufactured Home
Subdivision within the limits of the City without a valid pérmit issued by the City Council in
the name of such person for the specific placement, construction, alteration or extension
proposed. No application shall be considered complete nor shall be accepted by the City for
processing until the applicant is in full compliance with all requirements of this Ordinance.

B. Application Requirements. All applications for permits shall be made upon

standard forms provided by the City Secretary and shall contain the following:

1. Name and address of the applicant.

2. Location and legal description of the Manufactured Home, Manufactured
Home Park, or Manufactured Home Subdivision.

3. Five copies of a site plan accurately depicting the layout of the
Manufactured Home Park or Manufactured Home Subdivision. The site plan shall
include all data required under Section 6 of this Ordinance, and be in the scale specified
herein.

4. A certified copy of the filed subdivision plat, or a copy of the final plat
being submitted for simultaneous review by the City.

Provided, however, that in the case of individual Manufactured Homes being placed on

lots in Manufactured Home Parks which have previously been approved by City Council and

City of Fulshear
Manufactured Home Ordinance
Page 6



filed of record, the information in subparagraphs 3 and 4 above shall not be required, and the
Building Official is hereby authorized to approve such permits under the terms provided in
Subsection D.
C. Permit Fee. The appropriate fee shall accompany all applications to the
Building Official as follows:
1. Individual Manufactured Homes $ 50.00
2. Manufactured Home Park or Subdivisions $ 200.00

D. Issuance of Permit. In considering the application, the City Council may

consider the proposed location of the Manufactured Home Park or Manufactured Home
Subdivision in relation to the present and future anticipated land use and development of
adjacent and nearby land. City Council expressly reserves the right to deny development and
to impose additional reasonable conditions, as it deems necessary. After the application is
reviewed and is determined to be in compliance with this Ordinance and other applicable
requirements, laws, codes and regulations, the permit shall be issued. In cases where the
Building Official is authorized to approve such permits, he shall issue the permit following his
review and determination that the individual Manufactured Home lot and Park are in full
compliance with all requirements of this Ordinance and other applicable requirements, laws,
codes and regulations.

E. Denial of Permit; Hearing. Any person whose application for a permit under

this Ordinance has been denied, may request in writing a rehearing on the matter and offer
additional evidence. Such hearing must be requested within thirty (30) days from the date of

the action denying the permit.

City of Fulshear
Manufactured Home Ordinance
Page 7



Section 5. Licenses.

A. License Required. It shall be unlawful for any person to establish, operate or
maintain or permit to be established, operated, or maintained upon any property owned or
controlled by such person any Manufactured Home Park within the City unless such person
holds a valid license issued annually by the City Council. All applications for licenses shall be
made in writing to the City Council, which shall issue a license upon compliance by the
applicant with the provisions of this Ordinance. The City Council shall not issue a license
unless the applicant is in compliance with all other applicable ordinances and laws. At any
time the applicant is in violation of applicable laws and ordinances, the license may be
cancelled. Licenses issued shall expire on December 31 of each year.

B. Application for Original License. Application for original license shall be in
writing signed by the applicant, accompanied by an affidavit of the applicant as to the truth of

the application, and by the deposit of the license fee hereinafter provided, and shall contain:

1 the name and address of the applicant;
2. a copy of a valid Certificate of Occupancy;
3. the location and legal description of the park; and
=, a site plan of the park prepared in accordance with Section 6 hereof.
C. Hearing Granted Applicants. Any person whose application for a license under

this Ordinance has been denied may request in writing within ten (10) days a rehearing, which
shall be granted by the City Council. Such rehearing shall be held by the City Council within

thirty (30) days of the date the request for rehearing is received by the City.

City of Fulshear
Manufactured Home Ordinance
Page 8



D. Application for License Renewal. Application for renewal of a license shall be

made in writing by the licensee on forms furnished by the City Council on or before December
1 of each year. The application shall contain any change in the information occurring after the
original license was issued or the latest renewal granted and be accompanied by the
Manufactured Home Park register as required in Section 8 hereof.

E. License Fee. The appropriate fee as shown thereof shall accompany all original

license applications or renewals on the schedule below.

1. For 2 through 15 Manufactured Home lots $75.00

2. For 16 through 40 Manufactured Home lots $125.00

3. For 41 through 60 Manufactured Home lots $175.00

4. For 61 through 80 Manufactured Home lots $225.00

5. Each lot in excess of 80 $ 2.00 per lot
F. Transfer of License. Every person holding a license shall give notice in writing

to the City Council within fifteen (15) days after having sold, transferred, given away, or
otherwise disposed of interest in or control of any Manufactured Home Park. Application for
transfer of license shall be made to City Council not later than fifteen (15) days after the date
of the sale, transfer, or gift, or other disposition of interest in or control of a Manufactured
Home Park. City Council shall have the authority to deny such transfer of license within a
reasonable time, not to ex;eed sixty (60) days, if such Manufactured Home Park is not in
compliance with the terms of this Ordinance.

G. Transfer of License Fee. All applications for license transfers shall be

accompanied by a fee of Twenty-five and No/100 Dollars ($25.00).

City of Fulshear
Manufactured Home Ordinance
Page 9



H. Violations, Notice, Suspension of License. Whenever the City Council finds

that conditions or practices exist which are in violation of any provision of this Ordinance, it
shall give notice in writing in accordance with Section 12 hereof, to the permitee or licensee of
the permitee’s or licensee’s agent that unless conditions or practices in violation of this
Ordinance are corrected within a reasonable period of time of not less than thirty (30) days or
more than one (1) year, as specified in such notice, the license or permit shall be suspended.
At the end of the period of time granted for correction, if the conditions or practices have not
been corrected, the City Council may suspend the license and give notice in writing of the
suspension to the licensee or the licensee’s agent at the address provided in the application.
Upon receipt of notice of suspension, the licensee shall cease operations of the Manufactured
Home Park, as set forth in the notice, within ten (10) days after the notice is issued.

Section 6. General Requirements for Manufactured Home Subdivisions and

Manufactured Home Parks.

A. Site Plan. The site plan shall be prepared as required by this Subsection,
shall be a part of the application, and shall show the following information:

1. The name, address, fee owner and record owner of the proposed or
existing Manufactured Home Subdivision or Manufactured Home Park;

2. Name as shown on the subdivision plat where the Manufactured Home
‘Subdivision or Manufactured Home Park is to be located;

3 Names of adjacent public or private streets and roads, adjacent
subdivisions or property owners of unplatted land;

4, Contour lines at two foot (2°) intervals;
City of Fulshear

Manufactured Home Ordinance
Page 10



5. Locations and dimensions of all Manufactured Home spaces, points of
ingress and egress, utility easements, drives, recreation areas, fencing and landscaping,
signage, streets, and sidewalks. Each Manufactured Home lot and common facility

area shall be sequentially numbered,;

6. Scale of plan and complete dimensions for each lot, street and open area;
7 Density in units per gross acre;

8. Area and dimensions of entire site;

0. Areas defined for waste containers and method of disposal;

10. Dimension, description, and location of common facilities;

11. Water and sewer plans must be submitted, on separate sheets if
necessary, and must show sewer line locations, grades and sizes, and water line
locations, sizes and source of water supply.

12.  Paving and drainage plans must be submitted, on a separate sheet if
necessary, and must show the directions and calculated quantities of runoff and the
proposed specifications for streets in accordance with the City’s ordinances.

B. Conform to Codes. All facilities or improvements in Manufactured Home Parks

or Subdivisions, other than Manufactured Homes contained therein shall conform to all
applicable City ordinances and state laws.

C. Review of Plans. When the application and plans are complete, and after

review by the Planning Commission, a public hearing will be scheduled before City Council.

The City Council will review the complete application and all plans, and shall notify the

City of Fulshear
Manufactured Home Ordinance
Page 11



applicant in writing of his approval, disapproval, or conditions or modifications necessary

before approval on subsequent submission.

D. Location of Manufactured Homes and Accessory Structures. No Manufactured

Home or accessory structure such as a refuse container, carport cabana, awning, fence, or

storage locker shall be permitted within ten feet (10°) of a private or public street or the

boundary line of a Manufactured Home lot.

E. Screening Requirements: The following screening requirements shall be

applicable:

L Landscaping. A landscaped strip of not less than ten feet (10°) in width,
or fencing as hereinafter provided, shall be located along all Manufactured Home
Subdivisions and Manufactured Home Park boundary lines. Provided, however, such
landscaping strip or fencing shall not be required by the City where the Manufactured
Home Subdivision or Manufactured Home Park abuts another Manufactured Home
Subdivision or Manufactured Home Park, or commercial or industrial development.
Such Jandscaped strip shall be continuously maintained and shall be devoted exclusively
to the planting, cultivation, growing, and maintenance of site obscuring trees, shrubs,
and plant life as described below. Trees, shrubs, cane, and/or other vegetation shall be
planted, cultivated, and maintained as a sight and noise obscuring buffer that will
effectively achieve sight and noise obstruction within approximately five (5) years. The
buffer strips are intended to provide a seventy-five percent (75%) or more opaque
screen when viewed horizontally between two and ten feet (2’ and 10°) above the

natural ground at the end of the growing period of five (5) years from the date of

City of Fulshear
Manufactured Home Ordinance

Page 12



planting. Additional planting, cultivation, and maintenance may be required by the
City officials during the use period of the buffer strip to achieve and maintain this
effect.

2. Fencing. A solid fence, at least six feet (6°) in height shall be
constructed and maintained along all boundaries of the Manufactured Home Subdivision
or Manufactured Home Park. The fence materials must be wood, brick, stone,
stuccoed concrete block, or other similar materials. In no instance will plain concrete
block, concrete panels, fiberglass, or metal sheeting be allowed.

3, Skirting. Each Manufactured Home shall have permanent skirting
around its perimeter to screen its wheels and undercarriage from view.

F. Fire Safety Standards:

L. The storage, handling, and use of liquefied petroleum gases and
flammable liquids shall be done in compliance with applicable City ordinances and state
laws.

2. Access to Manufactured Home for Fire Fighting. Approaches to all
Manufactured Homes shall be kept clear for emergency vehicles.

3 Fire Protection. Water lines and fire hydrants shall be provided and
suitably located for adequate fire protection as determined by the Fire Chief or City
Council, but in no case shall the development provide less than a system of standard
hydrants located not more than five hundred feet (500°) from each Manufactured Home
space and served by water lines not less than six inches (6”) in diameter installed in a

looped system.

City of Fulshear
Manufactured Home Ordinance

Page 13



G. Recreational Areas. Not less than eight percent (8 %) of the gross site area shall

be devoted to recreational facilities, generally provided in a central location. In large
developments of greater than twenty-five (25) acres, recreation facilities can be decentralized
with each location at least two-thirds of an acre. Recreation areas may include space for
community buildings and community use facilities, such as indoor recreation areas, swimming
pools, hobby and repair shops, and service buildings. Playground areas designed for children
shall be so designated and must be protected from traffic, thoroughfares and parking areas. No
recreation area shall contain less than 5,000 square feet. Where compliance with this provision
results in undue hardship or individual site areas are substantially above minimum standards
and provide for sufficient outdoor recreation, an exemption may be granted. Application for
such an exemption shall be made to the City Council at the time of the filing of an application
under this Ordinance.

H. Height requirements.

L The height limit for any structure, including a Manufactured Home,
intended for any use or occupancy shall be thirty-five feet (35°).

2. The average height of the Manufactured Home frame above ground
elevation, measured at 90° to the frame, shall not exceed four feet (4’) from the top of
the pad.

L Spacing Regulations. Mé.nufactured Homes shall be located no closer than
twenty feet (20°) from any exterior wall to the closest exterior wall of the nearest

Manufactured Home.

City of Fulshear
Manufactured Home Ordinance
Page 14



Manufactured Home Lot. Each and every Manufactured Home shall be located

on a separate lot, which shall conform to the following standards:

1. Be served with sanitary sewer, water, electrical power, telephone

service, and natural gas, said utilities shall be underground;

2, Provide a Manufactured Home pad, which shall provide an adequate

foundation for the placement and tie-down of one (1) single-family Manufactured

Home,

thereby securing the superstructure against uplift, sliding rotation, and

overturning. Said pad shall:

a. be constructed of material, which shall adequately support the
weight of the Manufactured Home;

b. provide anchors and tie-downs such as cast-in-place concrete
“dead men,” eyelets embedded in concrete foundations or runway screw augers,
arrowhead anchors or other devices which secure the stability of the
Manufactured Home, and shall be placed at least at each corner of the
Manufactured Home.

. cover an area of at least two hundred forty (240) square feet or at
least one-third the area of the largest Manufactured Home, which is to be placed
on the Manufactured Home Park lot, whichever is greater. No surface provided
for a purpose other than the foundation of a Manufactured Home shall be
considered a part of such Manufactured Home pad.

3 Provide a minimum of two (2) off-street parking spaces, which shall be

constructed of concrete or asphalt.

City of Fulshear

Manufactured Home Ordinance

Page 15



4. Double street frontage of a Manufactured Home lot shall be prohibited.

3. Drainage. The ground surface in all parts of every development, and
especially beneath Manufactured Homes and other structures, shall be graded and
equipped to drain all surface water in a safe and efficient manner so as not to permit
water to stand or become stagnant.

K. Design and Location of Storage Facilities. Storage facilities with a minimum

capacity of two hundred (200) cubic feet per Manufactured Home lot may be provided on the
lot or in compounds located within two hundred feet (200°) of the lot. Where provided,
storage facilities shall be faced with a durable, fire resistant material. Storage outside the
perimeter walls of the Manufactured Home shall be permitted only if in such facilities. No
storage shall be permitted under a Manufactured Home. Storage facilities shall not be located
within ten feet (10°) of the boundary line of any Manufactured Home lot.

L. Water Supply:

1 All approved water supply for domestic use and fire protection purposes
shall be supplied to meet the requirements of the development and the applicable laws,
codes, and ordinances of the City. Certification of compliance from the water provider
shall be required prior to the issuance of any certificate of occupancy for any
Manufactured Home or other structure.

2, All plumbing improvements to any Manufactured Home lot shall be
made in accordance with applicable ordinances of the City.

M. Sewage Disposal: From and after the effective date of this Ordinance, the

following shall apply:

City of Fulshear
Manufactured Home Ordinance
Page 16



1. Waste from all toilets, lavatories, sinks, and showers shall be discharged
into a public sewer system approved by the City. Certification of compliance from the
City shall be required prior to the issuance of any certificate of occupancy for any
Manufactured Home or other structure.

8 All plumbing improvements to any Manufactured Home lot shall be
made in accordance with applicable ordinances of the City.

3 Each Manufactured Home lot shall have a sewer riser pipe of at least
four inches (4”), which shall be capped when not in use.

N. Electrical and Telephone Distribution Systems. From and after the effective

date of this Ordinance, the electrical distribution system shall comply with applicable electrical
codes and other applicable laws of the State.

0. Common Facilities. All buildings or rooms containing bathroom, laundry, or
other common facilities shall have fire-resistant walls extending to the ceiling between male
and female sanitary facilities. Walls and partitions around showers, tubs, lavatories, and other
plumbing fixtures shall be constructed of dense, nonabsorbent, waterproof materials, or
covered with moisture resistant materials.

P. Refuse and Garbage. Solid waste shall be stored in a fly-proof, waterproof

container, which shall be emptied regularly and maintained in a usable, sanitary condition and
the collection and disposal of said refuse and garbage shall be so conducted as to create no
health hazard. The owner of a Manufactured Home Park or Subdivision shall grant a refuse

pickup easement to the City, if necessary, for garbage collection.

City of Fulshear
Manufactured Home Ordinance
Page 17



Q. Signage. Each Manufactured Home Subdivision or Manufactured Home Park
shall have a sign at its entrances, bearing its name. The signs shall be of a monument style,
not to exceed five feet in height, and not to exceed a total area of forty square feet. The signs
shall not be electrical, provided, however, that one light from the base of the sign shall be
allowed. Illumination shall not cause glare or other nuisance on any adjacent property.

R. Parking of Mobile Home, Manufactured Home or Travel Trailers. It shall be

unlawful fof any person to park any Manufactured Home, Mobile Home or travel trailer on
any street in the City in a manner in which such parking blocks the natural flow of traffic,
blocks an entrance way to either public or private property, or creates a hazard, and under no
circumstances shall any person park any Manufactured Home, Mobile Home, or travel trailer
on a street within corporate limits of the City for a period in excess of three (3) hours.

Section 7.  Manufactured Home Subdivisions. The following requirements shall

apply, in addition to the general requirements of Section 6, to Manufactured Home
Subdivisions.
A. Lot Size. Each lot for a Manufactured Home shall be a minimum of fifty feet
(50°) in width, and a minimum of one hundred and fifty feet (150°) in depth. Lots for common
facilities shall be of such a size to meet the minimum setback areas below, and such that no
more than fifty percent (50%) of such lot is covered by building area, exclusive of parking.
B. Setbacks. The minimum setback area for each lot is:
Front yard - 25 feet
Rear yard - 15 feet

Side yard - 10 feet

City of Fulshear
Manufactured Home Ordinance
Page 18



No Manufactured Home or structure in a Manufactured Home Subdivision shall be
located within the yard setback area.

C. Parking Requirements. In addition to providing for two off-street parking
spaces per Manufactured Home lot, areas designed for common facilities shall provide a
minimum of one parking space per one hundred (100) square feet of gross floor area.

Section 8. Manufactured Home Parks. The following requirements shall apply in

addition to the general requirements of Section 6, to Manufactured Home Parks.
A. Lot Size. Each lot for a Manufactured Home shall be a minimum of fifty feet
(50°) in width, and a minimum of one hundred and fifty feet (150°) in depth. Lots for common
facilities shall be of such a size to meet the minimum setback areas below, and such that no
more than fifty percent (50%) of such lot is covered by building area, exclusive of parking.
B. Setbacks. The minimum setback area for each space is:
Front yard - 15 feet
Rear yard - 15 feet
Side yard - 10 feet
No Manufactured Home or structure in a Manufactured Home Subdivision shall
be located within the yard setback area.

C. Parking Requirements: In addition to providing for two off-street parking

spaces per Manufactured Home lot, areas designed for common facilities shall provide a
minimum of one parking space per one hundred (100) square feet of gross floor area. One (1)

additional parking space shall be provided for each Manufactured Home lot shown on the site

City of Fulshear
Manufactured Home Ordinance
Page 19



plan. A maximum of six of the additional parking spaces may be grouped together at various
locations throughout the Manufactured Home Park.

D. Responsibilities of Park licensee:

1L The licensee or licensee’s agent shall operate the park in compliance with
this and other applicable ordinances and shall provide adequate supervision to maintain
the park and all facilities in good repair, and in clean and sanitary condition.

2, The licensee or agent shall notify park occupants of all applicable
provisions of this Ordinance and inform them of their duties and responsibilities under
this Ordinance.

3. Maintenance of Park. The owner of the park shall be responsible to
ensure that it is maintained in a manner, which will not attract or aid the propagation of
insects or rodents or create a hazard. Growth of plant material such as weeds and
grass, especially beneath Manufactured Home and other structures shall be continuously
controlled. All streets, parking and storage areas shall be maintained to provide a fully
paved surface.

4. Office. Every Manufactured Home Park shall have an office in which a
copy of the park license shall be posted and the park register shall be in such office. It
shall be the duty of the licensee to keep a register of park occupancy, which shall
contain the following information:

a. Name and address of owner and occupant;
b. The make, model, serial number, year, and dimensions of all

Manufactured Homes; and

City of Fulshear
Manufactured Home Ordinance
Page 20



3. The date of arrival and departure of each Manufactured Home.

4. The park operator shall submit the park register to the City Council each
year upon requesting license renewal and shall make said register available to any
authorized City official upon reasonable request. Upon gaining knowledge of a
departure of any Manufactured Home, the park operator shall notify the City tax
assessor. Failure to do so shall place the operator in violation of this Ordinance.

3. Ordinance Compliance. It shall be the responsibility of the licensee to
ensure that all requirements of this Ordinance are met and maintained. Any
Manufactured Home Park issued an initial license after adoption of this Ordinance that
is found to be in violation of any provisions of this Ordinance shall be notified in
writing by the City Council in accordance with Section 12 hereof and, upon failure to
comply, said license shall be revoked.

E. Responsibilities of Manufactured Home Occupants:

1 The Manufactured Home occupant shall comply with all requirements of
this Ordinance.

¢ The Manufactured Home occupant shall be responsible for proper
placement of his Manufactured Home on its Manufactured Home pad and proper
installation of all utility connections in accordance with the instruments of the park
management.,

3. The use of space immediately beneath a Manufactured Home for storage

shall not be permitted.

City of Fulshear
Manufactured Home Ordinance

Page 21



F. Only Manufactured Homes shall be permitted in a Manufactured Home Park; no
mobile homes shall be permitted in a Manufactured Home Park, except as provided in Section
3C hereof.

G. Access; Traffic Circulation: Parking:

1. Internal streets shall be privately owned, built, and maintained. Streets
shall be désigned for safe and convenient access to all spaces and facilities for common
use of park residents.

2. All internal streets shall be constructed to the standards and
specifications in the City’s Subdivision Ordinance.

3 All driveways shall be constructed of concrete and shall be durable and
well drained under normal use and weather conditions.

4. Internal streets shall be named, and each individual lot for use for a
Manufactured Home or common facilities shall be numbered. Street signs and numbers
shall be of standard size and placement to facilitate location by emergency vehicles.

5. Lighting. The internal streets, parking lots, walks, and service areas
shall be lighted at all times so the development shall be safe for occupants and visitors;
provided, further, all entrances and exits shall be lighted.

6. Ingress and Egress. Each development shall have a minimum of two
points of ingress and egress for access by emergency equipment. A single
entranceway, if it is composed of a divided roadwéy, having two lanes separated by a

landscaped median, will meet this requirement.

City of Fulshear
Manufactured Home Ordinance
Page 22



Section 9. Use of Manufactured Homes for Nonresidential Purposes. Manufactured

Homes may be used only for the following nonresidential purposes. When a permit is issued
under Section 4 for a Manufactured Home to be occupied as one of the following uses, no
residential use of any portion of that same lot shall be permitted.

A. Temporary Construction Offices. Manufactured Homes may be parked at a

construction site for use as a field office during the period of construction. The Manufactured
Home must be removed within thirty days after the construction at the site is completed.

B. Commercial Uses.  Manufactured Homes may not be utilized for commercial

establishments on a temporary or permanent basis, except as provided in subsection A above.

C. Conform to Codes. All Manufactured Homes to be used for temporary

construction purposes shall conform without limitation to the codes and ordinances of the City,
and all applicable laws of the State of Texas.

E. Location of Manufactured Homes and Accessory Structures. No Manufactured

Home or accessory structure such as a refuse container, carport cabana, awning, fence, or
storage locker shall be permitted within ten feet (10°) of a private or public street or the
boundary line of a Manufactured Home lot or tract upon which it is located.

F. Height requirements.

1. The height limit for any Manufactured Home structure intended for
commercial or business occupancy shall be thirty-five feet (35°).

2. The average height of the Manufactured Home frame above ground
clevation, measured at 90° to the frame, shall not exceed four feet (4°) from the top of
the pad.

City of Fulshear

Manufactured Home Ordinance
Page 23



Section 10.  Nonconforming Mobile Homes, Manufactured Home Parks and

Manufactured Home Subdivisions.

A. Any Manufactured Home Subdivision or Manufactured Home Park which is
more than fifty percent (50%) constructed and occupied on the effective date of this Ordinance,
and which does not comply with all applicable provisions of this Ordinance shall be considered
a nonconforming Manufactured Home Subdivision or Park. Nonconforming Parks shall
comply with the requirements of Section 5, Licenses, hereof.

B. Any addition of land to a nonconforming Manufactured Home Subdivision or
Manufactured Home Park must conform to all requirements of this Ordinance.

C Any Manufactured Home Subdivision or Manufactured Home Park which is not
than fifty percent (50%) constructed and occupied on the effective date of this Ordinance, shall
comply with all provisions of this Ordinance, with the exception of lot size. The placement of a
Manufactured Home on any lot shown on a previously approved and filed plat, whether such
plat be for a Manufactured Home Subdivision or a Manufactured Home Park, which is vacant
as of the date of adoption of this Ordinance, and for which a permit is subsequently requested,
shall comply with all requirements of this Ordinance. A replat of the Manufactured Home
Subdivision or Manufactured Home Park may be required by the City Council to show
reservation of land for parking and recreational areas, or other requirements. Recreational
areas may also be reserved by separate instrument, filed of record with the County Clerk of

Fort Bend County.

City of Fulshear
Manufactured Home Ordinance
Page 24



Section 11.  Inspection. Any duly authorized inspector of the City shall be permitted

to make reasonable inspections of any Manufactured Home Subdivision or Manufactured Home

Park to determine compliance with this Ordinance.

Section 12.  Notice, Hearing, and Order. Whenever it is brought to the attention of

the City Council that there has been a violation of any provisions of this Ordinance, the City
Council shall, prior to a hearing on revocation of a permit, give notice of such alleged
violation to the permitee, licensee, or agent.

A. The Notice shall:

1. be in writing;
2. include a statement of the reasons for its issuance;
3. provide requirements, based upon the nature and severity of the violation

and having due regard for the safety and protection of the community, for actions to
correct the violation;

4. be served upon the proper party, as evidenced by the records; provided,
however, the notice shall be deemed to have been properly served when a copy thereof

has been sent by regular mail to the last known address; and

5. contain an outline of remedial action, which will correct the deficiency
or defect.
B. Hearing. If the violation is not remedied in accordance with the Notice, and a

violation of the Ordinance continues, then the City Council may, following a hearing before

the City Council, revoke any permits or licenses issued in addition to all remedies available to

City of Fulshear
Manufactured Home Ordinance
Page 25



it at Jaw or equity. This hearing procedure will not be necessary to enforce the provisions of

Section 13 of this Ordinance.

Section 13.  Penalty. Any person who shall violate any provision of this Ordinance

shall be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor and, upon conviction, shall be fined in an amount not to
exceed $2,000. Each day of violation shall constitute a separate offense.

Section 14.  Severability. In the event any clause phrase, provision, sentence, or part

of this Ordinance or the application of the same to any person or circumstances shall for any
reason be adjudged invalid or held unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, it shall
not affect, impair, or invalidate this Ordinance as a whole or any part or provision hereof other
than the part declared to be invalid or unconstitutional; and the City Council of the City of
Fulshear, Texas, declares that it would have passed each and every part of the same
notwithstanding the omission of any such part thus declared to be invalid or unconstitutional,
whether there be one or more parts.

Section 15.  Repeal. Ordinance No. 99-854 originally passed and approved the

day of , 1999, and as amended by Ordinance No. 99-857, passed and approved the
20" day of October, 1999 are all hereby repealed. All other ordinances or parts of ordinances
inconsistent or in conflict herewith are, to the extent of such inconsistency or conflict, hereby

repealed.

Section 16. _ Effective Date. This Ordinance shall be effective immediately upon its

passage, approval, and publication.

PASSED AND APPROVED this / < day of Qa/n 2 , 2002.
'y

City of Fulshear
Manufactured Home Ordinance
Page 26



ATTEST:

Ve Wi endeet [

Kathy May!field, City ﬁfécretary

City of Fulshear
Manufactured Home Ordinance
Page 27

Otodd il

Mithael Dinges, Mayor /

ALDERMEN VOTING

JOHN SMART
J. B. COLLINS, JR.
ROBERT FOX
BILL ARCHER
OWEN BEMENT

AYE
AYE
AYE
AYE
AYE




ORDINANCE NO. 02-885

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF FULSHEAR, TEXAS,
ESTABLISHING RULES AND REGULATIONS GOVERNING THE
CONSTRUCTION, ERECTION, MAINTENANCE AND USE OF SIGNS
WITHIN THE CORPORATE LIMITS OF THE CITY; APPLICATION OF
RULES AND REGULATIONS TO CITY’S EXTRATERRITORIAL
JURISDICTION; PROVIDING A PENALTY OF AN AMOUNT NOT TO
EXCEED $2,000 FOR EACH DAY OF VIOLATION OF ANY PROVISION
HEREOF; REPEALING ALL ORDINANCES OR PARTS OF
ORDINANCES INCONSISTENT OR IN CONFLICT HEREWITH;
PROVIDING FOR SEVERABILITY; AND CONTAINING OTHER
PROVISIONS RELATING TO THE SUBJECT.

* * * * * * * % * * *

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Fulshear, Texas (the “City™) finds that the
unregulated construction and erection of outdoor signs, billboards and other structures designed
to make an announcement to the general public can create structural hazards and can present
impediments and dangers to traffic along City roadways and easements, and

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Fulshear finds that portable signs present
special traffic hazards when towed on public streets or displayed on public rights-of-way and
present dangers to the health and safety of the citizens of the City;

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Fulshear recognizes that protection of the
City’s visual environment will benefit both residential and commercial property owners and will
promote a positive image of the City; and

WHEREAS, the City Council desires to promote the reasonable, orderly, and effective
display of signs and to ensure that signs do not create or become hazards; now therefore,
BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF FULSHEAR, TEXAS:

Section 1. The facts and recitations set forth in the preamble of this Ordinance are

found to be true and correct.

FULSHEAR/SIGNS.7/1/02



Section 2. The City of Fulshear, Texas (the “City”), adopts this Ordinance that
establishes rules and regulations relating to the construction, erection, maintenance and use of
signs within the City.

Section 3. Definitions. The following terms, when used in this Ordinance, shall have
the meanings ascribed to them herein, except where the context clearly indicates a different
meaning:

Ground sign shall mean any sign mounted on the ground or supported by one or more
columns, poles, uprights, or braces anchored in or on the ground and not attached to any
building, including reader panels.

Monument sign shall mean a ground sign mounted on the ground and not elevated above
the ground by any columns, poles, uprights, braces or any other device that holds the sign off the
ground.

Non-commercial sign shall mean a sign that contains a non-commercial message only.

Non-commercial message shall mean a civic, political, religious, seasonal, or personal
message that is not displayed for a fee, for compensation, or for the promotion of a product,
service or other business, and is located on property owned or lawfully occupied by the person
displaying the message.

Off-premise sign shall mean any sign, which directs attention to a business, person,
activity, good, product, service, or entertainment sold or offered elsewhere than on the premises
where such sign appears.

Portable sign shall mean any sign designed or constructed to be easily moved from one
location to another, including signs mounted upon or designed to be mounted upon a trailer,
wheeled carrier, or other nonmotorized mobile structure. A portable sign which has its wheels
removed shall still be considered a portable sign hereunder.

Sign shall mean any structure, part thereof, or inscription which is located upon, attached
to, or painted or represented on any land, or on the outside of any building or structure, or on an
awning, canopy, marquee, or similar appendage, or permanently affixed to the glass on the
outside of the building or structure, and which displays or includes any numeral, letter, word,
model, banner, emblem, insignia, symbol, device, monogram, heraldry, trademark, light, or other
representation used as or in the nature of an announcement, advertisement, attention arrestor,
direction, warning, or designation of any person, firm, group, organization, corporation,
association, place, commodity, product, service, business, establishment, profession, enterprise,
industry, activity, or any combination thereof; where the word sign is used herein without further
modification, the same shall be understood to embrace all regulated signs and replicas.

FULSHEAR/SIGNS.6/28/02 2



Snipe/Bandit sign shall mean a sign which is tacked, nailed, posted, pasted, glued, or
otherwise attached to a tree, stake, fence, utility pole, or other like object, the advertising matter
of which is not applicable to the present use of the premises on which the sign is located.

Temporary sign shall mean any sign constructed of materials with short life
expectancies. A portable sign shall not necessarily be considered a temporary sign.

Section 4. Sign construction and maintenance. All signs within the City shall
be erected and maintained in compliance with all applicable federal and state statutes and
regulations and with the building code, electrical code, and other applicable ordinances of the
City. In the event of conflict between this ordinance and other statutes, regulations or
ordinances, the most restrictive standard shall apply. All signs and sign structures shall be kept
in good repair and neat appearance. Maintenance shall be performed on all signs at reasonable
intervals, and shall include replacement of defective parts, painting, repainting, and cleaning.
The owner of a sign and the owner of the property upon which the sign is located shall be jointly
and severally responsible for the sign’s maintenance and repair. The Mayor of the City, or his
designee, shall inspect all signs and sign structures on a regular basis and shall require
maintenance or repair of any sign deemed in violation of this Section.

Section 5. Prohibited signs. It is unlawful for any person to construct, erect,
install, construct, display, maintain, reconstruct, place, locate, relocate or make use of any of the
following signs within the City:

A. Revolving or moving signs.

B. Signs that contain or have attached thereto banners, posters, pennants, ribbons,
streamers, strings of light bulbs, spinners, flash tags, or other similar devices.

C. Portable signs.

D. Snipe signs.

(OS]

FULSHEAR/SIGNS.6/28/02



N.

FULSHEAR/SIGNS.6/28/02

Signs located on a roof or otherwise attached to a building if it projects above
the highest point on the building.

Signs, or any portion thereof, that are located on or project or extend over any
public sidewalk, street, alley, or other public property.

Signs that are deteriorated, dilapidated, or unsafe.

Signs that contain statements, words, or pictures of an obscene, indecent, or
immoral character as will offend public morals or decency.

Signs located on or attached to a streetlight, utility pole, fire hydrant, bridge,
traffic-control device, street sign, or other building, facility, structure or
equipment owned by the City without the prior written consent of the City.

Any freestanding or ground sign which exceeds five feet (5°) in height from
natural ground level or thirty six (36) square feet in total area and which does
not conform to all regulations stated in this Ordinance governing “ground-
mounted monument signs;”

More than one ground-mounted monument for any lot or development site, or
for any individual shopping center or strip center; provided, however, if a lot
or development site, shopping center or strip center has frontage on two public
streets, one ground-mounted monument sign shall be permitted for each such
street frontage.

Signs that do not comply with this Ordinance or other ordinances of the City.

Signs located or illuminated so that they obscure or interfere with the
effectiveness of an official traffic sign, signal, or device, or obstruct or
interfere with the view of approaching, emerging or intersecting traffic, or
prevent any traveler on any street from obtaining a clear view of approaching
vehicles.

. MNluminated signs which:

1. Are illuminated to such intensity or without proper shielding so as
to constitute a hazard to the operation of motor vehicles upon a public street or
substantially interfere with the reasonable enjoyment of residential property;
or

2 Have any type of intermittent illumination, including flashing,
fading, revolving or blinking lights, or any type of moving, traveling or

changing message by means of lights or illumination.

Any sign that violates any sight visibility regulations of the City.



Q.

Section 6.

signs

FULSHEAR/SIGNS.6/28/02

Signs located in public rights-of-way.

Signs placed on private property without the consent of the owner of person in
possession of the property.

Off-premise signs.

Exceptions. This Ordinance shall not apply to the following types of

Governmental signs. Any sign:

Erected or maintained pursuant to and in discharge of any
governmental function;

Required by law, ordinance or governmental regulation; or

Located on property owned, leased, or under the control of any federal,
state or local governmental entity or subdivision thereof.

Private traffic control signs. Signs on private property containing no
advertising that direct the movement of traffic, warn of obstacles or
overhead clearances, or control parking, including entrance and exit signs.

Railway signs. Any sign on property owned by a railroad placed or
maintained in reference to the operation of the railway.

Utility and hazard signs. Any sign marking utility or underground
communication or transmission lines or pipes and hazards.

Plaques. Historical and commemorative plaques of recognized historical
societies and organizations, provided that such signs are less than fifteen
(15) square feet in total area.

Mailbox, address, and property identification signs. Signs displaying
addresses, names and other markers identifying the property located on
mailboxes, residences, and businesses, or at the entrance to the property,
provided that the sign simply identifies the occupants, business, or
property and does not advertise a product or service.

Vehicle signs. Signs displayed or used upon motor vehicles and trailers,
unless the vehicle or trailer is permanently stationed or regularly used at a
fixed location to serve the same or similar purpose of a permanent or
portable sign.



Section 7.

Real estate signs. Signs not exceeding six (6) square feet in total area per
sign face pertaining to the sale or rental of the property on which they are
displayed, provided, however, that no more than one such sign for each
street frontage shall be permitted.

Athletic field signs. Signs located on the field side of scoreboards and
fences of athletic fields.

Holiday signs and lights. Temporary signs, including Christmas lights,
containing only holiday messages and no commercial advertising.

Non-commercial signs. Signs advertising or promoting a candidate or
proposition in conjunction with an election, or otherwise containing a non-

commercial message, provided that:

1. No non-commercial sign shall be erected before forty-five (45)

days before the election date on which the office or proposition is to be
determined;

2. All such non-commercial signs shall be removed within seven (7)

days following the election on which the office or proposition is finally
determined in accordance with the Texas Election Code;

3. No such non-commercial sign shall exceed sixteen (16) square feet

in total area nor exceed six feet (6°) in height above natural ground level; and

4. Such temporary non-commercial sign shall otherwise comply with

all provisions of this Ordinance.

Obsolete signs. Signs which have been abandoned or have become

obsolete due to the closing of a business, change in the nature or name of the business

establishment, or for any other reason rendering the sign nonapplicable to the property upon

which it is displayed, shall be removed by the owner of the building or premises upon which it is

situated within sixty (60) days from the date of the action that caused the sign to be abandoned or

become obsolete.

Section 8.

A. Signs lawfully in existence as of the effective date of this ordinance pursuant to
City Ordinance No. 602 passed and approved on the 19™ day of November, 1991,

FULSHEAR/SIGNS.6/28/02



shall be considered and deemed as lawfully existing nonconforming signs and
may be continued as such. Notwithstanding the foregoing, the person or entity
who is in ownership or control of the property on which such sign is located shall
be required to obtain a permit for such sign and otherwise comply with all
requirements of this Ordinance relating to nonconforming signs and sign
structures.

B. Lawfully existing nonconforming signs shall be kept in good repair and visual
appearance and no structural alterations shall be made thereto. In the event that
more than fifty-percent (50%) of the area of a lawfully existing nonconforming
sign is damaged, the sign shall be removed, made to conform or replaced with a
conforming sign.

. When a nonconforming sign is replaced, the replacement sign must comply in all
respects with this Ordinance.

D. The installation of any new sign is prohibited on a site while a non-conforming
sign remains in use.

Section 9. Application to extraterritorial jurisdiction. The regulations established
this Ordinance are hereby applicable to all signs located in the extraterritorial jurisdiction of the
City, as established by Chapter 42 of the Texas Local Government Code.

Section 10.  Permits. It is unlawful for any person to place, locate, relocate, erect,
construct, replace or alter the size or shape of any sign, including the face or other integral part
thereto, or to thereafter make use of a sign without having first obtained a sign permit from the
City, except as otherwise provided in this Ordinance.

Section 11. Permit exemptions. A sign permit is not required:

A. To repaint a sign or to restore a conforming sign to its original condition if the
sign otherwise complies with this Ordinance;

B. To periodically change only the letters, numbers or message portion of a lawful
sign specifically designed for that purpose; or

&3 For the placement or use of a non-commercial sign.
Section 12.  Application and permits. The application for a sign permit, together

with an application fee in the amount of fifty and no/100 dollars ($50.00), shall be submitted on

FULSHEAR/SIGNS.6/28/02 7



such forms provided by the City and must be accompanied by the information, drawings and
descriptive data required by the City Secretary to ensure proper regulation of the sign and the
ensure compliance with this Ordinance.

Section 13.  Issuance of permits. If the plans and specifications for a sign set forth in
any application for a permit conform to all of the requirements of this Ordinance, and any other
applicable City regulations, the City Secretary shall issue the appropriate permit.

Section 14. Duration. Unless earlier revoked, a sign permit to construct, erect, locate,
or place is valid for 180 days from the date of issuance.

Section 15. Revocation. A sign permit may be revoked for violation of this
Ordinance. The City Secretary shall give prior written notice of a proposed revocation to the
permittee and an opportunity to respond to the reasons for revocation within ten (10) days of said
written notice. The permit shall not be revoked prior to the expiration of ten (10) days from the
date of such written notice.

Section 16. Appeal. Any person aggrieved by a decision of the City Secretary in the
application of this Ordinance may appeal the decision to the City Council of the City by
delivering, in writing, a notice of appeal stating therein the decision complained of and the
reasons for appeal. The City Council shall hear the appeal at its next regularly scheduled
meeting; provided, however, that the appeal shall be heard within thirty (30) days of the filing of
the appeal.

Section 17.  Penalty. Any person, corporation, or entity who or which violates any
provision of this Ordinance shall be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor and, upon conviction, shall
be fined in an amount not to exceed $2,000. Each day in which any violation shall occur, or each

occurrence of any violation, shall constitute a separate offense.

FULSHEAR/SIGNS.6/28/02 8



Section 18. Repealer. Ordinance No. 602 originally passed and approved the 19" day
of November, 1991 is hereby repealed. All other ordinances or parts of ordinances inconsistent
or in conflict herewith are, to the extent of such inconsistency or conflict, hereby repealed.

Section 19.  Severability. In the event any clause phrase, provision, sentence, or part of
this Ordinance or the application of the same to any person or circumstances shall for any reason
be adjudged invalid or held unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, it shall not affect,
impair, or invalidate this Ordinance as a whole or any part or provision hereof other than the part
declared to be invalid or unconstitutional; and the City Council of the City of Fulshear, Texas,
declares that it would have passed each and every part of the same notwithstanding the omission of

any such part thus declared to be invalid or unconstitutional, whether there be one or more parts.

PASSED, APPROVED, AND ADOPTED this / Ll[ day of C]//(,M/(/Q// , 2002.

2 sz%a

J. Michael Dinges, May

ATTEST: ALDERMAEN VOTING:

JOHN SMART — AYE
/ %(/ J B COLLINS, JR. — AYE

ROBERT FOX — AYE
Kathy Mq{yﬁeld Ci Secretary BILL ARCHER — AYE
OWEN BEMENT —AYE

FULSHEAR/SIGNS.6/28/02 9



ORDINANCE NO. 02-886

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF FULSHEAR, TEXAS, GRANTING
THE PETITION OF FOSTER CREEK ESTATES ASSOCIATION TO
INCLUDE CERTAIN DESCRIBED LAND IN THE
EXTRATERRITORIAL JURISDICTION OF THE CITY; EXPANDING
AND EXTENDING THE EXTRATERRITORIAL JURISDICTION OF
THE CITY TO INCLUDE ALL OF SUCH LAND, IN RESPONSE TO
SUCH PETITION AND IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 42.022 OF
THE TEXAS LOCAL GOVERNMENT CODE; PROVIDING FOR
SEVERABILITY; AND CONTAINING OTHER PROVISIONS RELATED
TO THE SUBJECT.

* % * % *

WHEREAS, Etta Palmer, acting as agent for the owners of homes in the Foster Creek
Estates Association, consisting of six tracts of land totaling 231.2014 acres of land, more or
less, which land is contiguous to the existing extraterritorial jurisdiction of the City of
Fulshear, Texas (the “City”), has filed a petition with the City Council of the City requesting
that the City extend its extraterritorial jurisdiction to include all of such land; and

WHEREAS, such land does not lie within the corporate limits of any other city, town,
or village, or within the extraterritorial jurisdiction of any city, town, or village; now,
therefore,

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF FULSHEAR, TEXAS:

Section 1. The facts and matters contained in the preamble of this Ordinance are
hereby found to be true and correct.

Section 2. The petition submitted to the City Council of the City on February 19,
2002, by Etta Palmer, acting as agent for the owners of the below described land, petitioning
and requesting the City to expand and extend its extraterritorial jurisdiction to include all of

such described land, is hereby granted.

FULSHEAR/ETJ/ORD/07/10/02



Section 3. The land to which such petition refers is more particularly described in
Exhibit “A” attached hereto and made a part hereof for all purposes.

Section 4. The extraterritorial jurisdiction of the City of Fulshear shall be, and the
same is hereby, extended in accordance with the terms of Section 42.022 of the Texas Local
Government Code, to include all of such land or territory described in Exhibit “A” attached
hereto.

Section 3. It is the City’s belief that all of the land subject to the aforesaid petition,
and described in Exhibit “A” attached hereto, lies outside the extraterritorial jurisdiction of
any other city, town, or village, and lies outside the corporate limits of any city, town, or
village, and, therefore, all of said land and territory may be included within the extraterritorial
jurisdiction of the City as provided for herein. It is, however, provided that if any portion of
said land subject to the aforesaid petition and described in Exhibit “A” attached hereto, does
lie within the extraterritorial jurisdiction of any other city, town, or village, or which does lie
within the corporate limits of any city, town, or village, is hereby specifically excluded from
the terms of this Ordinance and the intention of City Council is hereby expressed not to expand
its extraterritorial jurisdiction to encompass any land or territory presently included within the
extraterritorial jurisdiction of any other city, town, or village or presently included within the
corporate limits of any city, town, or village.

Section 6. In the event any section, paragraph, subdivision, clause, phrase,
provision, sentence, or part of this Ordinance or the application of the same to any person or
circumstance shall for any reason be adjudged invalid or held unconstitutional by a court of
competent jurisdiction, it shall not affect, impair, or invalidate this Ordinance as a whole or

any part or provision hereof other any part or provision hereof other than the part declared to

FULSHEAR/ETI/ORD/07/10/02 2



be invalid or unconstitutional; and the City Council of the City of Fulshear, Texas, declares
that it would have passed each and every part of the same notwithstanding the omission of any
and every part of the same notwithstanding the omission of any such part thus declared to be
invalid or unconstitutional, or whether there be one or more parts.

PASSED AND APPROVED on this the <3/ day of July, 2002.

C2 Q/M%ﬁ

l\/flchael Dinges
Mayor

ATTEST: ALDERMEN VOTING

JOHN SMART AYE
J. B. COLLINS, JR. AYE

ROBERT FOX AYE
/dpé;,, %U M,{,&/ / BILL ARCHER AYE
Kathy Mayfield OWEN BEMENT AYE
City Secretary

FULSHEAR/ETI/ORD/07/10/02 3



B7-a83-82 16:38 OLSON & OLSON » FULSHEAR NO.@44 POB5-@83

TRACT Xt

Peginning at the Northwest ceozner of a certsin 3.0 Acrm
gract as desoribed in Volume 59, Page 396 and Volume 473, Pages
654-658, maid point baing the northsasst corner and Place of Beginning
of the herein described 128.10% Acxs Tract, said point aleo heing
in the South lina ©f tha Don F. McMillian tract as described in
Volume 493, Page 396, Yort Bend County Deed Records)

THENCE Bouth 21°02% East along the West line of the aforementioned
call 3.0 Acre Tract, 30.B fest to an Iron Rod set for the momt Bamtarly .
Eoutheast corner of the herein describad 128.109 Acze Tract, said
point also being the Bouthwest corner of a 0.278 Aere Trmot being a
part of an emsement am described in deed from Jennie V. Caldwell
to ‘Rhea Bwanason, recorded in Volume 475, Page 654, Fort Band County
Deed Racordsj

THENCE South 67°33° West 30 feet from and parallel to the North
line of that certain call 224.6 Acre Tract (as described in Deed
recorded in Volume 59, Page 396 of the Deed Racords of Fort Bend
County, Taxes), 915,29 feet to ma 1-1/4 inoh fron Pipe set for a
reentry corner to the herein descaribed 128.109 Aore Trast)

THENCE Bouth along a line establishing the Basst line of the
hersin described 128.10% Acre Tract, at 4362.34 Zeet pass a 1-1/4
inch Izom Pipe mpt on tha top bank of Jonas Craek, and gontinwing for
a total distence of 4562.34 feat to 5 point in the centerline of Jonas
Cramk for the Boutheamt cornar of the herein described 128.109 Acre
Tract}

irazucx upstrsam with tha centarline mesandera of Jones Creask,
to-wit: :

South 49°58'31" West, 70.18 feat,

Bouth 65°23'05" Waest, 120.94 faet,

Boath 70%41'33" West, 176.10 feet,

Bouth 76°43'31" West, 204,37 fest,

South 84°30'25" West, 331.68 fast, and

North 78231°00® Wast, 391.74 feat to a point in the centerliine
of Jonegs Czeek for the Scuthwest corner of the hersln described
126.109 Acra Tract; same being the Bouthwmst cernexr of the afore-
mentioned call 224.6 Acras Tract)

THENCE North 00°236°'15" East along a fence lipe as located on ,
the Wast line of the aforementioned call 224.6 Acre Tract, at 211.32
feet paEs @ 1-1/4 inch Izon Pipe et on the top hank of Jones Creek,
and continuing for a total distance of 1594.42 feet to a 1-1/4 inch
Iron Plpe set at an angle peint on said lines

THEHCE NWorth 00%09°'14" East alony a fence line as located on
the Wast line of the aforsmentioned call 224.6 Acre Tract, at 158
faet pass the centerline of Jones Creek, at 2582 fest pass the center-
iline of Jones Creek, and continuing for a total distance of 2690.09
feat to & 3/4 Inoch Irenm Pipe found for the Northwest corner of the
harein described 128.10% Rera Tract, same being the Northwest cornar
of the aforementioned call 224.6 Acre Tract, said point also being
a8 corner of the Don F, MaMillien tract as dascribed {n Volume 493,
Page 3196, Fort Bend County Dsed Recerds)

' [ i o
THENCE North 67°33° East alony a fence line a® located on the
North lins of the herein described 128.10% Acras Traot, same being a
South line of the aforementioned Don F. MeMillimn Trect, 2227.41
fast to the FLACE OF BEGINNING asnd containing 128.109 scres of land.

; EXHIBIT “A” . °
Page 1 of §



a7-83-82 16:58 OLSDN & OLSON -+ FULSHEAR NO.B844 POB6-BG3

TRACT IIi

A 1.8037 Acre Tract of land, 0.5422 acre being out of a certain
3.00 Acre Tract described im Volumes 44, Pags ¢99 of the Desd Records,
and 1.2618 acres being a part of that ceztain called 224.6 Aares Tract
dascribed in Desd from John E. Rosenbush to Rhee Swanson, recordad
in Volume 332, Page 195 of the Fort Band County Desd Racords.

BEGINRING at a 3 inch Iron Pipe found at the Northeamt corner of
said 224.6 Acre Tract, same being the Worthwest cozner of that car- .
tain 3.00 Acra Tract and the Noxtheast corner of the 128.109 Acre
Tract dasoribed as Tract I abova being a part of tha 224.6 .hAcye
Travky |

PHENCE Soukh €7°33' West along the North line of said 224.6
Acce Tract, same being the North line of the 128.109 Acre Tract,
903.32 feet to @ 1-1/4 inch Iron Pipe found on aaid line for the
Northwest corner of the herein desoribed 1,8037 Aore Tract;

THENCE South along an Bast line of the 128.109 Aore Trmckt, 64.895
foet to a point on Bald line for the Southwest corner of tha hereln
described 1.8037 JAcre Tractk;

THENCE Nortll 67°33° Bast, $27.48 fest to an angle point in the
South lina of thé herein described tract, said point being in the
East line of the;22¢.6 Acra Tract, same baing the West line of sald
3.00 Acre Tractk)® ’ : :

TRENCE Nortll 67°20' East, 393.51 feet to a point in the Westerly
right-of-way lind of P.M. Highway 359 for the Southsast coxner of the

.hezein describedil.B037 Acke Tract;

THENCE NortM 21°51'20" West mlong the Westerly xight-of-way line
of gaid F.M. Highway 359, 60 fpet to B point on said line for the
Northeant aorneriof the harein described 1.8037 Rere Tract;

-
THERCE Soutl 67°20' West, 393.49 feet to the PLACE OF BEGINNING
and containing 1$eu37 acxes of land.

EXHIBIT “A”
Page 2 of §




B7-83-82 16:58 OLSON & OLSON -+ FULSHEAR ND.944 PBA7-083

A 4.7982 Acre Tract of land (Lot 1, Fostht Cresk Edtates)
being a part of a 128.109 Acre Tract of land {described as Tract
I above) in the John Foster 2-1/2 Leaguee Grant, Abstract 26,

Port Bend County, Texas, sald 128.109 Acre Tract being a part of
that cartain oalled 224.6 Acre Tract as described in Deed recoyded
in Volume 89, Page 396, Fort Bapd County Deed Recozrds, Port Bend
County, Texas,

COMMENCING at an Iron Pipe found at the Northwest corner of "
said 128.109 Aare Tract, same being the Bouthwest cormer of the ‘
Don P, McMillian traet (am described in Volums 493, Page 396 of
the Daed Records of Port Band County, Texas) adjoining maid 128.108
Acre Tract on its North aide)

THENCE Noxth 68°00' East mlong the common line of the afore-
mantioned 126.109 Acze Tract and the Don P. McMilliamn Trace, (96.53
feet to an Iron Pipe set on sadd line for the Northwest corner and
PLACE QF BBGINNING of the harein demcribed 4.7%832 Acxreg Tract;

THENCE continuing North 68°00' East along the common line of

-said 126.109% Acre Tract and the Don F. MeMillian Traect, 827,45

feet to an Iron Pipe found on said line for the Northeast corner

of the hersin described 4.7982 Acre Tract, same being the North- — =~
east corner of the aforamentioned 128:109 Acre Tracty . ) )

THEWCE Bouth along an East line of said 128.109 Acre Tract, ————

33.32 feat to an Iron Pipe set on said line for corner, said point

baing in the ocenterline of a 60 foot wide yoad (described in Volumae -~ -
952, Page 703 of ' the Deed Records of Fort Pend County, Texas) and "‘
on the beginning of a curve to tha left;

THENCE around said curve to the left with a central angle of
37°09'08", a radius of 59.51 feet, a tangent of 20 feet, an arc
length of 38.59 feet and a chord bearing South 48°14°33" West,
37.92 feet to the point of tangency of said curve;

THENCE continuing along the centerline of said 60 fopoe wide
road, South 29°40' West, 736.19 feet to an Iron Pipe met st the
- Point of intersection of this centerline of said 60 foot wide road
and the canterline of a 60 foot wids road baaring South 43°58°*
East for the Bouthwest corner of the herein desoribed ¢.7592 Acre
Tracty

THENCE North 43°58' West along the centerline of the sscond
mantioned 60 foot wide road, mt 20D fast pess an Iron Pips met at
the radiuvs of a 50 foot radius eul-de-sac at the end of gaid 60
fuot wide road and continuing for a total distance of 539.49 feet
to the PLACE OF BEGINNING and containing 4.7982 Acres of land.

EXHIBIT “A”
Page Jof §




- BA9
@7-83-62 16:99 OLSON & OLSON » FULSHEAR NO.Bd44 PBBB-8g

¥4.4879 acecas of land in ehe Jéhn Foster z-i;z Le;gue Grant
Abstract No. 26, Fort Bend County, Texes, being mors pnrticulnrx§
described 28 Tract T apgd Tract 1T, as followss A

Tract 1

*94,1955 scre tract of land in the John Poster 3 1/2 Leagues Grant,
Abstract 26, Fort Bend County, Texas, being the residus of a 93,00
acre tract ‘of lend being m part of a called 224.6 ecre tract
,fescribed in Deed from J. G. Hunken to Walter Rogsnbush, tecordeq
+in VYolume 59, Pagq 398, and in Deed from John E. Rosenbush to Rhes - ¢
15wanson, recordedi'in Volume. 352) ‘Page 195, Port Bend County Deesd
Recoyds, and a 2.0226 acre tract of lend being the residve of the
Julife Brown called 3.00 acre trsat being of record in Volume $9,
- -Pageg 396, and Volums. 475, Page 54, Deed Recovds, Fort Bend
Cousty, Texss. e .
'BEGIRNING at en iron pipe set in the Westerly line of. F.M. Wighwa
3594 for the Noztheﬁﬂg,eornet of PLACE or Bgalﬂﬁxua of the hzrnii
... Gesdribed tract, ssme being the Southeast corner of a certain
© " D.8332 mcre .tract of land being an easement conveyed to 0l1fe R.
Hewilliame and-recorded in Veolums $31, Fage 258, Fort Bend county
Desdl ‘Recordsy : .

ru:&c: South 67° 20° West slong the Northerly line of the herein
destribed 94.1955 .c;l,tknq;, same being the Southerly line of the
afokementioned 0.5432 acre traet, 393.94 feet to an lgon pipe set
for? a re-entry cocner to the herein described 94.1955 acre tract,
samk ‘bedng the Southwest -corner of the aforementioned 0.3432 acre
Loty

THENCE Worth 21° 02! west along the Westerly line of snid 0.5432

..acre tract, 30.15 feet to an irom pipe set In wmid line for
corner, said point being the Southeast cocrner of a certain 0.6343
acre track of land being an -essement conveyed to Ollie R.
HeWilliams and recorded in Volume %31, Page 258, Fort Bend County
Desd Recordsy ’ ’

THENCE South 66° 4B' 41" West along the Northerly line of the
‘Tthin described 94.1955 acre tract, same being the Southerly line
of the aforementicned 0.86343 acre tract, 928.83 feet to an iron
pipe found for the Worthwest corner of the herein described tract,
sama being the Souvthwest corner of the aforementioned D.6343 ncre
tract and being iocated fn the Eest line of a certain 128,109 acre ..
tract (Foster Creek Estatem Bection Iy

TUENCE South along the West line of the herein Adesccibed tract,
sams belng the East line of the aforementiensd adjolining 128.10%
acre trect, at 43435.41 feet pass a )Y 1/4 inch iron pipe found on
said line, and continuing for & total distapce of 4530,71 fest to
a point in the canterline of Jomes Crank for the Southwest corner
of the hereln described 94,1955 acre tract, same being the
Southeast corner of the aforamsntioned sdjolning 128.109 acve

THEWCE along the centerline .of Jones Crsek with its mesnders,
to-wits . .

North 49° 58' 45" East, 194,91 feaks
North 31° 38° 53° past, 352.88 featy
Horth 41° 02° S2° East, 167.18 foet;
North S0° 45' S8? East, 98,34 taety -

EXHIBIT “A"
Page4of 5




B7-03-82 16:59 OLSON & DLSON » FULSHERR NO.B44 PaBS-BE9

North 55 41°¢ 33° East, 180.40 fcot: and '
North 62° 20° 56° East, 426.53 fest to a polnt for the
- Bouthasast corper of the harein describld trmcty

THENCE North 00° 05' 05" past along tha Eamt line of the herein
describad tract, at 162.78 feet past a ly-inch irom pipe found

on said line, and continuing for a total distance of 1075.72 feet.
to a point for an angle point in said line;

THENCE Nerth 00° 20° 09" Bast continuing along the East line of
the herain desaribad tract,. 1128.81° feet to .a 14-inch iren pipl
found for co:ner?

THENCE Worth 88° -29° 04~ West, 208.03 ttct to a lh =inch iron
pipe found foxr corner;

THENCE North 43° 10°' 18" West, 99.5 feet to & 14-inch iron pipe
found at a rn—entry aorna: to tha harein described tract)

THENCE North 00° 14' S5 past, 1382, 97 feat to a lk-inch iron
pipe !ound at a rn—ent:y cornar to the herein deserxibed tract:

' THENCE North 68° 247 11° East, 573.56, feet to a ly-inch iron
pipe found in the Weaterly line of F.M. Highway 3395 for cocner:

THENCE North 2i° 51' 20" Waest along the w-ntﬁrly right-cf-way line
[ot ¥.M. Highway 339, 256.47 feet to the PLACE OF BEGINNING and con-
taining 24.1955 acres of land, more or less.

I

;Tract IX:

Field notex for a 0.2724-acra tract of land out of a called 0.5432~-
acre traot of land in the John Fostsr 2% Leagues Grant, Abstyract No.
26, Fort Bend County, Texams, said called 0.5432-acre tract being that
same tract of land described as Tract "B" in Dsed recoxrded in Volume
631, page 252, Fort Bend County Deed Raecords, and also belng a part
of that certain 1.00-acre tract of land dsscribed in Volume 59, page
396, and Volume 475, pages 654-655, Fort Bend County Deed Records.

BEGINNING at an ivon pipe set in the Westerly line of F.M., Highway
3%% for the 8Southeast corner and place of Beglnning of the herein
describad tract, said polint being tha Southeast corner of the ntarn-
mentioned called 0.5432-acre tracts

"THENCE South §7° 20' West along the Southerly line of said called
0.5432-acre tract, 393.94 feet to a point in thes Westerly line of
the aforementionad’called 3.00-scre tract for tha Southwest cor-
ner of the herain described 0.Z724-acre tract;

THENCE North 21° 02' West along the Westerly line of said 3.00-acre
track, 30.15 feet to a point for the Northwest corner of the herein
degseribed 0.2724-acre tract;

THENCE North 877 20' Bast, 393,51 feot to & point in ths Westorly
line of F.M. 359 for the Northeast corner of tha herein describad
tract;

THENCE Seuth 21° S1' 20" East along the Westerly line of ¥.M. Wigh-
way 352, 30.14 feet to the PLACE OF BEGINNING and containing 6.2724
acres of land, more or less.

e b

EXHIBIT “A™
Page Sof 5 ' l
i



ORDINANCE NO. _ 02-887

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF FULSHEAR, TEXAS, PROVIDING FOR THE
ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, 2000 EDITION (NON-
RESIDENTIAL), AS PUBLISHED BY THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL,
INC.: PROVIDING REGULATIONS RELATING TO THE CONSTRUCTION,
ALTERATION, ENLARGEMENT, REPLACEMENT, AND REPAIR OF
BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES WITHIN THE CITY; PROVIDING CERTAIN
AMENDMENTS AND DELETIONS TO SAID INTERNATIONAL BUILDING
CODE; ESTABLISHING FEES FOR THE ISSUANCE OF PERMITS; PROVIDING A
PENALTY OF AN AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED $2,000 FOR EACH VIOLATION
OF ANY PROVISION HEREOF; REPEALING ORDINANCE NO. 545, PASSED
AND APPROVED ON JANUARY 19, 1981, AS AMENDED, AND ALL OTHER
ORDINANCES OR PARTS OF ORDINANCES INCONSISTENT OR IN CONFLICT
HEREWITH; AND PROVIDING FOR SEVERABILITY.

* *k * * *

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF FULSHEAR, TEXAS:

Section 1. The International Building Code. The International Building Code, 2000

Edition (non-residential), hereinafter sometimes referred to as the “Code,” as published by the

International Code Council, Inc., is hereby adopted. A copy of said Code is attached hereto and

made a part hereof for all purposes, an authentic copy of which has been filed with the City

Secretary.

Section 2. Amendments to the International Building Code.

(1) Section 103 of said Code is hereby deleted and a new Section 103 is substituted

therefor as follows:

“103 Department of Building Safety. The enforcement of this code shall be
under the administrative and operational control of the building official. The
building official shall have such duties, and shall be selected and serve in the
position at the pleasure of the City Council and may be removed without cause
by City Council. The building official may appoint deputies to assist him/her,
subject to City Council approval. Said deputies shall serve at the pleasure of the
city council and may be removed without cause by City Council.”

2) Section 104 of said Code is hereby deleted and a new Section 104 is substituted

therefor as follows:

FULSHEAR/ORD/INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE 2000



“104 Powers and Duties of the Building Official.

104.1 General. The building official is hereby authorized and directed to
enforce all of the provisions of this code. The building official shall have the
power to render interpretations of this code and to adopt and enforce written
rules and supplemental regulations in order to clarify the application of its
provisions. Such interpretations, rules and regulations shall be in conformance
with the intent and purpose of this code.

104.2 Right of Entry. When it is necessary to make an inspection to enforce
the provisions of this code, or when the building official has reasonable cause to
believe that there exists in a building or upon its premises a condition which is
contrary to or in violation of this code which makes the building or premises
unsafe, dangerous, or hazardous, the building official may request entry. If
entry is refused, the building official shall have recourse to the remedies
provided by law to secure entry.

104.3 Stop Orders. Whenever any work is being donme contrary to the
provisions of this code the building official may order the work stopped by
notice in writing served on any persons engaged in the doing or causing such
work to be done, and any such persons shall stop work until authorized in
writing by the building official to proceed with the work.

104.4 Modifications. When there are practical differences involved in carrying
out the provisions of this code, the building official may grant modifications for
individual cases. The building official must find that a special reason makes the
strict letter of this code impractical and that modification is in conformance with
the intent and purpose of this code, and that such modification does not lessen
accessibility, health, life and fire safety, or structural integrity. The details of
any action granting modifications shall be written and recorded and entered in
the files of the City.

104.5 Alternate Materials, Alternative Design and Methods of Construction.
The provisions of this code are not intended to prevent the use of a naterial,
alternate design, or method of construction not specifically prescribed by this
code, provided any alternate has been approved by the building official.

The building official may approve any such alternate, provided the building
official finds that the proposed material, design, or method is satisfactory and
complies with the provisions of this code and that the material and method of
work offered is, for the purpose intended, at least equivalent of that prescribed
in this code in suitability, effectiveness, fire resistance, durability, and safety.

The building official shall require that sufficient written evidence or proof be
submitted to substantiate any claims that may be made regarding an alternate.

Fulshear/Ord/International Building Code 2000



The details of any action granting approval of an alternate shall be written and
recorded and entered in the files of the City.

104.6 Tests. Whenever there is insufficient evidence of compliance with any
of the provisions of this code or evidence that any material or work does not
conform to the requirements of this code, the building official may require tests
as proof of compliance to be made at no expense to the City.

Test methods shall be as specified by this code or other recognized test
standards. If there are no recognized and accepted test methods for the
proposed alternate, the building official shall determine test procedures.

All tests shall be made by an approved agency. Reports of such tests shall be
retained by the building official for the period required for the retention of
public records.”

3) Sections 105.1, 105.1.1, and 105.1.2 of said Code are hereby deleted in their
entirety.

) Section 105.2 of said Code is hereby amended by deleting the exemptions listed
1 through 13 under “Building” and replacing said list as follows:

«105.2 Work exempt from permit.

Building:
1. Sidewalks and decks.

2. Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, countertops, or
similar finish work.

3. Prefabricated swimming pools accessory to a group R-3
'occupancy, which are less than twenty-four inches (247)
deep, do not exceed five thousand (5000) gallons, and are
installed above ground.

4. Swings and other playground equipment accessory to one and
two family dwellings.”

) Section 105.5 of said Code is hereby deleted and new Section 105.5 is substituted
therefor as follows:

“105.5. Expiration: No construction schedule.  Every permit issued shall
become invalid unless the work at the site authorized by such permit is

Fulshear/Ord/International Building Code 2000



commenced within 180 days after its issuance. The building official is
authorized to grant, in writing, an extension or extensions of such permit,
provided the maximum term of said permit shall not exceed one and one-half (1-
1/2) years. If any permitted work is not completed within this limitation, then
the permit shall become invalid and must be reissued in order to resume work,
together with payment of fees for such reissued permit.

Work pursuant to a construction schedule. A permit may be issued for a
reasonable period of time, which coincides with a written construction schedule
prepared by a licensed architect or engineer, and filed with the City. The
building official is authorized to grant, in writing, an extension or extensions of
such permit, provided the maximum term of said permit shall not exceed two (2)
years. If any permitted work is not completed within this limitation, the permit
shall become invalid and must be reissued in order to perform or resume work,
together with payment of fees for such reissued permit.”

(6) Section 105 of said Code is hereby amended by adding a new Section 105.9,
which provides as follows:

“105.9 Liability Insurance. The person or entity that will actually perform the
work or services covered by a permit shall provide to the City evidence of
comprehensive general liability insurance, issued by a company licensed to do
business in Texas, in the following amounts, for the duration of the permit, and
shall furnish certificates of insurance to the City as evidence thereof.  The
certificates shall provide that the insurance shall not be canceled, reduced, or
changed without 30 days advance notice to the City.

Comprehensive general liability insurance covering all risks associated with the
work, with a minimum bodily injury limit of $100,000, $300,000 per
occurrence, and a property damage limit of $400,000, or a property damage
limit equal to or exceeding the amount of the contract amount, whichever is
greater.”

@) Section 108.2 of said Code is hereby deleted and a new Section 108.2 is
substituted therefor as follows:

“Section 108.2  Schedule of permit fees. For buildings, structures, or
electrical, gas, mechanical, and plumbing systems or alterations thereof
requiring a permit, a fee for each permit shall be paid as required, in accordance
with the City of Fulshear’s Fee Schedule, as it may be amended from time to
time by City Council.”

(8) Section 108.4 of said Code is hereby deleted and a new Section 108.4 is
substituted therefor as follows:

Fulshear/Ord/International Building Code 2000



“108.4 Work commencing before permit issuance. The fee for work commenced
without a permit shall be double the fee set forth in the fee schedule adopted by
the City.”

) Section 110.1 of said Code is hereby deleted and a new Section 110.1 is
substituted therefor as follows:

“110.1 Use and Occupancy. No Building or structure shall be used or occupied,
and no change in the existing occupancy classification of a building or structure or
portion thereof shall be made, until the building official has issued a certificate of
occupancy therefor as provided herein. '

Issuance of a certificate of occupancy shall not be construed as an approval of a
violation of the provisions of this code or of other ordinances of the City.
Certificates presuming to give authority to violate or cancel the provisions of this
code or other ordinances of the City shall not be valid.”

(10)  Section 112.1 of the Code is hereby deleted and new Section 112.1 is substituted
therefor as follows:

“112.1. Appeals. Appeals of orders, decisions, or determinations made by the
City’s building official in interpreting or applying this Code shall be to the City
Council. The City Council may obtain the assistance of persons who are qualified
by experience and training on a particular subject under consideration.”

(11)  Section 112.3 of the Code is hereby deleted in its entirety.

(12)  Section 113 of the Code is deleted in its entirety and the penalty provision of
this Ordinance is substituted in its place.

(13)  Section 903, entitled “Sprinkler Systems” is hereby deleted.

(14)  Sections 1507.8 and 1507.9 of said Code are hereby amended by deleting both
sections in their entirety and a new Section 1507.8 is hereby substituting therefor to provide as
follows: ‘

“1507.8 Wood Shingles and Shakes.

(a) Allowed roof coverings of any structure regulated by this
International Building Code shall be as provided in this Sectiomn.

(b) Wood shingles and shakes are not allowed, shall not be allowed as

an alternative material, and shall not be installed or used on any new
construction or re-roofing of any structure.

Fulshear/Ord/Intemational Building Code 2000



c) Existing structures which have wood shingles or shakes may be
repaired with fire-retardant shingles or shakes of a comparable grade;
however, owners shall have the option of installing any allowed Class A,
Class B, or Class C roofing material, over the existing wood shingles and
shakes, providing the existing roof structural system is adequate for
modification. “Repair” means the replacement of damaged or destroyed
shingles or shakes, provided the area repaired does not exceed twenty-five
percent (25 %) of the square foot surface area of the roof. A wood shingle
or shake roof may not be replaced with wood shingles or shakes in
increments which are undertaken as repairs.”

The following Appendices contained in the International Building Code are deleted

their entirety:

Appendix A, Employee Qualifications;

Appendix B, Board of Appeals;

Appendix D, Fire Districts;

Appendix H, Signs;

Appendix I, Patio Covers; and

Appendix G, Manufactured Homes.

Appendices C, E, F, and J contained in such Code are hereby adopted.

Section 4. Future Amendments., Future amendments of said International Building
Code, 2000 Edition, not including clarifications or technical notices of any type, are not adopted
by this Ordinance and must be subsequently approved and adopted by the City Council.

Section 5. Effect of Code. This Code shall not be construed to relieve or lessen the
responsibility of any person owning, operating, or controlling any building or structure for any
damages to persons or property caused by defects, nor shall the City Council, the City, its agents
or representatives assume any such liability by reason of these regulations or the inspections
authorized by this Code or any permits or certificates issued under this code.

Section 6. Penalty. Any person, corporation, or entity who or which violates any

provision of this Ordinance shall be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor and, upon conviction, shall

Fulshear/Ord/International Building Code 2000



be fined in an amount not to exceed $2,000. Each day in which any violation shall occur, or
each occurrence of any violation, shall constitute a separate offense.

Section 7. Repealer. Ordinance No. 545, passed and approved the 19th day of
January, 1981, as amended, and all ordinances or parts of ordinances inconsistent or in conflict
herewith, are, to the extent of such inconsistency or conflict, hereby repealed.

Section 8. Severahility. In the event any clause, phrgse, provision, sentence, or part
of this Ordinance or the application of the same to any person or circumstance shall for any
reason be adjudged invalid or held unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, it shall
not affect, impair, or invalidate this Ordinance as a whole or any part or provision hereof other
than the part declared to be invalid or unconstitutional; and the City Council of the City of
Fulshear, Texas, declares that it would have passed each and every part of the same
notwithstanding the omission of any such part thus declared to be invalid or unconstitutional,
whether there be one or more parts.

PASSED, AND APPROVED AT A REGULAR MEETING OF THE CITY COUNCIL
OF THE CITY OF FULSHEAR, HELD ON THE 2/ DAY OF 4(/;.;’ Js7- ,2002.

OW(%/;

Mike Dinges, Mayor
City of Fulshear

ATTEST:

Ve (a% Drpiees A

Kathy May/ﬁeld,, C1t/ &/ecretary

City of Fulshear
ALDERMEN VOTING
JOHN SMARF AYE
J. B. COLLINS, JR. AYE
ROBERT FOX AYE
BILL ARCHER AYE

Fulshear/Ord/International Building Code 2000 OWEN BEMENT AYE



ORDINANCE NO. 072-888

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF FULSHEAR, TEXAS PROVIDING
FOR THE ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE,
2000 EDITION, AS PUBLISHED BY THE INTERNATIONAL CODE
COUNCIL, INC.; PROVIDING FOR REGULATIONS RELATING TO THE
CONSTRUCTION, ALTERATION, ENLARGEMENT, AND REPAIR OF
RESIDENTIAL BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES WITHIN THE CITY;
PROVIDING CERTAIN AMENDMENTS AND DELETIONS TO SAID
INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE; ESTABLISHING FEES FOR
THE ISSUANCE OF PERMITS; PROVIDING A PENALTY OF AN
AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED $2,000 FOR EACH VIOLATION OF ANY
PROVISION HEREOF; REPEALING ALL ORDINANCES OR PARTS OF
ORDINANCES INCONSISTENT OR IN CONFLICT HEREWITH; AND
PROVIDING FOR SEVERABILITY.

% * * * % *

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF FULSHEAR, TEXAS:

Sﬁcimn_l The International Residential Code. The International Residential Code,
2000 Edition, hereinafter sometimes referred to as the “Code,” as published by the International
Code Council, Inc., is hereby adopted. A copy of said Code is attached hereto and made a part
hereof for all purposes, an authentic copy of which has been filed with the City Secretary.

(1)  Section R103 of said Code is hereby deleted in its entirety and a new Section R103

is substituted therefor as follows:

“R103 Department of Building Safety. The enforcement of this code
shall be under the administrative and operational control of the building official.
The building official shall have such duties, and shall be selected and serve in the
position at the pleasure of the City Council and may be removed without cause by
City Council. The building official may appoint deputies to assist him/her, subject
to City Council approval. Said deputies shall serve at the pleasure of the City
Council and may be removed without cause by City Council.”

2 Section R104 of said Code is hereby deleted in its entirety and a new Section R104

is substituted therefor as follows:

HCV/ORD/ INT RESIDENTIALCODE 2000
8/8/02



“R104 Duties and Powers of the Building Official.

R104.1 General. The building official is hereby authorized and
directed to enforce all of the provisions of this code. The building official
shall have the power to render interpretations of this code and to adopt and
enforce written rules and supplemental regulations in order to clarify the
application of its provisions. Such interpretations, rules and regulations
shall be in conformance with the intent and purpose of this Code.

R104.2 Right of Entry. When it is necessary to make an
inspection to enforce the provisions of this Code, or when the building
official has reasonable cause to believe that there exists in a building or
upon its premises a condition which is contrary to or in violation of this
code which makes the building or premises unsafe, dangerous, or
hazardous, the building official may request entry. If entry is refused, the
building official shall have recourse to the remedies provided by law to
secure entry.

R104.3 Stop Orders. Whenever any work is being done contrary
to the provisions of this code the building official may order the work
stopped by notice in writing served on any persons engaged in the doing or
causing such work to be done, and any such persons shall stop work until
authorized in writing by the building official to proceed with the work.

R104.4 Modifications. When there are practical differences
involved in carrying out the provisions of this Code, the building official
may grant modifications for individual cases. The building official must
find that a special reason makes the strict letter of this Code impractical
and that modification is in conformance with the intent and purpose of this
code, and that such modification does not lessen accessibility, health, life
and fire safety, or structural integrity. The details of any action granting
modifications shall be written and recorded and entered in the files of the

City.

R104.5 Alternate Materials, Alternative Design and Methods
of Construction. The provisions of this code are not intended to prevent
the use of a material, alternate design, or method of construction not
specifically prescribed by this Code, provided any alternate has been
approved by the building official.

The building official may approve any such alternate, provided the
building official finds that the proposed material, design, or method is
satisfactory and complies with the provisions of this Code and that the
material and method of work offered is, for the purpose intended, at least
equivalent of that prescribed in this code in suitability, effectiveness, fire
resistance, durability, and safety.

HCV/ORD/ INT RESIDENTIALCODE 2000

8/8/02



The building official shall require that sufficient written evidence
or proof be submitted to substantiate any claims that may be made
regarding an alternate. The details of any action granting approval of an
alternate shall be written and recorded and entered in the files of the City.

R104.6 Tests. Whenever there is insufficient evidence of
compliance with any of the provisions of this code or evidence that any
material or work does not conform to the requirements of this Code, the
building official may require tests as proof of compliance to be made at no
expense to the City.

Test methods shall be as specified by this Code or other recognized
test standards. If there are no recognized and accepted test methods for the
proposed alternate, the building official shall determine test procedures.

All tests shall be made by an approved agency. Reports of such
tests shall be retained by the building official for the period required for
the retention of public records.

3 Section R105.2 of said Code is hereby amended by deleting exemptions listed as
numbers 1 through 5 under the heading “Building.”

(4)  Section R105.5 of said Code is hereby deleted in its entirety and a new Section
R105.5 is substituted therefor as follows:

“R105.5 Expiration: No construction schedule. Every permit issued
shall become invalid unless the work at the site authorized by such permit is
commenced within 180 days after its issuance. The building official is authorized
to grant, in writing, an extension or extensions of such permit, provided the
maximum term of said permit shall not exceed one and one-half (1-1/2) years. If
any permitted work is not completed within this limitation, then the permit shall
become invalid and must be reissued in order to resume work, together with
payment of fees for such reissued permit.”

6)) Section R105 of said Code is hereby amended by adding a new Section R105.10,
which provides as follows:

“R105.10 Liability Insurance. The person or entity that will actually
perform the work or services covered by a permit shall provide to the City
evidence of comprehensive general liability insurance, issued by a company
licensed to do business in Texas, in the following amounts, for the duration of the
permit, and shall furnish certificates of insurance to the City as evidence thereof.

HCV/ORD/ INT RESIDENTIALCODE 2000
8/8/02 3



The certificates shall provide that the insurance shall not be canceled, reduced, or
changed without 30 days advance notice to the City.

Comprehensive general liability insurance covering all
risks associated with the work, with a minimum bodily
injury limit of $100,000, $300,000 per occurrence, and a
property damage limit of $400,000, or a property damage
limit equal to or exceeding the amount of the contract
amount, whichever is greater.”

(6) Section R108 of the Code is amended by adding to section R108.2 the following
provision:

“R108.2 Schedule of permit fees. Fees shall be charged in accordance
with the City’s Fee Schedule, as it may be amended from time to time.”

(7) Section R108 of said Code is hereby amended by adding a new Section R108.6,
which provides as follows:

“R108.6 Work commencing before permit issuance. The fee for work
commenced without a permit shall be double the fee set forth in the fee schedule
adopted by the City.”

® Section R110.1 of said Code is deleted in its entirety and a new Section R110.1 is
substituted therefor, which provides as follows:

“R110.1 Use and Occupancy. No Building or structure shall be used or
occupied, and no change in the existing occupancy classification of a building or
structure or portion thereof shall be made until the building official has issued a
certificate of occupancy therefor as provided herein.

Issuance of a certificate of occupancy shall not bé construed as an approval
of a violation of the provisions of this code or of other ordinances of the City.
Certificates presuming to give authority to violate or cancel the provisions of this
code or other ordinances of the City shall not be valid.”
) Section R112.1 of the Code is hereby deleted and new Section 112.1 is substituted

therefor as follows:

“112.1. Appeals. Appeals of orders, decisions, or determinations made by
the City’s building official in interpreting or applying this Code shall be to the City

HCV/ORD/ INT RESIDENTIALCODE 2000
8/8/02 4



Council. The City Council may obtain the assistance of persons who are qualified
by experience and training on a particular subject under consideration.”

(10)  Section R112.3 of the Code is hereby deleted in its entirety.

(11)  Section R113 of the Code is deleted in its entirety and the penalty provision of

this Ordinance is substituted in its place.

(12)  Sections R905.7 and R905.8 of the Code are deleted in their entirety and a new

Section R905.7 is substituted therefor as follows:

“R905.7 Wood Shingles and Shakes

() Allowed roof coverings of any structure regulated by this Code shall
be as provided in this Section.

(b)  Wood shingles and shakes are not allowed, shall not be allowed as
an alternative material, and shall not be installed or used on any new
construction or re-roofing of any structure.

Existing structures which have wood shingles or shakes may be repaired
with fire-retardant shingles or shakes of a comparable grade; however, owners shall
have the option of installing any allowed Class A, Class B, or Class C roofing
material, over the existing wood shingles and shakes, providing the existing roof
structural system is adequate for modification. “Repair” means the replacement of
damaged or destroyed shingles or shakes, provided the area repaired does not
exceed twenty-five percent (25%) of the square foot surface area of the roof. A
wood shingle or shake roof may not be replaced with wood shingles or shakes in
increments which are undertaken as repairs.”

The following Appendix contained in the Code is deleted its entirety:
“Appendix E, Manufactured Housing Used As Dwellings”
Appendices A through D, and F through K contained in the Code are hereby

adopted.

HCV/ORD/ INT RESIDENTIALCODE 2000

8/8/02



Section 4. Future Amendments. Future amendments (not including clarifications or
technical notices of any type) of said International Residential Code, 2000 Edition, are not
aaopted by this Ordinance, and must be subsequently approved and adopted by the City Council.

Section 5.  Effect of Code. This Code shall not be construed to relieve or lessen the
responsibility of any person owning, operating, or controlling any building or structure for any
damages to persons or property caused by defects, nor shall the City Council, the City, its agents
or representatives assume any such liability by reason of these regulations or the inspections
authorized by this code or any permits or certificates issued under this code.

Section 5. Penalty. Any person, corporation, or entity who or which violates any
provision'of this Ordinance shall be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor and, upon conviction, shall
be fined in an amount not to exceed $2,000. Each day in which any violation shall occur, or each
occurrence of any violation, shall constitute a separate offense.

Section 6. Repealer. All ordinances or parts of ordinances inconsistent or in conflict
herewith, are, to the extent of such inconsistency or conflict, hereby repealed.

Section 7. Severability. In the event any clause, phrase, provision, sentence, or part of
this Ordinance or the application of the same to any person or circumstance shall for any reason be
adjudged invalid or held unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, it shall not affect,
impair, or invalidate this Ordinance as a whole or any part or provision hereof other than the part'
declared to be invalid or unconstitutional; and the City Council of the City of Fulshear, Texas,
declares that it would have passed each and every part of the same notwithstanding the omission of

any such part thus declared to be invalid or unconstitutional, whether there be one or more parts.

PASSED, AND APPROVED AT A REGULAR MEETING OF THE CITY COUNCIL
OF THE CITY OF FULSHEAR, HELD ONTHE .2/ DAY OF ,4J/Qd§7’ 2002.

HCV/ORD/ INT RESIDENTIALCODE 2000
8/8/02 6



C/ /%//% pc

Miﬁe Dinges, Mayor
City of Fulshear

ATTEST:

/ o Wz, (/w/o//

Kathy May/ﬁeld City Séé/ etary
City of Fulshear

ALDERMEN VOTING

JOHN SMART AYE
J. B. COLLINS, JR. AYE
ROBERT FOX AYE
BILL ARCHER AYE
OWEN BEMENT AYE

HCV/ORD/ INT RESIDENTIALCODE 2000
8/8/02 7



! ) DLW O ANTVIVAVYVEL - "' A et AL S5

Rﬁ&\&ﬂﬁ\o& Code 0283

THE STATE OF TEXAS  §
COUNTY OF FORT BEND §

Before me, the undersigned authority, on this day personally appeared Clyde C. King, Jr. who being by
me duly sworn, deposes and says that he is the Publisher of The Herald-Coaster and that said newspaper
meets the requirements of Section 2051.044 of the Texas Government Code, to wit:

1. it devotes not less than twenty-five percent (25%) of its (CLIPFING) (3)

total column lineage to general interest items; ¥
2. itis published at least once each week; T ARENANCE NGRS
AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY.OF

FULSHEAR, TEXAS ; FHOVIDING

ipl : SFORTHE: ADOPTION OF THE'IN+'

3. itis entered as second-class postal matter in the county %%RNAT,ONALE et i
[ . . ".CODE,: 2000 DITION ‘A5 PUB-"

where it is published; and LISHED BY THE INTERNATIONAL

~CODE:. COUNGIL;INC.; PROVID;
-INGFOR: REGULATIONS HELAT
ING:TO. THE . CONSTRUGCTION;:

4. it has been published regularly and continuously since ALTERATION, _ENLAFGEVENT,
1892. “BUILDING.>/AND ',:STHUCTUHES
WITHIN: THE “CITY;  PROVIDING

*CERTAIN : AMENDMENTS - 'AND
DELETIONS TO - SAID. INTERNA-

5. itis generally circulated within Fort Bend County. é};gfg;mgs'gggg ";ggggg os
:‘SUANCE . OF PERM!TS PROVID-
PE ' OF AN

Publisher further deposes and says that the attached notice “EACH VIOLATIONOF |
VISION HEREOF; REPEALING

was published in said newspaper on the following date(s) to wit: AL ORDINANGES OR PARTS OF

ZORDINANCES . INCONSISTENT:
SORIN CONFLICT HEREWITH;:
AND' PROV!DING FOR SEVERA

q ) )9\-‘!09\/ BILITY.

,A.D. 2002

%%Q/Q/'

Cly e C. King, Jr.
Editor and Publisher

SUBSCRIBED AND SWORN BEFORE ME by
Clvde C. King, Jr. , who

X ____a)is personally known to me, or
b) provided the following evidence to establish
his/her identity,

on this the \ [—_day of %whm b(Lr ,A.D. 2002,

to certify which witness my hand and seal of office.

T oLt

Notary Public, State of Texas

R CEEES)
%

WARIE CANDELA
NOTARY PU
STATE OF TI

Wy Commission Expires




ORDINANCE NO. 02-889

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF FULSHEAR, TEXAS,
ESTABLISHING RULES AND REGULATIONS GOVERNING THE
CONSTRUCTION, ERECTION, MAINTENANCE AND USE OF SIGNS
WITHIN THE CORPORATE LIMITS OF THE CITY; APPLICATION OF
RULES AND REGULATIONS TO CITY’S EXTRATERRITORIAL
JURISDICTION; PROVIDING A PENALTY OF AN AMOUNT NOT TO
EXCEED $2,000 FOR EACH DAY OF VIOLATION OF ANY PROVISION
HEREOF; REPEALING ORDINANCE NO. 02-885, ADOPTED THE 14™
DAY OF JUNE, 2002 AND REPEALING ALL ORDINANCES OR PARTS
OF ORDINANCES INCONSISTENT OR IN CONFLICT HEREWITH;
PROVIDING FOR SEVERABILITY; AND CONTAINING OTHER
PROVISIONS RELATING TO THE SUBJECT.

% % * * * * * * * * *

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Fulshear, Texas (the “City”) finds that the
unregulated construction and erection outdoor signs, billboards and other structures designed to
make an announcement to the general public can create structural hazards and can present
impediments and dangers to traffic along City roadways and easements, and

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Fulshear finds that portable signs present
special traffic hazards when towed on public streets or displayed on public rights-of-way and
present dangers to the health and safety of the citizens of the City;

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Fulshear recognizes that protection of the
City’s visual environment will benefit both residential and commercial property owners and will
promote a positive image of the City; and

WHEREAS, the City Council desires to promote the reasonable, orderly, and effective
display of signs and to ensure that signs to not create or become hazards; now therefore,

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF FULSHEAR, TEXAS:

FULSHEAR/SIGNS.10/1/02



Section 1. The facts and recitations set forth in the preamble of this Ordinance are
found to be true and correct.

Section 2. The City of Fulshear, Texas (the “City”), adopts this Ordinance that
establishes rules and regulations relating to the construction, erection, maintenance and use of
signs within the City.

Section 3. Definitions. The following terms, when used in this Ordinance, shall have
the meanings ascribed to them herein, except where the context clearly indicates a different
meaning:

Monument sign shall mean any sign mounted on the ground or supported by one or
more columns, poles, uprights, or braces anchored in the ground, but not elevated above the
ground by any device that holds the sign off the ground and not attached to any building,
including reader panels.

Non-commercial sign shall mean a sign that contains a non-commercial message only.

Non-commercial message shall mean a civic, political, religious, seasonal, or personal
message that is not displayed for a fee, for compensation, or for the promotion of a product,
service or other business, and is located on property owned or lawfully occupied by the person
displaying the message.

Off-premise sign shall mean any sign, which directs attention to a business, person,
activity, good, product, service, or entertainment sold or offered elsewhere than on the premises
where such sign appears.

Portable sign shall mean any sign designed or constructed to be easily moved from one
location to another, including signs mounted upon or designed to be mounted upon a trailer,
wheeled carrier, or other nonmotorized mobile structure. A portable sign which has its wheels
removed shall still be considered a portable sign hereunder.

Sign shall mean any structure, part thereof, or inscription which is located upon, attached
to, or painted or represented on any land, or on the outside of any building or structure, or on an
awning, canopy, marquee, or similar appendage, or permanently affixed to the glass on the
outside of the building or structure, and which displays or includes any numeral, letter, word,
model, banner, emblem, insignia, symbol, device, monogram, heraldry, trademark, light, or other
representation used as or in the nature of an announcement, advertisement, attention arrestor,
direction, warning, or designation of any person, firm, group, organization, corporation,
association, place, commodity, product, service, business, establishment, profession, enterprise,

FULSHEAR/SIGNS.10/1/02 2



industry, activity, or any combination thereof; where the word sign is used herein without further
modification, the same shall be understood to embrace all regulated signs and replicas.

Snipe sign shall mean a sign which is tacked, nailed, posted, pasted, glued, or otherwise
attached to a tree, stake, fence, utility pole, or other like object, the advertising matter of which is

not applicable to the present use of the premises on which the sign is located.

Temporary sign shall mean any sign constructed of materials with short life
expectancies. A portable sign shall not necessarily be considered a temporary sign.

Section 4. Form, structure, construction and maintenance of signs.

A. Purpose. It is the stated purpose of this ordinance to allow reasonable
signage for commercial and free speech activities, while managing the structural and aesthetic
elements of such communication.

B. Design. All signs permitted by this ordinance shall be designed and
constructed in one of two formats. All signage is required be approved by Planning and
Development Commission prior to construction.

1. Monument Signs. Monument signs shall be constructed to
substantially appear as a solid mass, such as cylinder, block, rectangle, or square from
ground level to the highest portion of the sign, otherwise commonly known as Monument
Signs. The bottom portion of the sign structure shall rest flush against the ground,
allowing no space between the ground and the bottom of the sign structure. The portion
of the sign containing the message shall not exceed 72 total square feet of area. The total
height of the sign, including the sign structure and the portion containing the message of
the sign, shall not exceed ten feet (10°).

2. Facgade or wall signs. Facade or wall signs shall be allowed provided there
is no more than one such sign per street frontage for each business located within a

discreet portion of a building. Fagade or wall signs may be mounted or painted upon the

FULSHEAR/SIGNS.10/1/02 3



wall, and must be maintained in good condition at all times. The sign shall contain

information identifying the business located on site. The sign area shall not exceed ten

percent (10%) of the area of the fagade or wall on which it is mounted or painted.

B. Maintenance. All signs within the City shall be erected and maintained in
compliance with all applicable federal and state statutes and regulations and with the building
code, electrical code, and other applicable ordinances of the City. In the event of conflict
between this ordinance and other statutes, regulations or ordinances, the most restrictive standard
shall apply. All signs and sign structures shall be kept in good repair and neat appearance.
Maintenance shall be performed on all signs at reasonable intervals, and shall include
replacement of defective parts, painting, repainting, and cleaning. The owner of a sign and the
owner of the property upon which the sign is located shall be jointly and severally responsible
for the sign’s maintenance and repair. The Mayor of the City, or his designee, shall inspect all
signs and sign structures on a regular basis and shall require maintenance or repair of any sign
deemed in violation of this Section.

Section 5. Prohibited signs. It is unlawful for any person to construct, erect,
install, construct, display, maintain, reconstruct, place, locate, relocate or make use of any of the
following signs within the City:

A. Revolving or moving signs.

B. Signs that contain or have attached thereto banners, posters, pennants, ribbons,
streamers, strings of light bulbs, spinners, flash tags, or other similar devices.

C. Portable signs.
D. Snipe signs.

E. Signs located on a roof or otherwise attached to or painted on a building if it
projects above the highest point on the building.

FULSHEAR/SIGNS.10/1/02 4



Signs, or any portion thereof, that are located on or project or extend over any
public sidewalk, street, alley, or other public property.

Signs that are deteriorated, dilapidated, or unsafe.

Signs that contain statements, words, or pictures of an obscene, indecent, or
immoral character as will offend public morals or decency.

Signs located on or attached to a streetlight, utility pole, fire hydrant, bridge,
traffic-control device, street sign, or other building, facility, structure or
equipment owned by the City without the prior written consent of the City.

More than one monument sign for any lot or development site, or for any
individual shopping center or strip center; provided, however, if a lot or
development site, shopping center or strip center has frontage on two public
streets, one monument sign shall be permitted for each such street frontage.

Signs that do not comply with this Ordinance or other ordinances of the City.

Signs located or illuminated so that they obscure or interfere with the
effectiveness of an official traffic sign, signal, or device, or obstruct or
interfere with the view of approaching, emerging or intersecting traffic, or
prevent any traveler on any street from obtaining a clear view of approaching
vehicles.

. Nluminated signs which:

I Are illuminated to such intensity or without proper shielding so as
to constitute a hazard to the operation of motor vehicles upon a public street or
substantially interfere with the reasonable enjoyment of residential property;
or

2 Have any type of intermittent illumination, including flashing,
fading, revolving or blinking lights, or any type of moving, traveling or

changing message by means of lights or illumination.

Any sign that violates any sight visibility regulations of the City.

O. Signs located in public rights-of-way.

FULSHEAR/SIGNS.10/1/02

Signs placed on private property without the consent of the owner of person in
possession of the property.

Off-premise signs.



Section 6.
signs

A.

FULSHEAR/SIGNS.10/1/02

Exceptions. This Ordinance shall not apply to the following types of

Governmental signs. Any sign:

Erected or maintained pursuant to and in discharge of any
governmental function;

Required by law, ordinance or governmental regulation; or

Located on property owned, leased, or under the control of any federal,
state or local governmental entity or subdivision thereof.

Private traffic control signs. Signs on private property containing no
advertising that direct the movement of traffic, warn of obstacles or
overhead clearances, or control parking, including entrance and exit signs.

Railway signs. Any sign on property owned by a railroad placed or
maintained in reference to the operation of the railway.

Utility and hazard signs. Any sign marking utility or underground
communication or transmission lines or pipes and hazards.

Plaques. Historical and commemorative plaques of recognized historical
societies and organizations, provided that such signs are less than fifteen
(15) square feet in total area.

Mailboxes; and addresses: Addresses and names printed on a standard
size mailbox.

Vehicle signs. Signs displayed or used upon motor vehicles and trailers,
unless the vehicle or trailer is permanently stationed or regularly used at a
fixed location to serve the same or similar purpose of a permanent or
portable sign.

Real estate signs. Signs not exceeding six (6) square feet in total area per
sign face pertaining to the sale or rental of the property on which they are
displayed, provided, however, that no more than one such sign for each
street frontage shall be permitted.

Athletic field signs. Signs located on the field side of scoreboards and
fences of athletic fields.

National or state flags. A national or state flag, or both, provided that
they do not exceed thirty-six (36) square feet in total area.



Section 7.

Holiday signs and lights. Temporary signs, including Christmas lights,
containing only holiday messages and no commercial advertising.

Non-commercial signs. Signs advertising or promoting a candidate or
proposition in conjunction with an election, or otherwise containing a non-
commercial message, provided that:

1. No non-commercial sign shall be erected before forty-five (45)
days before the election date on which the office or proposition is to be
determined;

2. All such non-commercial signs shall be removed within seven (7)
days following the election on which the office or proposition is finally
determined in accordance with the Texas Election Code;

3. No such non-commercial sign shall exceed sixteen (16) square feet
in total area nor exceed six feet (6”) in height above natural ground level; and

4. Such temporary non-commercial sign shall otherwise comply with
all provisions of this Ordinance.

Property identification signs. Any sign erected at the entrance of
acreage or residential property that identifies the property by name of the
property or by name of the owner, as in the case of farm or ranch
identification signs.

Temporary banners. One temporary sign, in the form of a banner, not to
exceed five feet (5°) in height or thirty-two (32) total square feet in sign
area may be displayed on nonresidential property by a new business for a
period not to exceed ninety (90) days. One temporary sign, in the form of
a banner, not to exceed five feet (5°) in height or thirty two (32) total
square feet in sign area may be displayed on nonresidential property by a
business one time during any given calendar year for a period not to
exceed twenty-one (21) days.

Non-profit announcement signs.  Signs announcing events or
programs by not-for-profit organizations not to exceed five feet (5°) in
height or thirty-two (32) total square feet in sign area, so long as the sign
is erected no more than fourteen (14) days prior to the event being
announced and is removed no more than seven (7) days following the
event.

Obsolete signs. Signs which have been abandoned or have become

obsolete due to the closing of a business, change in the nature or name of the business

FULSHEAR/SIGNS.10/1/02



establishment, or for any other reason rendering the sign nonapplicable to the property upon

which it is displayed, shall be removed by the owner of the building or premises upon which it is

situated within sixty (60) days from the date of the action that caused the sign to be abandoned or

become obsolete.

Section 8.

A.

Signs lawfully in existence as of the effective date of this ordinance pursuant to
City Ordinance No. 602 passed and approved on the 19" day of November, 1991,
shall be considered and deemed as lawfully existing nonconforming signs and
may be continued as such. Notwithstanding the foregoing, the person or entity
who is in ownership or control of the property on which such sign is located shall
be required to register such signs with the City, at no fee, and otherwise comply
with all requirements of this Ordinance relating to nonconforming signs and sign
structures.

Lawfully existing nonconforming signs shall be kept in good repair and visual
appearance and no structural alterations shall be made thereto. In the event that
more than fifty-percent (50%) of the area of a lawfully existing nonconforming
sign is damaged, the sign shall be removed, made to conform or replaced with a
conforming sign.

When a nonconforming sign is replaced, the replacement sign must comply 1in all
respects with this Ordinance.

The installation of any new sign is prohibited on a site while a non-conforming
sign remains in use.

Section 9. Application to extraterritorial jurisdiction. The regulations established

this Ordinance are hereby applicable to all signs located in the extraterritorial jurisdiction of the

City, as established by Chapter 42 of the Texas Local Government Code.

Section 10. Permits. It is unlawful for any person to place, locate, relocate, erect,

construct, replace or alter the size or shape of any sign, including the face or other integral part

thereto, or to thereafter make use of a sign without having first obtained a sign permit from the

City, except as otherwise provided in this Ordinance.

Section 11. Permit exemptions. A sign permit is not required:

FULSHEAR/SIGNS.10/1/02 8



A. To repaint a sign or to restore a conforming sign to its original condition if the
sign otherwise complies with this Ordinance;

B. To periodically change only the letters, numbers or message portion of a lawful
sign specifically designed for that purpose; or

G For the placement or use of a non-commercial sign.

Section 12.  Application and permits. The application for a sign permit, together
with an application fee in the amount of fifty and no/100 dollars ($50.00), shall be submitted on
such forms provided by the City and must be accompanied by the information, drawings and
descriptive data required by the City Secretary to ensure proper regulation of the sign and the
ensure compliance with this Ordinance.

Section 13.  Issuance of permits. If the plans and specifications for a sign set forth in
any application for a permit conform to all of the requirements of this Ordinance, and any other
applicable City regulations, the City Secretary shall issue the appropriate permit.

Section 14. Duration. Unless earlier revoked, a sign permit to construct, erect, locate,
or place is valid for 180 days from the date of issuance. |

Section 15. Revocation. A sign permit may be revoked for violation of this
Ordinance. The City Secretary shall give prior written notice of a proposed revocation to the
permittee and an opportunity to respond to the reasons for revocation within ten (10) days of said
written notice. The permit shall not be revoked prior to the expiration of ten (10) days from the
date of such written notice.

Section 16. Appeal. Any person aggrieved by a decision of the City Secretary in the
application of this Ordinance may appeal the decision to the City Council of the City by
delivering, in writing, a notice of appeal stating therein the decision complained of and the

reasons for appeal. The City Council shall hear the appeal at its next regularly scheduled

FULSHEAR/SIGNS.10/1/02 9



meeting; provided, however, that the appeal shall be heard within thirty (30) days of the filing of
the appeal.

Section 17.  Penalty. Any person, corporation, or entity who or which violates any
provision of this Ordinance shall be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor and, upon conviction, shall
be fined in an amount not to exceed $2,000. Each day in which any violation shall occur, or each
occurrence of any violation, shall constitute a separate offense.

Section 18. Repealer. Ordinance No. 02-885 originally passed and approved the 19
14" day of June, 2002 is hereby repealed. All other ordinances or parts of ordinances inconsistent
or in conflict herewith are, to the extent of such inconsistency or conflict, hereby repealed.

Section 19.  Severability. In the event any clause phrase, provision, sentence, or part of
this Ordinance or the application of the same to any person or circumstances shall for any reason
be adjudged invalid or held unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, it shall not affect,
impair, or invalidate this Ordinance as a whole or any part or provision hereof other than the part
declared to be invalid or unconstitutional; and the City Council of the City of Fulshear, Texas,
declares that it would have passed each and every part of the same notwithstanding the omission of
any such part thus declared to be invalid or unconstitutional, whether there be one or more parts.

PASSED, APPROVED, AND ADOPTED this % day of -DER7EIT BER, 2002.

QWM%

4 Michael Dinges, Mayo

ATTEST:

John Smart AYE

/) . — J.B. Collins - AYE
ol / Y / Bill Archer - AYE
/(Q’z:;/é"-{ %t’-/k/{(’é{f P Robert Fox - AYE

Kathy Mayfield, City Seffetary Owen Bement - AYE

FULSHEAR/SIGNS.10/1/02 10



ORDINANCE NO. 02-890

AN ORDINANCE APPROVING AND ADOPTING THE CITY OF
FULSHEAR, TEXAS, GENERAL BUDGET FOR THE FISCAL YEAR
2003; MAKING APPROPRIATIONS FOR THE CITY FOR SUCH YEAR
AS REFLECTED IN SAID BUDGET; AND CONTAINING OTHER
PROVISIONS RELATING TO THE SUBJECT.

* * * *® *

WHEREAS, within the time and in the manner required by law, the Mayor presented to
the City Council a proposed general budget of expenditures of the City of Fulshear for the 2002-
2003 fiscal year; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to a motion of the City Council and after notice required by law, a
public hearing on such general budget was held at the regular meeting place of the City Council
at the Town Hall of the City of Fulshear, 30603 F.M. 1093, on the 18th day of September 2002,
at which hearing all citizens and taxpayers of the City had the right to be present and to be heard
and those who requested to be heard were heard; and

WHEREAS, the City Council has considered the proposed general budget and has made
such changes therein as in its judgment were warranted by law and were in the best interest of the
citizens and taxpayers of the City; and

WHEREAS, a copy of such general budget has been filed with the City Secretary and the

City Council now desires to approve and adopt the same; now, therefore,

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF FULSHEAR, TEXAS:
Section 1. The facts and recitations set forth in the preamble of this Ordinance are

hereby found to be true and correct.

FULSHEAR/ ’02-°03 BUDGET.ORD/9/12/02



Section 2. The City Council hereby approves and adopts the general budget described
in the preamble of this Ordinance, a copy of which is attached hereto and made a part of this
Ordinance for all purposes and a copy of which is on file with the City Secretary. The City
Secretary is hereby directed to place on said budget an endorsement, which shall be signed by the
City Secretary, which shall read as follows:

"The Original General Budget of the City of Fulshear, Texas, for the Fiscal Year 2002-2003."
Such budget, as thus endorsed, shall be kept on file in the office of the City Secretary as a public
record.

Section 3. In support of said budget and by virtue of the adoption thereof, including
any and all changes adopted thereto, the several amounts specified for the various purposes
named in said budget are hereby appropriated to and for such purposes.

PASSED, APPROVED, AND ADOPTED this 18th day of September 2002.

OW(%%

J. Michael Dinges

Mayor
ATTEST: ALDERMEN VOTING
JOHN SMART AYE
e o BILL ARCHER AYE
Mﬂi g’/ J B COLLINS, JR. AYE
/M OWEN BEMENT AYE
Kathy Mayfield (/i ROBERT FOX ABSENT

City Secretary

FULSHEAR/ '02-'03 BUDGET.ORD



aleq

~<o47%

(oooLv'gze) ¢ veveo'slk ¢ (ovLL) $ SP'6LO'PSLS - (1apun) 18A0 BnUBA3Y SpPUNy paulquIo)
(005Z9°L¥L) $ LP'8es's $ (0Z'229'62) $ (zg'128'2) ¢ (oo00Z'vs) ¢ aNN4d 3SIIdYALNT :aNn4d
(00'582981) $ €£6'S80°'S0L § 08'SL9'6Z $ 1Z°168°19L $ 0000Z'vS $ (1apun) JaAo anuaasy pund |eiauag
oo'svz'séy $ S.L¥8e's0L $ 0Z65Z°0¥E $ €£12E6'SSL $ 00°052'26Z $ sosuadx |ejo]
00002'042 $ 10°899'62 $ 00°G.6'¥%. $ 8yolz'ez ¢ o06se'zel ¢ s}eans
00'0F¥'L  $ ZE08E'L ¢ o000Fe'S $ 1999 $ o00vLL9 0§ Juswedsq sJuBYS
000S9'0L $ S¥'E59'¥ $ oveLeLl $ o¥.i8r¥'LlL $ 0080£ZF $ HNOoY |edpiuniy
00'856'v02 $ .6'289'69 $ 08+2L0GL $ ¥9°798°9LL $ 00€LS'IZL ¢ uonessiuIwpy
sasuadxg
00'€9'90€ ¢ 89°0.¢'0LZ $ 00°S5/8°69Z $ or'eza'lle $ 00°05¥'9FE $ anuaAay ejol
000062 $ 661519 $ 00006'6 $ 628/2'8 ¢ 00000c8 $ unog [edpiunpy
00'€9G'€62 $ 69'8LEPOZ ¢ 00°GLE'6ST $ LL'SYS'60€ $ 00°0S¥'€9Z $ uonesIuwpY
SNUIAIY

13oang J1Yd OLSON 9 13onang TYNLOY 139and

£00Z 2002 zo00Z 1002 L00Z

anNnd TvY3NIO :aNn4d

£002-Z00Z Jea A |eosid ayj Joj ‘sexa ] ‘Jeaysing jo A9 ay) Joj jabpng |essuss |eulbLQ oy L



00°00.'9 $ 00¢€28'C ¢ 00009 $ 05'906'c $ 000g€'8 $ aouelnsu|
00°000'81 $ G/196'S $ 0000072C1 $ 00'900'8 $ 000002 $ so94 [ebe
- ﬁ - w o.v..vN_‘.m w - w ” m ULy m®>o_QEm
00°006°Z $ e6zeTr'Y ¢ 000022 $ 06°006'0 $ 000.9'c $ 8oueInsu| 847 g yyesH eakojdw3
= & - $ - $ - $ (00'vee) $  (%0) 1deq yueys-xel jloiAed - uoneooly
(00°082) $ (Lo'zee) ¢ (00°052) $ (£9'189) $ LB $  (%G1) @sudieyug-xel [[0iAed - UOHEIO|Y
(00092) $ (g8°0L1L) ¢ (00°052) $ (g8eyl) $ (00'8tY) $  (%S) HNnoD uNN-xe] ||0JAed - UOHEOO|Y
00°00Z°S $ svilec $ 00000 $ v5L/8°C $ 006LY'Y $ soxe] ||0JAed
% $ " $ - $ - $ (00026°2) $ (%0 saleles ydaQ Juaus - uoneoo)y
(00°05.'6) $ (6¥'9.8'V) $ (0z'ele's) $ (98'299'2) $ ¥ $  (%S1) seueleS asudiaul - uoneso|y
(00'052'E) $ (eg'gsh't) ¢ (o¥'vzl'e) $ (62'¥55°2) ¢ (00°0¥8'G) $ (%9 Saleles UNoY IUNj - UOHEDO|Y
00'000°S9 $ 059/1'62 $ 0088¥29 $ 9/'680°LS $ 0000¥'8S $ soleles
Sosuadxg
00'£95°'€6Z  § 69°'8LE¥0Z $ oo'sie'ese $ LL'svs'e0e  $ o000Sp'E9T  § aNUBA3Y |ejoL
00°009 $ soa4 ublig
00°00S $ 0809 $ 0000S $ olise $ 0000s $ anuaAay JBYI0
00°000'% $ 18'899'C $ 00°000'% $ €9VIY'Y $ 00°000'S $ | @ Ajeusd - saxe | Apadoid
(oo090'ZL) $ SoXe} Pajds||0D-UON
00°000'% $ 0£69¢e'ry $ 00000'% $ €£09v'6 $ o00000'0Fr $ JuanbuiaQ - saxe | Auadoid
00'062'06L $ BS6¥EELL $ 00000ZLL $ o9egee'vel $ 00°000°G6 $ juaun) - saxe ] Auadoid
00'S. $ 00S¥ $ oosL $ 006G $ oosL $ saa4 bul4 syepipued
: $ 00°00S'l § = $ - B = $ $e0IAIeS 10} sebiey)
00'8¥S'E $ GlLo0g£L'Z $ 00000 $ 99'chy'y $ 000052 $ [Ejusy Jejua) Ayunwiwo)
00°000'8 $ 00058'C $ 000009 $ 0000¥V $ 000059 $ S99 [BJUaY 20O
00°000'81 $ 29'6/8'2L $ 000088l $ 1E0L6'VE $ 0000022 $ pauwled jsaselu|
00°000°} $ 196/¢ $ < $ " $ a $ Xe | juug paxiN
00°000°09 $ v.992'Lle $ 0000025 $ oL0z¥'L9 $ 00'000'6¥ $ Xe| 9sn pue sajes
00'051 $ 09/8 $ 00001 $ 0548 $ 006.2 $ (4onbr) syuLad ' 8suadI
00'000'8 $ oviee'y $ 000059 $ 96°/29'8 $ 0000S‘c $ $994 Jwlad Buipjing
00°000°Z $ 88'¥6e'e $ 000002 $ 602989 $ 00009's $ 994 8siyouel4 suoyds|aL
00°000°'0% $ ezerl'le $ 000009¢ $ 2eol9'se $ 00005'ce $ 994 9sIyouelq 4%1H
" $ o00'Gl¥'e $ - $ gle8v'L $ - $ S9|eS J9SSY WOl anusAdy
ELVELEDS|

139ang 31vd OL SO 9 139ang TVNLOV 139ang

£00Z z00Z Z00Z L00Z LooZ

NOILVYLSININGY -1d3d

€002-2002 Jed A [eIS1d 9y} 40} ‘sexa] ‘desys|ng jo A1) ayj Jo 1abpng |essuas jeulbiiQ ayL



00°509°'88 $ Z1'GE9'vElL $ o0zZosz'e0L $ l¥229C6L $ 00°/¢6°L¥L  $ (18apun) J8A0 aNUBASY SS9IX]
00'856'V0Z $ 16289'69 ¢ ogvzl'oslk $ +9298'9LL $ o00€LSLZL  $ alnjipuadx3 jejo)
00°'88.'%v $ - $ - $ - $ - $ Aousbunuo)
000002 $ 000Vl ) = $ = $ - $ JOjeJISIUIWPY JUSLLIS2I0IUT SIUBUIPIO
00°000'02 $ £6'850'0 $ 00000°€) $ - $ e $ Buuueld AuD

- $ g $ - $ - $ 00000'S $ sjed O wwo) - Aepno exded
00'000'€ $ 00005t ¢ 00°000'G $ 00°000°C $ 00°000'€ $ Jied Hews - AepnQ [exde)

- $ & $ - $ - $ 0000S'2 $ Aepno [ende)d
00°000'2 $ 8¥¥ee'e $ 000002 $ 000S $ 000002 $ sal|ddng @ Jieday Juswdinbg
00°00S'L $ viole $ 0005 $ 98'86¢ $ 000s¢E $ Bunuugd
00'052 $ er¢e2l $ 00052 $ 00002 $ 000sZ $ abejsod

- $ - $ . $ o $ (00°08) $ JdaQ syueys - salddng HO - uoledo|Y
00'002'2 $ TLBLL $ 00008} $ 02'82Z'C $ 00008 $ so||ddng 80140
00'002 $ ocer $ 00002t $ sl'eze $ 000S2 $ $80UB|0pPUOD B Spiemy
(oo'ovz't) $ (16'6.9) ¢ (oo'ove't) $ (51'801°)) $ (00°002'L) $ (%02) 1deq syuays - suoyds|a - uoled0||y
(oo'0LE) $ (66'v¥L) $ (oooLe) $ ($0'222) $ (00°002'L) $ (%S unod unp - suoyds|s - UoHEIO|Y
00'002'9 ¢ 68668'C $ 000029 $ elovs's $ 00000'9 $ auoydsje L
(00'00Z'1) $ (Ze1sh) $ (00°005'}) $ (¥8°06%'1) $ (00052 $ (%01) 1daq syuays - seninn - uoleo|y
(00'00Z'1) $ (Ze1sy) $ (00°005'}) $ (¥8'06%°)) $ (00052 $  (%01) HUNOD IUNIA - SBIYIHN - UCKEDO||Y
00°000'2} $ LLels'y $ 00000'GL $ 8¢£'806'tvL $ 000052 $ SN
(00°000'G) $ (co'6¥E) $ (00°009) $ (L9'¥19) $ (00'00%) $ (%01) 3deq@ suuaus /Y Bpig - uoneoo)y
00°00%'S $ Buiues| Jeeg Apunwwiod / lleH Ano
00°000'05 ¢ g8z o06¥'E $ 00°000'9 $ elLovl's $ 00°000'v $ aouejulelN @ Jieday Buipiing
00°00¥%'2 $ 0000Z'L $ o00'00¥'C $ 0000¥C $ 0000¥2T $ 10Ae\ - 8oUEBMO||Y Bsuadxy
00°000'} $ 6£062 $ 00000} $ 6529¢ $ 0000S $ sesuadx3 [es|\ B |9ABIL
007000} $ “ $ 00000} $ 000.8°} $ 0000l $ seoIAleS Bupssuibug
007000} $ 00612 $ 00000} $ 0006 $ 0000l $ uoneayue) R 100Y9S
00°006 $ 00112 $ 00006 $ opSLL) $ 00008 $ suopduosqns @ sang
000052 $ so¢e9 $ 00'00S'E $ gg'evs's $ 000002 $ JoQgeT J0esu0)
(00°'0g€) $ (000s¢) $ (00°009) $ (00059) $ (00°00Z'1) $  (%G) 1IN0 N - SBJIAIBS J0Id - UONEJO|Y
00°000°Z $ 00000, $ 0000021 $ 00000°€t $ 000002 $ S90IAJ8S [EUOISS)0.d
00°00S $ oesyl $ 00008 $ 058921 $ 00008 $ S9JMI0N jO uonedlgqnd
00°000°} $ 00000t $ 00000} $ - $ 00000t ¢ 8|quonpa( - 8oueINsy|

- $ a ‘ $ . $ = $ (00°009) $  (%0) 1da@ yusys - soueInsu| - UOHEIO|Y
(00°500°1) $ (9v'ezh) $ (00°500°}) $ (86°G88) $ . $ (%GlL) @osudisjug - soueInsu| - UOHEIO|Y
(00'geg) $ (OLIpL) $ (oo0'see) ¢ (ee'562) $ (00°00Z'1) $ (%S) uNOD IUN - 8dUBINSU| - UOHEIO|IY



000LE $ 66vvl $ o000lE $ v0'L/Z ¢ 00002t ¢ auoydaja] - UIWIPY - UONEJO|Y
00'S¥l $ ooz $ o000¢lL $ 0g.lEl $ 0000l $ aoinleg Buibed
- $ . $ - $ - $ 0000¢ $ so|ddng g Jieday juswdinbg
= $ 2 $ 5 $ ovole $ 4 $ Bunuug
00001 $ - $ 0000l $ " $ 0000l $ abejsod
# g = $ - $ oo'sy $ 0000S $ saiddng so0
. $ - $ . $ - $ - ¢ sjuswAedianp @ spunjay
¥ $ - $ * $ X $ 00008 $ SJauosld Jo pleog
00'0G1 $ 9.0S $ 000Gl $ <So¥zZlL $ - $ sasuadx3 [ea|\ B [9AB. L
R B = $ 0000l $ c60F $ 0000 $ uoneaLILaD B [00Y9S
- $ - $ 000L $ 000¢€ $ 000.L $ uonduasgng g seng
00°05¢ $ o000s€ $ 00009 $ 00059 $¢ 00002t $ SB0IAIBS "J0Id - UIIPY - UOIEIO||Y
000S.C $ v9€l6 $ 00062 $ o0072Ces'c $ 00000%2 $ $90IAI8S J0BHUOD
- $ ” $ = $ - $ = $ 994 sJounr
00°GEE ¢ 9l'Lvl $ o0o0gee $ ee662 $ 00002t $ 80UBINSU| - UILWIPY - UOHEDO||Y
00002k $ zZelsh ¢ 00005t $ 8£06¥1L $ 000SL $ SaIHNN - UIWPY - UOIEDO||Y
. $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 994 s,ebpnr ajewa)y
00008°k $ 00006 $ 00008t ¢ o000s8C $ 000009 $§ 894 s,@bpnr
- $ - $§ - $ - $ - $ sieuag ashojdwiz
00092 $ G880l $ 00082 ¢ 88'ehl $ o008y $ Saxe| ||0JAed - UILUPY - UOKEJO||Y
- $ - $ - $ - $ - $ soxe] ||0JAed
000s2'c  $ €8'8S¥'L $ ovvZL'e ¢ 6Z¥SST $ ooov8's $ SalE[ES - UILPY - UONEDO||Y
- $ - $ - $ - $ - $ saleles
INUSASY
000062k $ 66°L5L'9 $ 000066 $ 62°8.28 $ 00000c8 $ anuaAay |ejo
(oo'0os8) ¢ (¥6'62P) $ (0000L'L) ¢ (Z18eg’t) ¢ (oo000°ZL) $ a]els 0} 8bejusolied :ssa
000S.T § LE€e6eT'l $ - $ - $ - $ anuaAay JaYI0
007000t $ 2Z9'882'G $ 00000°LL $ 9¥9l9'6 $ 00000001 $ sa94 "dsiq JoQ ® seuld
ENVEL

139ang 3J1VvAOLSOWS L13oand IVNLOV 139sang

€002 2002 z00Z 1002 L00Z

1IN0 TVYdIDINNN -1d3d

€002-2002 19\ |easld ay) 1o} ‘aeaysind jo A1 ay) Jo Jobpng |essus9 [eulbLQ ayL



000S2'CT $ ¥S'86¥'L ¢ (oveLe’L) ¢ (LL'e0Z's) $§ 00269°0F $ Jopu) I9A U9ATY SS83X3

00'059°'0} $ &¥'€S9Y $ oveLZ'll $ obi8P'LL $ 00°80EZy $ aInIpuadxg [EJoL

- $ - $ - $ - $ z $ Kepno nded



00°0¥#'2 $ Z£08s'L ¢ ooobe's $ 1999 $ 00FLL9 § sasuadx3 |ejoy
- $ - $ - $ 29/6 $ 0008 $ $9)|ddng "JO - UILPY - UOHEDO|Y
00°000'G $ co6¥e $ 00009 $ 197lS $ 0000¥ $ e/ eday - ulpy - UoHedo||Y
00°0¥2'L $ 16'6.S $ ooo¥z't ¢ 8029 $ oooo0Zt $ auoydaja] - UlWPY - UCHEDO|Y
00002'L $ zelsy $ o00005'tT $ ¥806¥L $ 000SL $ SN - UlWPY - UOEDO|IY
- $ - $ - $ o169l $ 00009 ¢ 9OUBINSU| UILUPY - UOHEDO|Y
2 $ < $ H $ S0l $¢ oovez $ Xe] ||0iAed uipy - Uoiedo|y
. $ - $ - $ <SLe9e’t ¢ ooo0ze'T $ SSLEeS UIWLPpY - UOHEDO||Y
Sosuadxg

139ang 31VAOLSOWS 139and TVNLOV 139ang

£00Z z002 zooz Lo0zZ 1002

"1dvd3aa S.d41-3Hs 1d3a

€002-200Z 49 A |BISIH 93} 40} ‘sexa] ‘aeays|nd jo A3 ayj jo 39bpng |etauan jeulbLQ ayl



00'00Z'0.2 $§ 10°899°62 $ o006G.6%. $ sboiZ'ez $ 00552221 $ sesuedx3 |ejo )
00009t $ 0000€ $ 2 $ y $ g $ sea soueuIpIO ubig
000002 $ = $¢ 000006 $ - $ m $ s994 Buuesuibul
. $ - $ g $ 2 $ oo0'so0'le $ Aousbunuo) yebpng
5 $ - g - $ ¥87229 $ 00005 $ BuineH asnjoy
. $ - $ 2 $ 2 $ o00g6S'/L $ Aepno [exde)
00°000'00Z $§ 88'¥.9'6 $ 00050'9c $ 8l'€0L $ o000000v $ Jleday 19918
- $ - g = $ = $ 00012 $ aoinieg Buibeq
000005l $ oOlL'90¥ $ 000001 $ - $ 00005t $ Moy
00'008'8 $ Ge'80¥'E $ 000000 $ 00SKO'L $ 0000F $ sal|ddng /juswdinb3 / J030B.1 1
00'008°c $ ¥L2L8L $ o0008c $ 15099't $ 00008t $ sdwe 1e8is
00'000'vL $ 0000L9 $ 000007, $ 000009 $ 00000+ $ 8JIAISS J0BIUOD
000000} $ L£1¥SC $ o0000Z¥ $ 81222t $ o0000ZF $ JogeT J0e5uo)
00000k $ Ll'lev $ o00'seL $ 1G.i¥. $ 00'S¥9 $ soxe] ||oihed
000002k $ 00866V $ o000Z6 $ 026026 $ o0000¥V'S $ sobep AlinoH
Sosuadxg

13oangd 31vdOLSOWS 139dng IWYNLOV 13oang

€002 z00Z zooz L00Z 1002

LINIFNLAFVHIA 13TFHLS 1d3d0

£002-2002 1eaA |easi{ ay) Joj ‘sexa] ‘Jeaysing jo A}9 ayj jo jobpng |esausg jeutbuQ ayL



00000y § 8€£128'l $ oooo0't $ ee6£0Y $ 00000 $ sa||ddng |eseusn
00000'S $ 0059kl $ ooo000s ¢ - $ - $ JouBUBJUIB| B Slleday jue|d
00'000'GL $§ €2T8EV'S $ 000006k $ <969L¥L $ 00000'GL $ lamod 3 ybi ‘lesH
- $ . $ g $ oL6lL¥'8 $ 00000GL $ KousbBupuo) |eyden
00°00%'2 $ 6ev69c $ oooo¥'z ¢ GZ6z9'c $ o0000¥Z $ $994 Jwiad
000058 $ 1AS20'F $¢ 006098 ¢ 986'€88'S $ 0000S5S § ao1A9S neH abpn|s
00°00¢ $ - $ o0000¢ $ - $ 0000¢ $ 991n8S Bulissuibug
00'00L9C2 $ 00'GZL'L) $ ooo00L9c $ - $ - $ 90IAIBS B)SEM PIIOS
000006k $ 00'6SE'L $ 00000GL $ 0G2eS'¥L $ o0000FVLL $ S9JIAIBS [BNJIBJUOD
00001} $ se/6 $ 0000} $ - $ 00001 $ S82[10N JO uoiedlgnd
00600k ¢ ovezy $ 00G00'L ¢ 86'G88 $ - $ 90UEBINSU| WPY - UOHEDO||Y
: $ - $ - § $ 00000 $ safiueyQ |eba
00'08. $ lozee $ 0005, $ €9'185 ¢ - $ soxe] ||0JAed ‘wWpy - Uonedo||y
- $ - $ - § - $ 00'89¢ $ sexel [l0JAed
00056 $ 6V9LEYV $ ocelee $ 98299L § ) $ SSE[ES "WPY - UONEDO||Y
# $ - $ - $ - $ o00008Fv §$ ‘WpY - UONEDO||Y - SeLees
Sosuadxg
00°0L8'26  $ LlL'OSl'o $ 000L5'L0L $ +¥2°€09°99 $ 00°0L¥'99 $ sasuadx3 |ejo L
E $ - $ B $ . $ - $ pund |[eJauss) Wolj Jajsuel]
00052 $ 0000} $ 000S2 $ - $ 00052 $ anuaARY JBYIO
. $ . $ = g i g . $ S9|BS 19SSV WOJ) 3nuaAay
00°002 $ 006Gl $ 00002 $ 006l $ 00002 $ $994 uonoadsul J9JEAN
00'09 $ 006Gl $ 0009 $ o000¢€ $ 0009 $ $994 uoloadsu| James
00°000'} $ 00'S0S $ 00000t $ O00G9F $ o00'00¢ $ soa4 de] g JO1ON JoJeM
00000 $ 00620'} $ 000002 $ 00G20°L $ 00001 $ so994 de] Jamas
00009 $ vvl62 $ - $ - $ 00°00S $ SIUN0IY MON Wol4 ysaa|
0000L82 $ OL'I¥EEL $ o0o0000°ce $ . $ 5 $ uonoaj|0D 8ISeM PIOS
0000069 § €9'158°0¢ $ 0000069 $ ¥.890'G9 $ 0000069 $ sabieyd Jamas/iaiem
ENVELE
139ang JlvdOLSOW9 139ang IVNLOY 13oang
€002 200z z00z 1002 1002

aNN4d 3SIAddy3a1NT 1 1d3d

£002-200¢Z 1edA |easi4 9y} 1o} ‘sexa] ‘ueays|nd jo A9 ay} jo jebpng jessuas) jeulbliQ ay L



(00'z9'L¥L) $ 1¥'8e5'8 $ (0z'229'62) ¢ (2g'1i8'L) $ (00°002'¥S) $ (18pun) 18A0 8NUBASY SS8IXT
oo'sev'ece $ 9L°LL9'lE $ ozleL'ieL $ 9s'siv'y. $ 00°0L9°0ZL § sesuadx3 |ejoL
000002 $ ZGI8Y 5 = g = $ - $ Xe| So|eS
000000y $ lojeiausn) Aouabilawug
0000049 $ SUONUB)XT JBIEM B Jomeg
ooool'eyr $ - ¢ ooooL'er $ - $ - $ 18loid |eyde o) leyded

5 $ - $ - $ o00008'%vL $ 00000°ZL $ Aepno jenden

- $ - $ - $ - ¢ oozve'ey $ uoneaideq
00005’k  $ 25969 $ 0000S $ 89'v.8 $ 0000S $ abeisod
00'00¢ $ - $ 0000¢ $ - $ 0000¢ $ sa||ddng 820



00°000°0LY $§ 00700S°L $ 00°000°GLY $ 06°9Z£°2SL $ 00002021 $ sosuadx3 |ejo]
= $ 3 $ - $ = $ 00000 $ J3uaD) Aunwilio) - Uolionisuo)
- $ 00005} $ 00000 $ o000Z.% $ oo0o000E $ 3ied Hews - uononjsuo)
00009'¢e $ 4 $ o00009'ce $ % $ - $ Jue|d Jamag - salouabunuo)
00'00v'or $ g ¢ oooovor $ - $ - $ JuB|d Jamas - suonoadsul/Buleauibug
00°000'9€€ $ - $ 00000'0e€ $ # $ 4 $ JuB|d Jomaeg - uolon)suo)
- $ - $ - $ 00008'%L $ 00000°ZL $  lIOM S dn-yoeg - suondadsul/Buliesulbul
# $ * $ - $ 09908 $ o00002'ck $ oM 191eM dn-oeg - Aousbunuod
- $ . $ " $ 00000CEL $§ 00000CEL $ 1B Jo1eAM dN-XoBg - UOKONJSUOD
Sosuadxg
00°000°0L¥ $§ 00°00S'} $ 00°000°SLy $ 00°000°€9L $§ 00°000°LLL $ anuaAay [ejoL
- $ m $ - $ - $ 00000'S ¢ 41D AjUNWWOD - pund [EJSUSL) WOL) J)JSUEL |
" $ 00008} $ 00000's $ 00000t $ o00000CE $ }Ied JEWS - pund [EISUSD) WOY Jajsuel ]
00°00L'EY $ " $ ooooleyr $ ) $ - ¢  JUelD Jamas - puld asudisjug woly Jajsuel ]
00°006'99¢ $ - $ 00006'99¢ $ # $ Z $ JUBIS) JOMOS
. $ - $ - $ o00000YL $ o00000ZLF $ [IPM J21eM - pul4 8sldIaiug woly Jajsuel |
& $ 5 $ - $ 000009%L $§ 00000971 $ UEID |3 Jelep dn-oeqd
- $ - $ - $ - $ - $ useQ - suoljeuo( ajeAld
BNUSASY

139an9 3JILVAOLSOW9 L139andg IVNLOV 139ang

£002 zooz z00zZ L00Z L00Z

aNN4d S123rodd Tv.iidvd :aNnd

£002Z-200Z JedA |easi4 9y} 4o} ‘sexa| ‘aeaysing jo Aj19 ayj 40} 396png jesauas) jeulblaQ ayL



ORDINANCE NO. 02-891

AN ORDINANCE PROVIDING FOR THE ASSESSMENT, LEVY, AND
COLLECTION OF AD VALOREM TAXES OF THE CITY OF
FULSHEAR, TEXAS, FOR THE YEAR 2002 AND FOR EACH YEAR
THEREAFTER UNTIL OTHERWISE PROVIDED; PROVIDING THE
DATE ON WHICH SUCH TAXES SHALL BE DUE AND PAYABLE;
PROVIDING FOR PENALTY AND INTEREST ON ALL TAXES NOT
TIMELY PAID; AND REPEALING ALL ORDINANCES AND PARTS OF
ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT HEREWITH.

* * % * %
WHEREAS, pursuant to Section 26.05 of the Texas Property Tax Code, the governing

body of each taxing unit shall adopt a tax rate for the current tax year; and
WHEREAS, all notices and hearings required by law as a prerequisite to the passage,
approval, and adoption of said tax rate ordinance have been timely and properly given and

held; now, therefore,

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF FULSHEAR, TEXAS:

Section 1. The facts and recitations set forth in the preamble of this Ordinance are
found to be true and correct and are hereby adopted, ratified, and confirmed.

Section 2. All property subject to ad valorem taxation by the City of Fulshear,
Texas, shall be equally and uniformly assessed for such purposes at One Hundred Percent
(100%) of the fair market value of such property.

Section 3 There is hereby levied for general purposes and use by the City of
Fulshear, Texas, for the year 2002, and for each year thereafter until otherwise provided, an
ad valorem tax at the rate of Thirty-nine and 251/1000 Cents ($.39251) on each One Hundred
Dollars ($100) of assessed valuation on all property, real, personal, and mixed, within the

corporate limits upon which an ad valorem tax is authorized by law to be levied by the City of

FULSHEAR/ '02 TAX RATE.ORD



Fulshear, Texas. The proceeds from such tax shall be applied to the payment of the general
and current expenses of the government of the City. All such taxes shall be assessed and
collected in current money of the United States of America.

Section 4. All ad valorem taxes levied hereby, as reflected by Section 3 hereof,
shall be due and payable on or before January 31, 2003. All ad valorem taxes due the City of
Fulshear, Texas, and not paid on or before January 31 following the year for which they were
levied shall bear penalty and interest as prescribed in the Property Tax Code of the State of
Texas.

Section 5. All ordinances and parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are, to the
extent of such conflict, hereby repealed.

PASSED, APPROVED, AND ADOPTED this 18th day of September 2002.

o, WWKZW

J. Michael Dinges

Mayor
ATTEST: . ALDERMEN VOTING
JOHN SMART AYE
fazhe, Mooy 2 Sk, g
— , J B COLLINS, JR.. AYE
: Mbﬁ/ !Zu’/é?/ BILL ARCHER AYE
Kathy May/fleld / ROBERT FOX ABSENT

City Secretary

FULSHEAR/ '02 TAX RATE.ORD 2



	ORDINANCE NO. 2002-879_Gen_Elec_May0402
	ORDINANCE NO. 2002-880_Substand_Building&Structures
	ORDINANCE NO. 2002-881_Order_of_Cancelation
	ORDINANCE NO. 2002-882_Prohibit_Sale of Vech_Public_RightofWay
	ORDINANCE NO. 2002-883_Abandoning_RightofWay
	ORDINANCE NO. 2002-884_Manufactured_Homes
	ORDINANCE NO. 2002-885_Sign_Ordinance
	ORDINANCE NO. 2002-886_Petition_of_Foster_Creek
	ORDINANCE NO. 2002-887_International_Building_Code_2000_Non-Residential
	ORDINANCE NO. 2002-888_International_Residential_Buidling_Code
	ORDINANCE NO. 2002-889_Signage_City_Jurisdiction
	ORDINANCE NO. 2002-890_Approving_Adopting_Gen_Budget03
	ORDINANCE NO. 2002-891_Asses_Levy_Collect_Ad_Val_Tax02

